
ISAAC ASIMOV’S SUPER QUIZ
Take this Super Quiz to a Ph.D. 
Score 1 point for each correct 
answer on the Freshman Level, 
2 points on the Graduate Level 
and 3 points on the Ph.D. Level.

Subject: NAPOLEON 
BONAPARTE
(e.g., Napoleon died in 1821 at 
age ____. Answer: 51.)

FRESHMAN LEVEL
1. On what island was Napoleon 
born?
Answer________
2. On what island did he die?
Answer________
3. What was the first name of his 
first wife?
Answer________

GRADUATE LEVEL
4. Napoleon’s first exile was to 
what island?
Answer________
5. After escaping exile he was 
defeated at this battle.
Answer________
6. The triumphant British 
coalition army was led by this 
duke.
Answer________

PH.D. LEVEL
7. What part did Marie Louise of 
Austria play in Napoleon’s life?
Answer________
8. What property did Napoleon 
sell to the U.S. in 1803?
Answer________
9. By defeating the French, this 
country became the only one 
ever established by a slave revolt.
Answer________

ANSWERS: 1. Corsica. 2. St. 
Helena. 3. Josephine. 4. Elba. 5. 
Waterloo. 6. Duke of Wellington. 
7. Napoleon’s second wife. 
8. Louisiana. 9. Haiti (Saint-
Domingue).

SCORING:
18 points — congratulations, 
doctor; 15 to 17 points — honors 
graduate; 10 to 14 points — you’re 
plenty smart, but no grind; 4 to 9 
points — you really should hit the 
books harder; 1 point to 3 points 
— enroll in remedial courses 
immediately; 0 points — who 
reads the questions to you?

Super Quiz is a registered 
trademark of K. Fisher  
Enterprises Ltd.
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