
NOTICE
T h e  m a n u f a c t u r e d
dwelling located at 300
Sequoyah  Dr  NE,  lot
164,  in  Fort  Payne,
HUD  #  HWC061663,
o w n e d  b y  M a n u e l
Domingo, is now aban-
doned and will be sold
by  private  sealed  bid
auction. Inspections of
the dwelling and sealed
bids for it will be accep-
ted  by  Javan  Carter,
865-427-5009,  from
Oct.  1 to Oct.  31.  The
dwel l ing  community
owner  may  bid  on  the
dwelling.  The  winning
b idder  w i l l  be  an-
nounced  at  the  dwell-
ing location noted here
on November 1,  2025,
at  10:00 a.m.
The Times Journal
October 1, 8, 2025


