

EXHIBIT B



950 Main Avenue, Suite 1100 | Cleveland, OH 44113-7213 | TEL 216.592.5000 | FAX 216.592.5009

Mr. Brian Kushner
FTI Consulting, Inc.
2001 Ross Avenue, Suite 650
Dallas, TX 75201

020061-000001
Invoice # 10022138
January 20, 2026

Matter Description: LA Semiconductor LLC Receivership
Case ID:

For Services Through December 31, 2025

IRS No. 20-0073899

TELEPHONE: 216.592.5000

PLEASE REMIT TO:
TUCKER ELLIS LLP
P.O. BOX 74717
CLEVELAND, OH 44194-4717

DIRECT ALL OTHER CORRESPONDENCE TO:
950 MAIN AVENUE
SUITE 1100
CLEVELAND, OH 44113-7213

NET DUE UPON RECEIPT

Fees for Legal Services	\$	97,840.50
Total Fees and Disbursements:	\$	97,840.50

Wire/ACH Payment Instructions:
KeyBank
ABA: 041001039
Account: 359681334702
SWIFT: KEYBUS33

Please detach this page and return with your payment.



020061-000001
 Invoice # 10022138
 January 20, 2026
 Page 2 of 29

Mr. Brian Kushner
 FTI Consulting, Inc.
 2001 Ross Avenue, Suite 650
 Dallas, TX 75201

Matter Number: 020061-000001
LA Semiconductor LLC Receivership

For Services Through December 31, 2025

SERVICES:

Date	Narrative	Hours
12/01/25	Review correspondence and revised bid procedures, APA, and draft Order received from Mr. Campana; preparation of email to Mr. Wojtasik and Ms. Gecht regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	1.00
12/01/25	Preparation of email to Mr. Simmons regarding claims by and against Ward and Brown and assistance with draft Settlement Agreement regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/01/25	Review LAS Receiver website; attention to information to be added to website; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same; review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/01/25	Review correspondence and draft settlement documents received from Mr. Wick. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.70
12/01/25	Conference with Mr. Wojtasik regarding APA and bid procedures. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/01/25	Review email from Ms. Gecht regarding Evergreen's revisions to sale procedure documents. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/01/25	Review multiple correspondence from FTI regarding forensics analysis. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/01/25	Review email summary from Mr. Wojtasik regarding Evergreen revisions to sale procedure documents; review further revisions to same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/01/25	Review and analyze Evergreen's redline to proposed order granting sale procedure motion (.6); make additional edits to proposed order (.2); confer with W. Stavole regarding the same. (.2) <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	1.00
12/01/25	Review and analyze Evergreen's redline to bidding instructions (.3); confer and correspond with W. Stavole and B. Wojtasik regarding the same. (.5) <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.80
12/01/25	Confer and correspond with W. Stavole and B. Wojtasik regarding Evergreen's redline to the asset purchase agreement. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.40



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/01/25	Review correspondence to/from client team regarding Evergreen's redline to bidding instructions, asset purchase agreement, and proposed order. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.40
12/01/25	Review correspondence to/from counsel for onsemi regarding joint status report. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.20
12/01/25	Review and analyze amended stipulated and agreed order appointing receiver with respect to procedures for payments (.2) and confer with W. Stavole regarding the same. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.30
12/01/25	Review draft joint status report prepared by counsel for onsemi. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.20
12/01/25	Revise joint status report (.2) and confer with W. Stavole regarding the same. (.1) <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.30
12/01/25	Review correspondence from counsel for onsemi regarding Evergreen's redline to bidding procedures. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.20
12/01/25	Review correspondence to/from counsel for Evergreen regarding moving for an extension of time for Evergreen to respond to sale procedure motion <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.20
12/01/25	Review multiple correspondence and draft joint status report received from Mr. Wick; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Wick regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/01/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding Evergreen's revisions to bid instructions and APA; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/01/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Wick regarding bid procedures. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/01/25	Preparation of email to Ms. Gecht regarding Joint Status Report; review email from Ms. Gecht regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/01/25	Preparation of multiple correspondence to Mr. Wick regarding Joint Status Report. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/01/25	Attention to multiple revisions to bid procedures; attention to detailed correspondence to Mr. Kushner analyzing same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.70
12/01/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding sale procedures and extension of objection deadline; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/01/25	Review and analysis of Evergreen's proposed revisions to the Asset Purchase Agreement. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.90



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/01/25	Draft a summary of the review and analysis of Evergreen's proposed revisions to the Asset Purchase Agreement. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.60
12/01/25	Correspond and strategy with W. Stavole regarding the review and analysis of the Asset Purchase Agreement. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.30
12/01/25	Review and analysis of Evergreen's proposed revisions to the bidding instructions. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.70
12/01/25	Draft a summary of the review and analysis of Evergreen's proposed revisions to the bidding instructions. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.50
12/01/25	Correspond and strategy with W. Stavole regarding the review and analysis of the bidding instructions. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.30
12/01/25	Update and revise the Asset Purchase Agreement in light of the review and analysis and feedback from W. Stavole. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	1.20
12/01/25	Update and revise the bidding instructions in light of additional review and analysis and feedback from W. Stavole. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.50
12/01/25	Correspond and strategy with W. Stavole regarding the revised Asset Purchase Agreement and Bidding Instructions, and discuss next steps <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.20
12/01/25	Review and analysis of feedback from onsemi's counsel, and correspond and strategy with W. Stavole regarding the same. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.60
12/02/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Capotosto regarding Joint Status Report. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/02/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Wick regarding Joint Status Report. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/02/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding Evergreen's position on sale motion; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/02/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Wick regarding Joint Status Report; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Wick regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/02/25	Attention to emails from and to Ms. Gecht regarding Joint Status Report. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/02/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding Evergreen; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/02/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Wick to Defendants' counsel regarding Joint Status Report. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/02/25	Review email from Mr. Wojtasik regarding issues to consider for sale motion. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/02/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding sale motion. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/02/25	Review additional correspondence from Mr. Wick regarding Joint Status Report; review correspondence from Mr. Niekamp regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/02/25	Review Certificate of no objection regarding Fee Application; conference with Ms. Gecht regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/02/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Kushner and Mr. Wojtasik regarding exhibits to sale procedure motion. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/02/25	Review correspondence and NDA for new potential buyer received from Mr. Jenkins. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/02/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Wick regarding sale procedure motion and its exhibits as well as settlement with Defendants. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	1.00
12/02/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana regarding APA and bid instructions. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/02/25	Conference with Mr. Wojtasik regarding revisions to asset purchase agreement <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/02/25	Review email and revised APA and Bid Instructions received from Mr. Wojtasik. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/02/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding First Joint Fee Application. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/02/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding surcharge issue. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/02/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding Evergreen negotiations. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/02/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Campana regarding Bid Procedures and APA. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.70
12/02/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding negotiations with Mr. Campana regarding Evergreen's issues with APA and Bid Instructions. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/02/25	Review pending fee statements and fee application; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/02/25	Preparation of email to Mr. Wojtasik regarding Evergreen negotiations; review email from Mr. Wojtasik regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/02/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding Evergreen negotiations; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/02/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Kushner and Mr. Jenkins regarding Evergreen negotiations. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.80
12/02/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding Evergreen. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/02/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding Evergreen revisions to sale procedures and APA. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/02/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding call to discuss sale procedure motion. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/02/25	Review multiple emails from and to Ms. Gecht regarding Joint Fee Application and proposed Order granting same; review email from Mr. Fawkes regarding same; review proposed Order. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/02/25	Conference with Ms. Gecht regarding Joint Fee Application. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/02/25	Conference with Mr. Wojtasik regarding NDA for new potential buyer. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/02/25	Draft certificate of no objection to first joint fee application. (1.2) and confer with W. Stavole regarding the same. (.2) <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	1.40
12/02/25	Draft proposed order granting first joint fee application and review and revise the same (1.5); and confer with T. Fawkes and W. Stavole regarding the same. (.3) <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	1.80
12/02/25	Attention to filing certificate of no objection to first joint fee application and proposed order approving first joint fee application. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.40
12/02/25	Correspond with W. Stavole and counsel for onsemi regarding joint status report. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.20
12/02/25	Confer with W. Stavole and B. Wojtasik regarding Evergreen's redline to sale documents and updated deal documents. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.50



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/02/25	Review correspondence to/from counsel for Evergreen regarding updated deal documents <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.30
12/02/25	Review correspondence to/from client team regarding Evergreen's redline to sale documents along with discussions with counsel for onsemi regarding the same. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.60
12/02/25	Review and analyze the settlement agreement and documents related to the employment and benefits of Mike Ward and Kayleigh Brown and outline information related to adding employment termination and the release of employment claims into the global settlement agreement. <i>Thomas R. Simmons</i>	0.90
12/02/25	Confer with Bill Stavole regarding additional information needed to revise the settlement agreement. <i>Thomas R. Simmons</i>	0.10
12/02/25	Review, revise and supplement the settlement agreement. <i>Thomas R. Simmons</i>	1.60
12/02/25	Review and provide revisions to FTI/Tucker Ellis fee order; e-mail correspondence with Anna Gecht regarding same. <i>Thomas R. Fawkes</i>	0.50
12/02/25	Review and analysis of the Non-Disclosure Agreement for new potential buyer. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.30
12/02/25	Correspond and strategy with Mr. Jenkins regarding such review and analysis of the Non-Disclosure Agreement. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.30
12/02/25	Correspond and strategy with W. Stavole regarding the revised Asset Purchase Agreement and Bidding Instructions, and discuss next steps <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.40
12/02/25	Update and revise the Asset Purchase Agreement and the bidding instructions in light of further feedback from W. Stavole. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.90
12/03/25	Preparation of correspondence Mr. Wick regarding surcharge issue. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/03/25	Preparation of email to Mr. Wojtasik regarding meeting with Evergreen counsel. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/03/25	Preparation of correspondence with FTI Team regarding Joint Status Report. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/03/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding Evergreen negotiations; preparation of multiple correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/03/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Wick regarding surcharge issue.	



Date	Narrative	Hours
	<i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.20</i>
12/03/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding discussions with Mr. Wick. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.30</i>
12/03/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding Joint Status Report; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.20</i>
12/03/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Kushner regarding Evergreen's revisions to sale documents. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.20</i>
12/03/25	Teams conference with Mr. Campana, Mr. Tuggles, Mr. D'Andrea, and Mr. Wojtasik regarding APA and Bid Procedures. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>1.30</i>
12/03/25	Conference with Mr. Wojtasik regarding APA and Bid Procedures. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.30</i>
12/03/25	Telephone conference with Judge Gwin. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.50</i>
12/03/25	Attention to Macquarie equipment lease; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.30</i>
12/03/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding negotiations with Evergreen's counsel. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.30</i>
12/03/25	Review email and revised settlement agreement received from Mr. Simmons; preparation of email to Mr. Simmons regarding same; review email from Mr. Simmons regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.40</i>
12/03/25	Review correspondence and revised APA and Bid Instructions received from Mr. Campana; preparation of email to Mr. Wojtasik regarding same; preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.80</i>
12/03/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding operational issues; preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding same; review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.50</i>
12/03/25	Preparation of email to Mr. Jenkins regarding settlement agreement; review correspondence from Mr Jenkins regarding same; preparation of email to Mr. Simmons regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.30</i>
12/03/25	Review file regarding other investment banker; review email from Mr. Wojtasik regarding same; preparation of email to Mr. Wojtasik regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.50</i>
12/03/25	Review Amended Receiver Order; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding same; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same; review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.60</i>



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/03/25	Review correspondence regarding status of loan extension. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.10
12/03/25	Review correspondences regarding negotiation of sale documents, extending Evergreen's objection deadline to sale procedure motion, and regarding Evergreen's request for information on operations. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	1.00
12/03/25	Review correspondence with client team regarding fee application <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.20
12/03/25	Revise the settlement agreement and related emails to Bill Stavole. <i>Thomas R. Simmons</i>	0.40
12/03/25	Prepare for and attend a call with W. Stavole, counsel for onsemi, and counsel for Evergreen to discuss the status of the documents and the revisions to Asset Purchase Agreement and the bidding instructions. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	1.40
12/03/25	Correspond and strategy with W. Stavole in follow up to the call and discuss next steps. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.30
12/04/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding sale process; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/04/25	Preparation of email to Ms. Gecht regarding stipulation to extend objection period. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/04/25	Attention to Equipment Schedule for Macquarie Lease. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/04/25	Preparation of email to Mr. Simmons regarding settlement agreement. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/04/25	Review equipment lease information; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/04/25	Teams conference with Mr. Kushner, Mr. Jenkins and Ms. Horton regarding sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.80
12/04/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Jenkins regarding sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/04/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/04/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Campana regarding sale procedures. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/04/25	Conferences with Ms. Gecht regarding Evergreen stipulation. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/04/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding sale process; review multiple correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same; preparation of multiple correspondence to FTI Team regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.80
12/04/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Wick regarding sale procedures. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.00
12/04/25	Reveiw email and revisions to sale documents received from Mr. Wojtasik. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/04/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding discussions with Evergreen and onsemi; review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding same; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.60
12/04/25	Review analysis from Mr. Jenkins regarding sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/04/25	Review multiple emails and draft stipulation received from Ms. Gecht; revise same; review email and Joint Motion received from Ms. Gecht. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.80
12/04/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding stipulation for extension of time. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/04/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana and to Mr. Wick regarding Joint Motion; review correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding same; review correspondence from Mr. Wick regarding same; preparation of email to Ms. Gecht regarding same; attention to multiple emails from and to Ms. Gecht regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.80
12/04/25	Review correspondence and documents received from Mr. Jenkins regarding operational information; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/04/25	Review multiple correspondence and multiple sets of information received from Mr. Jenkins regarding intellectual property issues; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.90
12/04/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding creditor claim. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/04/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding revisions requested by Evergreen to sale procedure; revisions to same; revise summary regarding same; review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.70
12/04/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding revised exhibits to sale motion; preparation of correspondence to Mr Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/04/25	Attention to confirming filing of Joint Motion; preparation of email to Ms. Gecht regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/04/25	Review correspondences to/from client team regarding negotiation of sale documents. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.80
12/04/25	Review correspondence regarding extending Evergreen's deadline to respond to sale procedure motion. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.40
12/04/25	Review correspondence to/from client team regarding request by Evergreen for information on operations. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.20
12/04/25	Review and analyze court docket. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.30
12/04/25	Review and analyze local rules and case management order. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.40
12/04/25	Draft joint motion for extension of time for Evergreen to respond to sale procedure motion and review and revise the same (1.0); confer with W. Stavole regarding the same (.3) <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	1.30
12/04/25	Arrange for filing of joint motion for extension of time for Evergreen to respond to sale procedure motion. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.30
12/04/25	Confer with W. Stavole and B. Wojtasik regarding negotiations to sale documents. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.30
12/04/25	Review and analysis of Evergreen's further proposed revisions to the Asset Purchase Agreement. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.40
12/04/25	Draft a summary of the review and analysis of Evergreen's proposed revisions to the Asset Purchase Agreement. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.70
12/04/25	Correspond and strategy with W. Stavole regarding the review and analysis of the Asset Purchase Agreement. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.30
12/04/25	Correspond and strategy with Mr. Jenkins regarding the status of the Asset Purchase Agreement and the bidding instructions. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.40
12/04/25	Prepare for the call to discuss the merger transaction, and attend the same with Mr. Jackson, Ms. Crawford, and T. Peppard to discuss next steps for the merger of Tropical Roofing Products into SOPREMA, Inc. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	-0.50
12/05/25	Teams Conference with Mr. Kushner, Mr. Jenkins and Ms. Horton regarding sale process and IP issues. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.90
12/05/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding Macquarie equipment. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/05/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding Macquarie equipment. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/05/25	Conference with Ms. Gecht regarding sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/05/25	Attention to multiple emails to and from Mr. Wojtasik regarding APA and Bid Procedures. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/05/25	Conference with Mr. Wojtasik regarding APA and Bid Procedures. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/05/25	Review and address revisions to APA and Bid Procedures received from Mr. Wojtasik; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.80
12/05/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Campana; preparation of email to Mr. Wojtasik regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/05/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/05/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Wick regarding sale procedure motion and exhibits. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/05/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Wick regarding sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/05/25	Attention to Court's Order granting Joint Motion to extend Evergreen time to respond to sale procedure motion. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/05/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding APA and Bid Procedures; analyze same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/05/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana regarding sale procedure. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/05/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Wick regarding sale procedures. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/05/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Campana regarding sale process negotiations. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.60
12/05/25	Preparation of status report to FTI Team regarding sale process negotiations; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.70
12/05/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding buyer inquiry; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/05/25	Preparation of Certificate of No objection to Eighth Fee Statement; preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/05/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding Evergreen negotiations; preparation of multiple correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/05/25	Confer with W. Stavole and B. Wojtasik regarding negotiation of sale documents. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.50
12/05/25	Review Order granting joint motion for extension of time for Evergreen to respond to sale procedure motion. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.10
12/05/25	Review correspondence to/from client team regarding information requested by Evergreen, loan extension, status of settlement, lease of equipment, and case update. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.70
12/05/25	Review side letter agreement. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.20
12/05/25	Review correspondence with counsel for Evergreen regarding negotiation of sale documents and loan extension agreement. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.50
12/05/25	Update and revise the Asset Purchase Agreement and the bidding instructions in light of further feedback from W. Stavole. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.70
12/05/25	Correspond and strategy with W. Stavole regarding the revised Asset Purchase Agreement, the Bidding Instructions, proposed revisions to the Side Letter, and discuss next steps <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.60
12/06/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding Eighth Fee Statement. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/07/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Wick regarding consent entry. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/07/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding operational issues; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/08/25	Review correspondence and revisions to sale documents received from Mr. Campana. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/08/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Wick regarding sale documents. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/08/25	Preparation of email to Mr. Wojtasik regarding sale documents. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/08/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding sale documents. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/08/25	Finalize Certificate of No Objection; preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/08/25	Review correspondence from Ms. Horton regarding Eighth Fee Statement. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/08/25	Review correspondence from Ms. Horton regarding Tenth Fee Statement. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/08/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Wick regarding sale procedure motion and revisions to same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.70
12/08/25	Multiple conferences with Mr. Wojtasik regarding sale procedure motion and revisions to same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/08/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Campana regarding revised bid procedures and extension of objection deadline. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/08/25	Preparation of email to Ms. Gecht regarding second extension of time for Evergreen to object to sale procedure motion. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/08/25	Conference with Ms. Gecht regarding second extension of time for Evergreen to object to sale procedure motion. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/08/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Wick regarding second extension of time for Evergreen to object to sale procedure motion. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/08/25	Review and comment on second extension of time for Evergreen to object to sale procedure motion; arrange for filing of same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/08/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding revisions to bid procedures. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/08/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding status of negotiations with Evergreen and onsemi. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/08/25	Review email and revised bid instructions received from Mr. Wojtasik; revise same; conference with Mr. Wojtasik regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.80
12/08/25	Review email and revised consent judgment entry received from Ms. Gecht; preparation of email to Ms. Gecht regarding same; review further revisions to same received from Ms. Gecht. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/08/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding second extension of time for Evergreen to object to sale procedure motion. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/08/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana and Mr. Wick regarding second extension of time for Evergreen to object to sale procedure motion; review correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/08/25	Preparation of additional correspondence to Mr. Wick regarding second extension of time for Evergreen to object to sale procedure motion; review correspondence from Mr. Wick regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/08/25	Preparation of email to Ms. Gecht regarding second extension of time for Evergreen to object to sale procedure motion. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/08/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding second extension of time for Evergreen to object to sale procedure motion. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/08/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding revised bid procedures; preparation of email to Mr. Wojtasik regarding same; review email from Mr. Wojtasik regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/08/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Wick regarding revised bid procedures; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding same; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/08/25	Review correspondence to/from counsel regarding negotiation of sale documents and seeking a second extension of time for Evergreen to respond to sale procedure motion <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.40
12/08/25	Confer with W. Stavole and B. Wojtasik regarding negotiation of sale documents and filing stipulated and agreed order granting Receiver's sale procedure motion. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.30
12/08/25	Review correspondence to/from client team regarding negotiation of sale documents and seeking an additional extension of time for Evergreen to respond to the sale procedure motion. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.50
12/08/25	Draft second joint motion for extension of time for Evergreen to respond to sale procedure motion (.4); confer with W. Stavole regarding the same. (.1) <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.50
12/08/25	Review and revise stipulated agreed order on sale procedure motion (.3) confer with W. Stavole regarding the same. (.1) <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.40
12/08/25	Review and analysis of Evergreen's further proposed revisions to the bidding instructions. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.30
12/08/25	Correspond and strategy with W. Stavole regarding the review and analysis of the bidding instructions. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.40



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/08/25	Update and revise the bidding instructions in response to Evergreen's further proposed revisions and feedback from W. Stavole. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.70
12/09/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding revised bid procedures. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/09/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding second extension of time for Evergreen to object to sale procedure motion. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/09/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Wick regarding loan extension; review loan extension; preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/09/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding loan extension; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/09/25	Review correspondence from Ms. Horton regarding fee statement. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/09/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding Receiver Report; preparation of framework for same; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/09/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding loan extension. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/09/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Campana regarding bid instructions and loan extension. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/09/25	Attention to revised bid procedures; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/09/25	Attention to Court's order granting second extension of time for Evergreen to object to sale procedure motion; preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/09/25	Message to Mr. Wick regarding loan extension. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/09/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding loan extension. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/09/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding loan extension. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/09/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Wick regarding loan extension and sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/09/25	Conference with Ms. Gecht regarding consent judgment entry, APA and bid instructions.	



Date	Narrative	Hours
	<i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.50</i>
12/09/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Kushner and Mr. Jenkins regarding loan extension and sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.30</i>
12/09/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding going concern sale process; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.20</i>
12/09/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding side letter agreement. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.10</i>
12/09/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding operational information. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.10</i>
12/09/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Wick regarding going concern sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.10</i>
12/09/25	Confer with W. Stavole regarding mechanics to file stipulated agreed order on sale procedure motion. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	<i>0.50</i>
12/09/25	Review correspondence to/from client team regarding negotiation of loan extension. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	<i>0.30</i>
12/09/25	Review order granting joint motion for extension of time for Evergreen to respond to Receiver's Sale Procedure Motion. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	<i>0.10</i>
12/09/25	Review correspondence with counsel regarding negotiation of sale documents, structure of sale, requests for information, and the consent judgment entry. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	<i>0.70</i>
12/09/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Wick regarding Evergreen loan extension. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.50</i>
12/09/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding loan extension. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.30</i>
12/09/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding Macquarie; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.20</i>
12/09/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding consent entry. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.10</i>
12/09/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana regarding revised bid procedures. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.20</i>
12/09/25	Review Court Order granting extension of time to object; preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.20</i>



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/09/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding negotiations with Evergreen. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/09/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana regarding going concern sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/09/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana and Mr. Wick regarding consent entry. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/10/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding operational issues. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/10/25	Preparation of email to Mr. Wojtasik and Ms. Gecht regarding APA and bidding instructions. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/10/25	Review email from Mr. Wojtasik regarding loan extension. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/10/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Jenkins regarding operational issues. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/10/25	Preparation of email to Ms. Gecht regarding information for the Court; review email from Ms. Gecht regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/10/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding operational issues; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/10/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Campana, Mr. Wick, Mr. D'Andrea, and Ms. Gecht regarding exhibits to consent judgment entry. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	1.50
12/10/25	Conferences with Mr. Wojtasik regarding sale process documents. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/10/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding loan extension; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/10/25	Review email from Ms. Gecht regarding receiver website; preparation of email to Ms. Gecht regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/10/25	Review email analysis from Mr. Wojtasik regarding sale process details. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/10/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Wick regarding APA. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/10/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Wick regarding APA. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/10/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Wick regarding APA and side agreement; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Wick regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/10/25	Review revised APA received from Mr. Wojtasik. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/10/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Capotosto regarding consent entry and APA. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/10/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Capotosto and Mr. Niekamp regarding consent entry. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/10/25	Review and consider multiple correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding APA; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/10/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Wick regarding consent entry. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/10/25	Review multiple correspondence and NDA received from Mr. Jenkins; preparation of email to Mr. Wojtasik; review correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/10/25	Attention to issues raised by filing of consent entry; preparation of multiple emails to Ms. Gecht regarding same; review multiple emails from Ms. Gecht regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/10/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Capotosto regarding consent entry; preparation of multiple correspondence to Mr. Capotosto; review correspondence from Mr. Niekamp; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Niekamp. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.70
12/10/25	Review and consider correspondence from Mr. Wick regarding side agreement. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/10/25	Preparation of multiple correspondence to FTI Team regarding side agreement; review multiple correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding same; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.70
12/10/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana and Mr. Wick regarding side agreement. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.00
12/10/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding Evergreen approval of side agreement. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/10/25	Attention to multiple emails to and from Ms. Gecht regarding final exhibits and Mr. Campana's request to review again. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/10/25	Attention to voicemail message from Mr. Campana regarding exhibits to consent entry; preparation of email to Ms. Gecht regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/10/25	Review redlined versions of APA and bidding instructions to view overall changes from initial filing of same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/10/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding Receiver report. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/10/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding Evergreen report. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/10/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Wick regarding APA. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/10/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Wick regarding APA and side agreement; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Wick and Mr. Campana regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/10/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding APA and bidding instructions. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/10/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding approval of exhibits but waiting for onsemi approval to side agreement; message to Mr. Wick regarding same; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana regarding same; review correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/10/25	Attention to logistics of filing consent entry with final exhibits. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/10/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding consent entry. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/10/25	Call chambers to identify current judicial law clerks. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.20
12/10/25	Review correspondence with client team regarding request for information from Evergreen, issues related to the equipment, and final negotiation of sale documents. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.80
12/10/25	Confer with W. Stavole and B. Wojtasik regarding finalizing sale documents <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.50
12/10/25	Review correspondence with counsel for Evergreen and onsemi regarding negotiation of sale documents, including side letter agreement. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	1.10
12/10/25	Teleconference with counsel for Evergreen and onsemi to negotiate and finalize sale documents and bidding instructions. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.80



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/10/25	Finalize Stipulated and Agreed Order Granting Sales Procedure Motion and exhibits thereto and arrange for filing of the same. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	1.30
12/10/25	Correspond and strategy with W. Stavole regarding the updates to the Asset Purchase Agreement and the bidding instructions, and discuss next steps. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.50
12/10/25	Review and analysis of the revised definition of Transaction Expenses in the Asset Purchase Agreement, and correspond and strategy with W. Stavole regarding the same and next steps. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.60
12/10/25	Update and revise the Asset Purchase Agreement and the bidding instructions in light of the review and analysis and feedback from W. Stavole. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	1.10
12/10/25	Review and analysis of the edits to the Non-Disclosure Agreements by new potential buyer. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.40
12/10/25	Update and revise the revised Non-Disclosure Agreement from new potential buyer. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.50
12/10/25	Prepare a draft email for Mr. Jenkins to transmit the revised Non-Disclosure Agreement to new potential buyer. <i>Brandon A. Wojtasik</i>	0.30
12/11/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding consent judgment entry and exhibits to same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/11/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Jenkins regarding status of sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/11/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding Macquarie; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/11/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding new NDA; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/11/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Jenkins regarding new NDA. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/11/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Jenkins regarding Macquarie. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/11/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Feit regarding APA. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/11/25	Review email from Ms. Gecht regarding Receiver website; preparation of email to Ms. Gecht regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/11/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding process for obtaining entry of Court Order for sale procedure motion; preparation of multiple correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/11/25	Review Ms. Dickinson's Notice of Withdrawal. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/11/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding Macquarie. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/11/25	Telephone conferences with Mr. Feit regarding APA and Macquarie's commission. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.70
12/11/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/11/25	Draft letter to Judge Lioi's law clerks requesting the entry of the consent judgment and an order approving the fee application. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.80
12/11/25	Review correspondence to/from clients regarding final sale documents, consent judgment entry, and commission to Macquarie. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.20
12/11/25	Review notice of withdrawal filed by E. Dickinson on behalf of Linear ASICs. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.10
12/11/25	Review published notice to confirm obligations regarding uploading court filings to Receiver website (.1) and confer with W. Stavole regarding the same. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.10
12/12/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI team regarding Joint Fee Statement. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/12/25	Revise correspondence to Court's Deputy Clerk. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/12/25	Review correspondence from Ms. Horton regarding fee application; preparation of correspondence to Ms. Horton regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/12/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Kushner and Mr. Jenkins regarding sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/12/25	Review message from Mr. Atchley; research same; telephone conference with Mr. Atchley; preparation of memorandum to file regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	1.10
12/12/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding Macquarie. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/12/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding Macquarie's position on sale process; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/12/25	Review correspondence from Evergreen received from Mr. Kushner; review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/12/25	Attention to docket for Court of Appeals. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/12/25	Preparation of Certificate of No Objection to Ninth Fee Statement. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/12/25	Review correspondence to Judge Lioi's law clerks requesting the entry of the consent judgment and an order approving the fee application <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.10
12/14/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding forensic analysis. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/15/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding Certificate of no objections to ninth fee statement; attention to filing Certificate; review correspondence from Ms. Horton. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/15/25	Review tenth joint fee statement; preparation of correspondence to Ms. Horton regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.60
12/15/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Shields regarding forensic evaluation. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/15/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/15/25	Review Order from Court approving Joint Fee Application; preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/15/25	Review Order from Court approving sale procedure stipulated entry; preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/15/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding sale process; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same; review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/15/25	Review order granting first joint fee application of the Receiver and Tucker Ellis (.1); review Stipulated and Agreed Order entered by the Court. (.1); review correspondence to/from client team regarding the same and next steps in the bidding process. (.2) <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.40
12/16/25	Finalize and file Joint Fee Statement.	



Date	Narrative	Hours
	<i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.30</i>
12/16/25	Attention to outstanding fee statements and fee application; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same; attention to docketing future fee applications. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.40</i>
12/16/25	Preparation of correspondence to Ms. Horton regarding Fee Statement; review correspondence from Ms. Horton regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.20</i>
12/16/25	Review correspondence from Ms. Horton regarding joint fee statement. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.10</i>
12/16/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding receiver report. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.10</i>
12/16/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding sale notice. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.10</i>
12/16/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding operational issues; analyze same; review Order Appointing Receiver; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>1.40</i>
12/16/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding sale process; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.30</i>
12/16/25	Review proof of published notice of receivership sale. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	<i>0.10</i>
12/17/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding sale process; review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.20</i>
12/17/25	Teams conference with Mr. Jenkins regarding sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.90</i>
12/17/25	Review Receiver Report; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding same; review correspondence from Ms. Horton regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.70</i>
12/17/25	Review correspondence and settlement documents received from Mr. Capotosto. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.40</i>
12/17/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding Receiver Report; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.20</i>
12/17/25	Attention to strategy for defending against Weinheimer claim. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	<i>0.20</i>



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/17/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Campana. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/17/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Jenkins and Mr. Kushner regarding sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/17/25	Telephone conference with Mr Jenkins regarding sealed bid deadline. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/17/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Kushner and Mr. Jenkins regarding the sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/17/25	Review correspondence from J. Campana requesting additional documents and/or information. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.10
12/18/25	Analyze issues for sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/18/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Campana regarding sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/18/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Kushner and Mr. Jenkins regarding extension of sealed bid deadline. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/18/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Wick regarding sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/18/25	Preparation of email to Ms. Gecht regarding sale process and potential Notice of same; attention to email from Ms. Gecht; conference with Ms. Gecht regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/18/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Wick to Mr. Capotosto. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/18/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana; review correspondence from Mr. Campana. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/18/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding extension of sealed bid deadline; review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding same; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/18/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding operational issues; review multiple correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/18/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding Evergreen's position on extension of sealed bid deadline; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/18/25	Review draft Notice of extension of Sealed Bid deadline received from Ms. Gecht; revise same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/18/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding Receiver report; review Receiver report. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/18/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding Notice to Extend Sealed Bid Deadline; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same; review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/18/25	Confer with W. Stavole regarding FTI's decision to extend the sealed bid deadline (.1); draft notice regarding the same (.8); and review correspondence with client team regarding the same and extending the loan. (.3) <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	1.20
12/18/25	Review correspondence from J. Campana requesting additional documents and/or information. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.10
12/19/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Campana. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/19/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding receiver report. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/20/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana regarding loan extension and bid deadline. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/20/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Kushner and Mr. Jenkins regarding receiver report. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/20/25	Review multiple correspondence and revised receiver report received from Mr. Kushner; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/20/25	Review correspondence regarding extended sealed bid deadline and negotiation of loan extension. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.10
12/22/25	Review final Receiver Report; attention to filing same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/22/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding sale process and issues raised by Macquarie; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/22/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding receiver report; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/22/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding operational issues; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/23/25	Preparation for and telephone conference with Mr. Kushner and Mr. Jenkins regarding sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	1.10



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/23/25	Review correspondence and proposed Loan Extension received from Mr. Campana; preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/23/25	Review Remarketing Agreement, Application to Retain same, and Order approving same; preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.70
12/23/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Jenkins and Mr. Kushner regarding sale process. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/23/25	Review correspondence with client team regarding proposed loan extension. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.10
12/24/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding sale process; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/24/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI team regarding sale process; review multiple correspondence from Mr. Jenkins and Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	1.10
12/28/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Wick regarding Loan Extension. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/28/25	Revise Loan Extension Agreement; preparation of correspondence to FTI Team. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.70
12/28/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Wick regarding Loan Extension. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/28/25	Review correspondence and revisions to Loan Extension received from Mr. Wick. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/28/25	Review correspondence regarding proposed loan extension. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.10
12/29/25	Revise correspondence to FTI Team regarding loan extension; review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding same; review original loan documentation. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.70
12/29/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding loan extension; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/29/25	Telephone conference with Mr. Wick regarding loan extension. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/29/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding loan extension. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10



Date	Narrative	Hours
12/29/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding sale process and potential interested buyers. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/29/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding Evergreen's approval of draft loan extension agreement. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/29/25	Review multiple correspondence from Mr. Wick regarding loan extension agreement. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/29/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding loan extension; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/29/25	Review correspondence and revised loan extension agreement received from Mr. Wick; preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding same; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/29/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana and Mr. Wick regarding loan extension. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/29/25	Review correspondence regarding negotiation of loan extension agreement. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.10
12/30/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Campana regarding loan extension. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/30/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding loan extension; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/30/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Wick regarding loan extension. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/30/25	Preparation of correspondence to FTI Team regarding loan extension; review correspondence from Mr. Jenkins regarding same; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Jenkins regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.50
12/30/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding loan extension agreement; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding same; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/30/25	Review correspondence and revised loan extension agreement received from Mr. Campana; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Wick regarding same; review correspondence from Mr. Wick regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.40
12/30/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana regarding loan extension. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/30/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding loan extension. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10



020061-000001
 Invoice # 10022138
 January 20, 2026
 Page 29 of 29

Date	Narrative	Hours
12/30/25	Review correspondence and execution copy of loan extension received from Mr. Campana; preparation of email to Ms. Gecht regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.30
12/30/25	Review correspondence from Mr. Wick confirming onsemi's approval of loan extension agreement. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/30/25	Review correspondence and loan extension agreement executed by Evergreen received from Mr. Campana. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/30/25	Preparation of correspondence to Mr. Kushner regarding execution copy of loan extension agreement; review correspondence from Mr. Kushner regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/30/25	Review executed copy of loan extension received from Mr. Kushner; preparation of correspondence to Mr. Campana regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.20
12/30/25	Review correspondence regarding negotiation of loan extension agreement. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.20
12/31/25	Review email from Ms. Gecht regarding exhibits to loan extension; preparation of email to Ms. Gecht regarding same. <i>William J. Stavole</i>	0.10
12/31/25	Review and analyze exhibit to loan extension to confirm accuracy of legal description of subject property. <i>Anna L. Gecht</i>	0.20
Fees for legal services		\$97,840.50

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY:

	Hours	Rate	Amount
Thomas R. Fawkes	0.50	775.00	\$387.50
Thomas R. Simmons	3.00	770.00	\$2,310.00
William J. Stavole	96.20	770.00	\$74,074.00
Anna L. Gecht	28.90	450.00	\$13,005.00
Brandon A. Wojtasik	16.80	480.00	\$8,064.00
Total Fees	145.40		\$97,840.50

TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS: \$97,840.50

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE: \$97,840.50