
NOTICE OF 

STORAGE SALE

The contents of the following 
storage units from the U-Haul Mov-
ing & Storage At Hwy 280, 2520 
Como Ave, St. Paul, MN, 55108, 
will be sold to the public online only 
at storagetreasures.com. Bidding 
will begin on 6/17/24 at 7 pm.

Unit number 1996 
leased by J J
Miscellaneous household and 
personal goods
Amount Due: $399.80

Unit number 1192 
leased by Eric Maciver  
Miscellaneous household and 
personal goods
Amount Due: $574.85

Unit number 1136 
leased by Gary Olson
Miscellaneous household and 
personal goods
Amount Due: $583.60

Unit number 2167 
leased by Damontay Overs
Miscellaneous household and 
personal goods
Amount Due: $431.60

Unit number 1160 
leased by Vinyet Smith
Miscellaneous household and 
personal goods
Amount Due: $751.30

Unit number 1139 
leased by Ishaq Gandluri  
Miscellaneous household and 
personal goods
Amount Due: $954.75

Unit number 1539 
leased by Weldon Hopson 
Miscellaneous household and 
personal goods
Amount Due: $519.75

Unit number 1431 
leased by Alan Estevez
Miscellaneous household and 
personal goods
Amount Due: $811.60

Unit number 1770 
leased by Miyoshi Bradford
Miscellaneous household and 
personal goods
Amount Due: $749.80

Unit number 1223 
leased by Mckenzie Dungan
Miscellaneous household and 
personal goods
Amount Due: $779.80

Unit number 1013 
leased by Rafel Hernandez 
Miscellaneous household and 
personal goods
Amount Due: $539.80

Unit number 1393 
leased by Kaltun Jama
Miscellaneous household and 
personal goods
Amount Due: $379.55

Unit number 1713-15 
leased by Thomas Jamison 
Miscellaneous household and 
personal goods
Amount Due: $779.80

Unit number 1658 
leased by Abdirahman Maow 
Miscellaneous household and 
personal goods
Amount Due: $519.80

Unit number 1887 
leased by Natilie Butler
Miscellaneous household and 
personal goods
Amount Due: $674.65
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