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PEGGY O’NEILL

For the Independent Record 

Hopefully, you won’t need to 
see Dr. Emily Bubbers before you 
turn 50. That’s the age when the 
American Cancer Society rec-
ommends that men and women 
who are of average risk of getting 
colorectal cancer get screened.

“Montana has one of the na-
tion’s worst screening rates for 
colorectal cancer, ranking 49th 
among states in the U.S.,” said 
Dr. Fred Olson in his 20 Under 40 
nomination letter for Bubbers. 
Olson is serving as St. Peter’s 
Hospital’s interim chief executive 
officer until Wade Johnson fills the 
role on July 31.

“St. Peter’s general surgeon 
and colorectal specialist, Emily 
Bubbers, M.D., is working hard 

to change that,” Olson said in his 
nomination letter.

Bubbers, 35, joined St. Peter’s 
in 2015 and is the only board-
certified colorectal surgeon in 
Montana. You might think that 
sounds overwhelming, but Bub-
bers said she has lots of support.

Bubbers grew up in the Los 
Angeles area and graduated from 
Brown University. She earned her 
medical degree from Rosaline 
Franklin University of Medicine 
and Science, The Chicago Medi-
cal School, and then completed 
her general surgery residency at 
Oregon Health and Science Uni-
versity in Portland, Oregon, and a 
residency in colon and rectal sur-
gery at the University of Southern 
California.

Bubbers’ husband, Matthew 

Klara, had spent summers in 
West Yellowstone while grow-
ing up in central New York and 
worked as a river guide. The 
couple were looking for a way to 
relocate here, so Bubbers reached 
out to the major medical facilities 
in Montana.

“We love Helena,” Bubbers said. 
“It’s so welcoming and the staff is 
wonderful and supportive.”

Bubbers is an advocate for 
colorectal cancer prevention and 
awareness and often serves as 
a spokesperson for fundraising 
and outreach events. She said that 
screening is so important because 
oftentimes colorectal cancer only 
becomes symptomatic at later 
stages. Screening can detect the 
cancer at earlier stages when it’s 
more treatable, she said.

The addition of Bubbers to the 
St. Peter’s medical staff means 
that Helenans, and Montanans in 
general, don’t have to travel out of 
state for colorectal care.

“For Montanans who needed 
specialized surgery following a 
colorectal cancer diagnosis, this 
meant they no longer needed to 
travel to Seattle or Salt Lake City 
to see a specialist,” Olson wrote. 
“Patients could see Dr. Bubbers 
right here is Helena. Word of Dr. 
Bubbers’ services quickly spread 
across the state, and she now 
regularly sees patients from across 
Montana.”

While her work schedule might 
keep her busy, she finds time to 
spend time enjoying the out-
doors with her husband and their 
3-month-old son Everett.

DR. EMILY BUBBERS

THOM BRIDGE, 

THOM.BRIDGE@HELENAIR.COM 

General Surgeon and Colorectal Specialist, St. Peter’s Hospital

CONGRATULATIONS on being
selected to Helena’s 20 UNDER 40:

Emily Bubbers, M.D.
Montana’s only board-certified

colorectal surgeon

M.D.
tified

surgeon

457-4180

Thank you for all the ways you care for

our community.
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At Eaton Turner Jewelry of 
Helena, owner Corey Johnson 
spends his days crafting unique 
and timeless pieces his custom-
ers are proud to wear.

Johnson can still recall being 
13 years old and standing in his 
father’s jewelry store learning 
right alongside him how to craft 
gold and precious stones into 
wearable works of art. Johnson’s 
father, Don Johnson, is a master 
goldsmith who taught jewelry 
design and metalsmithing at the 
State University College of New 
York in Oneonta, New York for 12 
years. His work has been exhibited 
in numerous juried national art 
exhibitions and even has pieces 
featured in collections of the 
Smithsonian.

Johnson shared that he couldn’t 
have asked for a better mentor and 
instructor to learn from than his 
own dad.

Growing up, Johnson admits to 
always being naturally creative. 
This led him to pursue a degree in 
the fine arts with an emphasis on 
graphic design from Montana State 
University in Bozeman. During 
school, Johnson explored design 
work across a variety of media.

“I honestly didn’t think I would 

come back to jewelry,” said John-
son.

But Johnson’s roots kept calling 
him back. After working a stint 
at a Bozeman jewelry store, he 
found himself reliving his child-
hood memories of crafting jewelry 
alongside his dad. Johnson began 
reconsidering what he wanted to 
do with his life.

In 2000, Johnson and his wife, 
Katrina, were lured back to Helena 
after being offered a job at Eaton 
Turner by his dad, who had as-
sumed ownership of the store. 
Not long after working at Eaton 
Turner, Johnson’s custom jew-
elry creations earned him “best 
of show” several years in a row at 
the Montana-Wyoming Jeweler’s 
Association Design Competition.

“After those recognitions for 
metal smithing, I was confident 
I was in the right place doing the 
right thing,” said Johnson.

Johnson went on to become a 
Graduate Gemologist with cer-
tification from the Gemological 
Institute of America to further the 
skills he was able to offer.

In 2013, Don and his wife Deanna 
began transitioning ownership of 
Eaton Turner over to Corey.

For Johnson, the most enjoyable 
part of what he does now is being 
able to be creative every day.

Johnson is dedicated to more 
than just the customers he works 
with, however. The community of 
Helena as a whole also has a spe-
cial place in his heart.

From Intermountain’s annual 
Festival of Trees event and Flor-
ence Crittenton’s Paint the Town 
Pink fundraiser, to the St. Peter’s 
Hospital Foundation Gala, John-
son’s regularly designs and donates 

pieces to be auctioned off to help 
raise money for local organizations.

“We accept the responsibility to 
give back to this wonderful com-
munity that has supported us for 
the last 132 years,” said Johnson.

“He is generous and cares not 
only about his customers, but also 
our community,” said his wife.

The rest of the Eaton Turner 
staff shares a similar sentiment.

“As an employee, he treats you 
like you’re family,” said Daniel 
Bruno, salesman at Eaton Turner 
for the last five years. “He genu-
inely cares about you and what’s 
going on in your life outside of 
work. Not a lot of bosses do that.”

“Nobody can touch what he 
does,” said Bruno. “He has a real 
talent and we’re lucky to have him 
in Helena.”

THOM BRIDGE, THOM.BRIDGE@HELENAIR.COM 

COREY JOHNSON
Owner, Eaton Turner Jewelry

www.eatonturnerjewelry.com

1735 N. Montana Ave.

442-1940

Custom | Repair | Restore

Congratulations
COREY!

Your creativity, community
involvement & passion

for Helena,
makes you one of a kind!
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JESSE CHANEY

jesse.chaney@helenair.com

After Montana Eye Care opened 
his eyes to a career in optometry, 
Marcus Kelley went on to become 
one of the owners of the Helena 
business.

“I was first introduced to 
Montana Eye Care 25 years ago 
as a patient,” said Kelley, 37, who 
started working for the local eye 
care center in 2006 as an optom-
etrist. “My eye doctors growing 
up were Drs. Bill Simons and Bill 
Hasquet, who inspired me to pur-
sue optometry from an early age.”

That has worked out well for 
both Kelley and Montana Eyec-
are, which recently added a new 
building and expanded its frame 
dispensary.

“He has been an instrumen-
tal part of the growth of our eye 
clinic in Helena, allowing us to 
better serve the people of Hel-

ena,” Hasquet wrote in Kelley’s 
nomination for the 20 Under 40 
award.

Born and raised in Helena, Kel-
ley earned his bachelor’s degree 
from Xavier University in Cin-
cinnati, Ohio and his doctorate 
from Southern California Col-
lege of Optometry in Fullerton, 
California.

In addition to seeing patients 
and helping manage 30 employ-
ees at Montana Eye Care, Kelley 
has been a member of the Mon-
tana Optometric Association for 
15 years and has served on the 
State of Montana Board of Op-
tometry since 2013. Gov. Steve 
Bullock recently reappointed him 
to the board for another four-
year term.

“I enjoy serving all Montanans 
on this board, which oversees the 
practice of optometry in Montana 
to ensure that all patients receive 

quality optometric care,” he said.
Kelley and his wife serve as 

volunteer mentors through the 
Big Brothers Big Sisters of Hel-
ena program, and they support 
nonprofit organizations such as 
the Grandstreet Theatre, Holter 
Museum of Art, Glacier National 
Park Conservancy, Montana 
Conservation Corps, Prickly Pear 
Land Trust and Intermountain.

And he has passed on his values 
to the next generation as a coach 
for his son’s YMCA soccer and 
basketball teams for the last few 
years.

“I enjoy working with youth 
as they build confidence, de-
velop skills and learn teamwork 
through sports,” he said.

In his off-time, Kelley enjoys 
traveling and spending time with 

his wife and two children, ages 8 
and 5.

“He is thoughtful in his discus-
sions, respecting the opinions of 
others and taking time to analyze 
the topics in order to ensure thor-
ough discussion,” Hasquet wrote. 
“I truly do feel that he is a great 
asset to this community and will 
continue to be a leader for years 
to come.”

THOM BRIDGE,THOM.BRIDGE@HELENAIR.COM 

MARCUS 
KELLEY
Optometrist and Partner, 

Montana Eye Care

Big Brothers Big Sisters
of Helena

A “Big” Congratulations to
Marcus and Lisa Kelley
and Melissa Lewis

MontanaEyeCare
Caring For Your Eyes

550 North Montana Avenue, Helena, MT 59601

Office 443-2121 • Fax 443-4163

Email: frontcare@mteyecare.com • Website: www.mteyecare.com

Congratulations
Dr. Marcus Kelley

from the Team at Montana Eyecare
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With a passion for serving the 
community on her own time, 
Lisa Kelley decided to work at a 
company that was just as dedi-
cated to giving back.

As an attorney at Blue Cross 
and Blue Shield of Montana, Kel-
ley, 36, spends her free time vol-
unteering with leadership orga-
nizations and for environmental 
preservation. Her employer gives 
$750,000 a year to nonprofit or-
ganizations, and employees con-
tribute more than 7,000 hours of 
community service.

“My kids (ages 8 and 5) inspire 
me because they remind me that 
it’s our responsibility to make 

a difference in the world for all 
kids,” Kelley said. “We can all act 
and make a difference for future 
generations.”

At BCBS, Kelley focuses on le-
gal advice related to health care 
provider networks and state leg-
islative and regulatory issues.

Mary Belcher, Kelley’s super-
visor, said she is exceptionally 
smart and personable.

“She’s an all around great em-
ployee,” Belcher said. “She has a 
winning personality.”

Kelley was part of the Helena 
Area Chamber of Commerce’s 
Leadership Helena class of 2017, 
where she connected with other 
local businesses in the commu-
nity and worked on leadership 

development, networking and 
community involvement.

She grew up hiking in Glacier 
National Park and avidly sup-
ports the Glacier National Park 
Conservancy. Kelley sits on the 
board of the Montana Conser-
vation Corp, which encourages 
young people to get involved 
with the community and out-
doors.

“Living in Montana, we have 
access to incredible outdoor 
recreational activities,” she said. 
“Everyone can make a difference 
in protecting and preserving our 
land and resources.”

She and her husband, Marcus, 
have been mentors with the Big 
Brothers Big Sisters organization 

for four years. They also support 
the Grandstreet Theatre, Holter 
Museum of Art and the Myrna 
Loy Center.

Before taking a position at 
BCBS in 2010, Kelley practiced 
law at Hughes, Kellner, Sullivan 

and Alke and was a law clerk for 
Montana Supreme Court Justice 
Jim Rice. She received a degree 
in business administration from 
Washington State University and 
went to Law School at Gonzaga 
University.

THOM BRIDGE, THOM.BRIDGE@HELENAIR.COM 

LISA KELLEY
Associate General Counsel, Blue Cross and Blue Shield of Montana

LISA
kelley

assistant general counsel

ALL OF US AT

BLUE CROSS AND BLUE

SHIELD OF MONTANA

CONGRATULATE LISA

FOR THIS WELL-DESERVED
RECOGNITION OF HER
ACHIEVEMENTS AND HER
COMMITMENT TO HER
COLLEAGUES, OUR MEMBERS,
AND OUR COMMUNITY.

BCBSMT.COM | 800-447-7828

A Division of Health Care Service Corporation, a Mutual Legal Reserve Company, an Independent Licensee
of the Blue Cross and Blue Shield Association
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The Rev. Christopher Lebsock 
says he is naturally an introvert.

Yet for those who nominated 
him for the 20 Under 40 award, 
it is his ability to relate to people, 
to help and guide them spiritually 
that makes him stand out.

“His passion and joy for the 
Catholic faith – it’s contagious,” 
said John Barnes, one of the 
nominators. “You can see it in his 
words and actions and people are 
drawn to him. And he is drawn to 
people.”

Lebsock, 36, is a Billings native 
and the oldest of five brothers. 
As he attended college and then 
medical school, he felt the over-
whelming call to priesthood, and 
walked away from medical school 
to enroll in the seminary.

“It was so peaceful,” he told the 
Billings Gazette in 2015. “There 
was no questioning the call.”

Lebsock has spent the last two 
summers as a chaplain at Leg-
endary Lodge on Salmon Lake. 
He also spent a year in Rome 
studying moral theology, return-
ing to Montana and beginning his 
work as a priest in the Diocese of 

Helena.
Lebsock describes the expe-

rience in Rome as “wonderful.” 
He taught theology, engaged in 
his own studies, and lived with 
a group of men who became 
friends, and also accountable to 
each other in a common life of 
prayer.

“Then I came back to Helena 
and people always ask me if I miss 
Rome,” he said. “Ever since I left 
Montana I’ve wanted to be back. 
Every day in Montana is the best.”

Lebsock enjoys Montanans as 
well and the community of people 
within the Cathedral of St. Hel-
ena.

“I love seeing people who are 
trying to know the truth and 
follow it,” he said. “I love seeing 
people live excellently – not nec-
essarily a happy life all the time – 
but trying to do the best to follow 
God and love him. That’s beauti-
ful to me.”

The people of Helena’s Catholic 
community and beyond appreci-
ate him too.

“He never counts the cost but 
instead asks first how he can help 
those in need,” said Matt Brower, 
executive director of the Mon-

tana Catholic Conference. “He is 
a wonderful example to many of 
how meaning in life is discovered 
and more fully realized through 
serving others.”

When asked his biggest chal-
lenge as a priest, Lebsock finds 

balancing the fun and importance 
of meeting with people with his 
natural introversion, and the in-
terior work he needs to do by tak-
ing time for prayer. It’s a “won-
derful problem to have” he added.

“I just praise God that I get to be 

in Helena in the greatest state and 
greatest country in the world,” 
Lebsock said.

Reporter Tom Kuglin can be 
reached at 447-4076  
@IR_TomKuglin

CHRISTOPHER LEBSOCK

THOM BRIDGE, THOM.BRIDGE@HELENAIR.COM 

Assistant Pastor, 

Cathedral of Saint Helena

CONGRATULATIONS

FR.CHRISTOPHER LEBSOCK
FROM THE PARISH FAMILY OF
THE CATHEDRAL OF ST. HELENA

Congratulations
FR. CHRIS LEBSOCK

Thank you for bringing help and encouragement

to those throughout the community.

We are so fortunate to have you in Helena!

FROM THE DIOCESE OF HELENA & MONTANA

CATHOLIC CONFERENCE
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It’s been said that “a good Realtor is not 
a salesperson, but a matchmaker. They in-
troduce people to homes until they fall in 
love with the one.”

For the past 11 years, Mary Ahmann 
Hibbard, real estate agent and broker for 
Windermere Real Estate, has been helping 
plan the happily-ever-afters for countless 
couples and families in the Helena com-
munity.

Real estate is in Ahmann Hibbard’s blood. 
While she has had her real estate license for 
over a decade, she really has been involved 
with the industry for as far back as she can 
remember. Her father, Al Ahmann, owned 
a real-estate firm here in Helena, and Ah-
mann Hibbard grew up spending time at his 
office answering phones, putting together 
relocation packets, and doing other miscel-
laneous tasks. So when she decided to of-
ficially go into the business herself, it came 
naturally. 

“There’s nothing better than helping 
someone realize life goals,” said Ahmann 
Hibbard. “Besides higher education, pur-
chasing a house is one of the biggest invest-
ments people make in their lives.”

As a Realtor, she admits that every day 
is different and she is always meeting new 
people in all types of situations. Ahmann 
Hibbard, being the people person that she 

is, loves the daily interactions with her cli-
ents and meeting new people.

“You will be hard-pressed to find many 
people around Helena that do not know 
Mary personally, or have at least know of 
her,” said Crystal Ahmann, Windermere 
marketing and operations manager. “It’s a 
standing joke that she should be the mayor 
of Helena. And we wouldn’t be surprised if 
that comes to fruition, as she already takes 
on the role of honorary mayor.”

MARY AHMANN 
HIBBARD

THOM BRIDGE, THOM.BRIDGE@HELENAIR.COM

Agent and Broker, 

Windermere Real Estate

Please see AHMANN HIBBARD, Page 12

The HolterMuseumof Art
would like to congratulate board member

Mary AhmannHibbard
on her selection in the 2017 Helena IR’s

20 Under 40!
Mary is a dedicated community member,
helping Helena thrive and maintain its

splendor.

Congratulations, Mary!
Thank you for all that you do in Helena

and for the Holter

12 E. Lawrence St. 406-442-6400 www.holtermuseum.org
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In 1 Corinthians 3:7 of 
the Bible, it says “So nei-
ther he who plants nor he 
who waters is anything, 
but only God, who makes 
things grow.” At Narrate 
Church of Helena, the Rev. 
Adam Huschka helps gather 
and scatter the seeds of 
new disciples, but leaves 
the work of true spiritual 
growth to God. 

Faith has long played an 
important role in Husch-
ka’s life. He explained that 
he was raised Catholic but 
his family didn’t regularly 
attend Mass. It wasn’t un-
til a turning point at age 19 
that Huschka says he really 
started to follow Jesus.

Later, while Huschka 
was attending college for 
both his undergraduate and 
master’s degrees, he became 
involved with and even took 
on leadership roles at Har-
vest Church in Billings. His 
work with Harvest contin-
ued to grow his faith and a 
new reality for him of what 
“church” could be like. 
Huschka wasn’t the only 
one.

“We found a new way of 
doing church that we fell in 
love with,” said Huschka of 
himself and others he con-
nected with before starting 
Narrate.

Huschka and his family, 
along with about 30 other 
people he had been involved 
with at Harvest Church, felt 

called to share their new-
found church theology in 
the Helena community.

In October 2009, Narrate 
Church officially formed in 
Helena.

Huschka doesn’t like to 
use the term “church” so 
much as “gathering” and 
“scattering” when discuss-
ing Narrate’s work and pur-
pose.

Every Sunday, Narrate 
members gather at Grand-
street Theatre in downtown 
Helena to “wrestle with 
topics like relationships, 
dating, marriage, parent-
ing, vocation, money and 
the many emotions that 
come with living.” The ser-
vices are complemented by 
songs delivered by Narrate’s 
band of musicians.

“We strive to make the 
gatherings enjoyable for 
people no matter their cur-
rent place with Jesus,” said 
Huschka.

The other six days of the 
week are what Huschka re-
fers to as “scattering,” where 
people are “called to narrate 
God’s story to our commu-
nity by the way we serve.”

Part of Narrate’s efforts 
to scatter is also one of the 
things that makes Huschka 
most proud — that is the 

church’s uncanny ability to 
form unlikely partnerships 
in the community.

For instance, Narrate 
partners with local brew-
eries to host the annual 
fundraising event, Ales for 
Trails. The beer, cider and 
wine tasting festival, which 
Narrate started seven years 
ago, raises money to support 
Helena’s local trail system.

For the past several years, 
Narrate has also partnered 
with the City of Helena to 
help distribute firewood to 
local families in need. City 
forestry projects to clean up 
dead or fallen trees create a 
surplus of firewood. Nar-
rate then assembles a team 
of volunteers to split the 
wood for donation in the fall 
and winter. Huschka shared 
that Narrate compiles ap-
proximately 100 cords of 
firewood each year to dis-
tribute.

Narrate also hosts an an-
nual Easter egg scramble on 
Mount Helena. This past 
Easter, dozens of kids up 
through 5th grade made a 
mad dash up the mountain 
in search of the 17,500 eggs 
hidden.

“For us, serving the com-
mon good is a win-win,” 
said Huschka.

ADAM 
HUSCHKA

PHOTO PROVIDED 

Founder, Narrate Church of Helena

Narrate Family

Dad
& Mary

Mom
& Sam

Steve
& Deb

from your

and

Congratulations
Adam
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Jay Weatherill, Premier of South 
Australia, said “I believe that in-
vesting in our children’s develop-
ment from the earliest age is the 
single most important contribu-
tion we can make.”

For the past eight years, Adam 
Jespersen has dedicated himself 
to investing in the care and heal-
ing of struggling children in the 
Helena area through his work at 
Intermountain.

A 2009 graduate of Carroll Col-
lege, Jespersen landed his first job 
out of school as an administra-
tive assistant for the development 
department of Intermountain, an 
adolescent mental health center 
that provides both residential and 
community based mental health 
services.

“Adam immediately made 
himself indispensable in the de-
partment—keeping track of do-
nor records, organizing meet-
ings, streamlining processes, and 
helping with events,” said Glenna 
Wortman-Obie, director of com-
munications and marketing at In-
termountain. “He was so helpful 

and knowledgeable, he was dubbed 
‘Adam Mountain.’”

It wasn’t long before Jespersen 
was promoted and assumed more 
responsibilities. He was also given 
a secondary position as project 
manager in the construction of 
two new residential cottages on 
Intermountain’s Helena campus 
location in 2014. The $2.5 million 
project gave Jespersen the oppor-
tunity to truly see the fruits of his 

fundraising efforts.
“We’re literally building new 

homes for the children we serve,” 
said Jespersen.

Jespersen remarked that it was 
inspiring to not only see the cot-
tages take form but to see the ef-
forts put in to build them.

“The architects and contractors 
and everyone involved realized it 
wasn’t just another office building 
they were building,” said Jespersen. 

“A lot of heart went into the con-
struction as they truly understood 
the impact of the project. They put 
their best work into it.”

For Jespersen, the most truly 
rewarding moment of the project, 
though, was seeing the children’s 
faces light up when they first 
stepped inside their new home.

Jespersen also helped over-
see construction of Providence 
Home, Intermountain’s thera-

peutic group home located just 
north of Flathead Lake near 
Somers, Montana. The $1.4 mil-
lion, 5,500-square-foot facility 
mirrors the new cottages built in 
Helena and now provides inten-
sive therapeutic care to up to eight 
children at a time.

Thanks to all of his dedicated 
efforts, Jespersen eventually 
earned himself the position of 
associate director of development 
at Intermountain. In that role, 
Jespersen has provided leadership 
and management of all fundraising 
activities for Intermountain, as 
well as offered expertise in grant 
writing and grant administration. 
Jespersen has also had continued 
opportunities to spend time 
interacting with community 
members — some who already 
contribute to Intermountain and 
others who are potential future 
supporters.

“It’s rewarding to be able to 
connect Intermountain’s mission 
to the community and help people 
better understand what our kids 
and families are facing and how 
they can help respond to it,” said 
Jespersen.

“To see how sacrificially this 
community supports our work is 
very humbling for me,” said Jes-
persen. “We are very committed 
to stretching that support as far as 
possible to make a lasting impact 
for kids and families.”

ADAM JESPERSEN

THOM BRIDGE, THOM.BRIDGE@HELENAIR.COM

Associate Director 

of Development, 

Intermountain

CONGRATULATIONS, ADAM!
Like many of our young leaders, your talent, skill and work ethic are
matched in equal measure by your passion for children and families
and the healing work we do. We are proud of your accomplishments!

Healing	rough Healthy Relationships

www.intermountain.org
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From wandering the halls as 
a student, then a teacher, and 
now the principal, Brett Zanto-
has truly come full circle in his 
career at Capital High School.

Four years ago, Zanto was 
hired as the principal of his alma 
mater. Ever since, he has been 
hard at work building relation-
ships, increasing academic suc-
cess among students, and trans-
forming Capital into a school 
that students and staff alike are 
proud to be part of.

After graduating from Capi-
tal in 1995, Zanto went on to 
become a teacher in the small 
Montana communities of both 
Outlook and Flaxville and later 
Bozeman. He later returned to 
Helena to teach at Capital High 

and served as the assistant prin-
cipal of Helena High School for 
six years.

Upon transitioning into his 
current role as principal of Cap-
ital in the summer of 2013, one 
of Zanto’s primary goals was to 
“instill a sense of pride in Capi-
tal High School” and continue 
building upon the school’s his-
tory of success.

“We are continually trying to 
cast a positive light on Capital 
High,” said Zanto. “And I think 
that’s something that we’ve been 
doing a really good job of.”

This past spring, Capital High 
was honored with the Montana 
ACT College and Career Tran-
sition Exemplar Award for the 
2016-2017 school year. The 2017 
graduating class had the second 
highest ACT writing score in 

2016 compared to other Mon-
tana AA schools.

In May, the Montana Behav-
ioral Initiative (MBI) awarded 
Capital an MBI Exemplar School 
award and platinum status for 
meeting “exemplary standards 
for promoting positive school 
climate and school safety.”

Zanto attributes Capital’s 

BRETT ZANTO

THOM BRIDGE, INDEPENDENT RECORD

Principal, Capital High School

Please see ZANTO, Page 12

Please see MURGEL, Page 13

LACEY MIDDLESTEAD

For the Independent Record 

Lifelong educator Rita Pier-
son said “Every child deserves 
a champion — an adult who will 
never give up on them, who un-
derstands the power of connec-
tion, and insists that they become 
the best that they can possibly be.”

For the past 17 years, Chrissy 
Murgel has tried to be one of those 
champions for the students she 
works with as a counselor at Hel-
ena High School.

With her mother and grandfa-
ther having both been teachers, 
Murgel admits that she comes 
from a long line of educators. 
She shared that she always knew 
growing up that she also wanted to 
be a teacher and help people, es-
pecially young people. This dream 
led her to pursue a bachelor’s de-
gree in secondary education from 

the University of Western Mon-
tana in Dillon.

During her time at Western, 

CHRISSY MURGEL

THOM BRIDGE, INDEPENDENT RECORD

Counselor, Helena High School

We would like to Congratulate
Brett Zanto and Christina Murgel

and thank them for all the great work
that they do in our schools!

Helena Education Foun
dation

honors

Brett Zanto,

2016 Let’s Talk About

Great Teacher

and

Chrissy Murgel,

three- time Distinguishe
d Educator

Congratulations!
hefmt.org

Thanks for helping

Helena’s students

believe in their

possibilities.

Thanks for helping

Helena’s students

believe in their

possibilities.

Follow us

ReachHigherMontana.org

(877) COLG4ME (265-4463)

Nothing is impossible,

the word itself sayys

Chrissy Murgel (HHS) and Brett Zanto (CHS)



20 UNDER 40 SUNDAY, JULY 30, 2017 | 11

ERIN LORANGER
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David Hemmer has worked 
his way up at First Interstate 
Bank for 13 years, starting with 
a job in college.

Now Hemmer, 34, is a regional 
credit analyst manager covering 
the Western Montana market.

He studied business finance 
at Carroll College and got a 
job in the operations center in 
Billings the summer before his 
senior year. Right before he 
graduated he was offered a teller 
position at the Helena location 
and continued to be promoted 
in different areas of the bank. 

His most recent promotion to a 
regional credit analyst came just 
a couple of months ago.

“I knew I wanted to stay here 
and stay with the bank, and I re-
ally grew to love Helena,” Hem-
mer said.

Hemmer said he is analyti-
cal, and his job allows him to 
use numbers and put pieces 
together to solve a puzzle. His 
former supervisor, Rich Bruner, 
said Hemmer not only excels at 
the numbers part of his job, but 
works each day to become a bet-
ter leader. He goes out of his way 
to mentor others and is a go-to 
person for many at the bank, 

Bruner said.
“I’ve always kind of bounced 

around and helped out in many 
different areas, even if it’s not in 
my certain department. I know 
we all function best as a team,” 
Hemmer said.

Outside of work, Hemmer is 
involved in the Helena Exchange 
Club and serves on the board of 
the Montana Club. He also joins 
colleagues from First Interstate 
Bank to do outdoor maintenance 
and cleanup for residents who 
aren’t able to do it on their own. 

Hemmer spends his free time 
enjoying the local breweries, 
mountain biking and golfing.

DAVID HEMMER

THOM BRIDGE, INDEPENDENT RECORD

Regional Credit Analyst Manager, First Interstate Bank

We are proud to support great people like you every day and appreciate your

commitment to the Helena community. You are a worthy recipient of this honor.

Stop by First Interstate Bank today and visit with David about all of your commercial

lending needs—it’s you and together.

Find out more at firstinterstate.com

Congrats, David Hemmer!

HELENA GULCH, 25 E. LYNDALE AVE., 406-457-7185, DAVID.HEMMER@FIB.COM
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CONGRATULATIONS

Jenny Taylor!

We are so lucky to

have you on our team!

from all of us at

successes like these to the stu-
dents and staff that breathe life 
into the school.
“We have great, hard working 
staff that really care about the 

students and great students who-
genuinely want to excel both aca-
demically and in extracurricular 
activities they are involved with,” 
said Zanto.

Joslyn Davidson, curriculum 
and instruction administrator for 
Helena Public Schools, added that 
Zanto’s leadership is another key 

factor in Capital’s success.
“Brett Zanto is an outstanding, 

selfless leader who has worked 
hard to maintain a sense of pride 
and community at Capital High 
School,” Davidson said.

While the classrooms and hall-
ways at Capital currently stand 
empty and silent, Zanto is still 

hard at work in his office during 
the summer months gearing up 
for the upcoming school year. Ac-
cording to Zanto, 1,315 students 
are currently enrolled for the 
2017-2018 school year, along with 
approximately 120 staff that keep 
the school operating smoothly 
year-round. When the first day of 

school hits in August, Zanto will 
be right there at the helm steering 
Capital into what he believes will 
be another successful year.

“It was my dream to return to 
Helena and give back to the school 
system that did so much for me,” 
said Zanto. “I still can’t believe 
I’m back here.”

Zanto
From 10

Ahmann Hibbard explained 
that she doesn’t focus on adver-
tising her real estate services in 
town; instead she relies on repeat 
and referral business and word-
of-mouth, stressing that choos-
ing a Realtor is not a decision that 
people should rush into.

“Finding the right Realtor is like 
finding the right pair of shoes,” 
said Ahmann Hibbard. “Some-
times you have to try on a few 
before you find the one that fits.”

In 2016, Ahmann Hibbard fin-
ished in the top three of the top-
producing agents in Helena out 
of 300 total agents. She was com-
pletely unaware of the news un-
til her brother shared it with her, 
stating that she’s never kept track 
of the number of deals she closes 
on; she only focuses on her clients 
and doing what’s best for them.

So what’s the secret behind her 
success? Ahmann Hibbard chalks 
it up to her love for people and the 
Helena community.

“I love Helena. It’s such a won-
derful place,” she said. “I love the 
strength of our community and 
how much the people here care 
about each other.”

Ahmann Hibbard
From 7

JESSE CHANEY

jesse.chaney@helenair.com

 Members of Helena’s business 
community are fortunate to have 
an ally who spends her “me time” 
volunteering for them. 

As organizer of the Swish Bas-
ketball Tournament, golf tour-
nament and other events hosted 
by the Helena Area Chamber of 
Commerce, Jenny Taylor of An-
derson ZurMuehlen helps bring in 
thousands of people who generate 
an estimated economic impact in 
the millions of dollars each year. 

“It’s really cheesy, but it makes 

me feel good and I love it, and I 
love the people of the community 
of Helena, and I love the relation-
ships I’ve made and the contacts 
I’ve made,” she said. “And it’s just 
a great way to get out in the com-
munity other than working pro-
fessionally.”

Taylor and her husband grew 
up in Havre and moved to Seattle, 
but returned to Helena to be closer 
to family. She earned her Master 
of Accountancy degree from the 
University of Montana and has 
been the corporate accounting 
director at Anderson ZurMuehlen 

since 2008.
“I call it the accountant for the 

accountants in the sense that my 
department does the financial 
statements and payroll and bud-
geting,” she said. “ … We’re just 
kind of the financial center of 
Anderson ZurMuehlen.”

Taylor originally got involved in 
the chamber through the Leader-
ship Helena program in 2014-15, 
and she was chosen to represent 
her class on the chamber’s board 
of directors that following year. 
She later became a permanent 
board member, which gave her 
the opportunity to get involved 

in planning the organization’s 
events.

Though she also enjoys down-
hill skiing and spending time at 
the lake, she said, “any other time 
is usually spent running around 
after my kids.”

“Jenny shows amazing grace 
and dexterity in balancing both 
work and family,” John Cummings, 
also of Anderson ZurMuehlen, 
wrote in her nomination for the 
20 Under 40 award. “ … Jenny 
has a dedication to her two kids 
(ages 7 and 10) and makes sure to 
be there for baseball games, soccer 
matches and Sunday School.”

JENNY 
TAYLOR

THOM BRIDGE, THOM.BRIDGE@HELENAIR.COM

Corporate Accounting Director, 

Anderson ZurMuehlen
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Ford Lincoln Toyota Honday

Congratulations
Jerin Borrego

from Your Friends at Helena Motors

Murgel recalled seeing a poster 
on the wall of a hallway one day 
advertising the counselor educa-
tion program at the University of 
Montana. She was immediately 
intrigued. While part of her felt 
becoming a counselor might be 
the next step on her career path, 
she wanted to gain some classroom 

experience first.
After graduating from the Uni-

versity of Montana Western, Mur-
gel was hired as a teacher at Helena 
High School. After teaching for a 
few years, Murgel continued her 
journey of helping others after 
being accepted into the three year 
counselor education program in 
Missoula. Murgel explained that 
she had to travel to Missoula on 
weekends while working full time 
at Helena High in order to achieve 

her master’s degree. In the spring 
of 2005, Murgel officially became 
a counselor and returned to Hel-
ena High to continue helping her 
students.

Murgel explained that the role of 
a school counselor involves bring-
ing together three different realms: 
high school academic planning, 
college and career planning, and 
social/emotional support.

“We do the best we can to un-
derstand all of our students’ vary-

ing needs,” said Murgel. “We work 
with them to find viable solutions 
to whatever challenge or setback 
they are facing so that they can 
continue to find success in the 
academic setting.”

“It’s a big job,” Murgel went on to 
say. “We have to wear a lot of hats.”

Outside of her regular role as a 
counselor, Murgel also serves on an 
advisory council for Reach Higher 
Montana as both a counselor and 
parent. Reach Higher Montana is 

a public benefit partnership with 
the Montana Higher Education 
Student Assistance Corporation 
that works to guide, prepare and 
support students in their efforts 
to reach their potential through 
higher education. Murgel helps 
with Reach Higher Montana’s col-
lege goal nights, which help raise 
FAFSA awareness and provide 
free help to students and parents 
as well as the opportunity to com-
plete their FAFSA application.

Murgel
From 10

MATT NEUMAN 

matthew.neuman@helenair.com 

 In between hundred-mile bike 
rides and hiking with her dogs, 
Jerin Borrego earned two major 
promotions at the Montana De-
partment of Agriculture in less 
than a year, achieving a specialist 
position at the pesticide depart-
ment.

“She’s really taken the bull by 
the horns,” her manager, Linda 
Johns, said.

As a pesticide registration spe-
cialist, Borrego is responsible for 
reviewing all 12,000 of the reg-
istered pesticides in Montana, 
making sure each one is safe and 
labeled properly. But she hasn’t 
limited herself to that.

In addition to working her own 

job, Borrego said she is commit-
ted to learning what everyone 
else around her does so she can 
be aware of how her work affects 
them. She volunteers her time to 
serve as a member of the Helena 
zoning commission and sings in 
the Helena Symphony choir.

A graduate of Capital High, she 
earned her bachelor’s degree in en-
vironmental science from Brigham 
Young University in Utah. She has 
mastered Spanish and Mandarin 
Chinese, and spent a year teaching 
English at a university in Xinxiang, 
China.

Since returning to Helena, she 
was accepted into the Helena Area 
Chamber of Commerce’s Leader-
ship Helena program, where she 
met someone from the agriculture 

department, and was hired as an 
administrative assistant.

She quickly worked her way up to 
technician, and eventually special-
ist. After showing such promise at 
her job, the state offered to pay for 
her to earn a master’s degree from 
Montana State University, where 
she is studying land resources and 
environmental management.

She loves hiking around Mt. 
Ascension near her home with 
her husband, Jaime, and her two 
Australian shepherds, Marty Mc-
Fly and Doc Brown.

“I think my keys to success have 
been a willingness to branch out, 
volunteer for extra work and un-
derstanding how I play into the 
bigger picture of everyone around 
me,” she said. 

JERIN BORREGO

THOM BRIDGE, THOM.BRIDGE@HELENAIR.COM

Pesticide Registration Specialist, Montana Department of Agriculture
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When Karri Jones was 
born, doctors told her 
parents she wouldn’t live 
more than a few hours. 
Her mother had been Life 
Flighted to Salt Lake City af-
ter she went into early labor.

That was 28 years ago, 
and just last year Karri 
fulfilled one of her dreams 
when she married Edwin 
(Junior) Ramirez.

“I thought it would never 
happen,” Jones said. “It was 
a dream wedding. It was 
magical.”

In her 28 years, Jones has 
accomplished more than 
many, and she’s done it from 
a wheelchair. In her 20 Un-
der 40 nomination letter, 
Kathryn Gallagher, mar-
keting director at Helena 
Industries, wrote: “Born 

with a disability and today 
utilizing a wheelchair, Karri 
exemplifies someone who 
is dedicated to their work, 
committed to our com-
munity and always seek-
ing ways to use her abilities 
to help other people and 
achieve her goals.”

Jones has worked at Hel-
ena Industries for 10 years, 
first in the Benchmark Man-
ufacturing area and more 
recently in the document 
destruction office. Jones 
also is the administrative 
assistant for Partners En-
suring Equal Rights and 
Support (PEERS) and a co-
host of a Helena Civic Tele-
vision program called “The 
Helena Industries Report.”

“I’m very active,” Jones 
said.

Jones also competes in 
Special Olympics in track 

and field events and bowling 
and participates in a West 
Mont cheer squad that per-
forms at various commu-
nity events. Oh, and you’ll 
also see her in the stands 
at Helena Bighorns hockey 
games waving a sign and 
cheering on the players.

“It’s rewarding to see the 
smiles on the players’ faces,” 
she said.

But Jones has more 
dreams on her to-do list.

“I’d like to go to college,” 
she said. “If I didn’t have a 
disability, I’d go for an O.B. 
— I have a fascination with 
babies. If I was able to do it 
in this situation, I’d still like 
to do it, or become a mid-
wife. Or, if there was a way 
I could be a doctor’s assis-
tant, I’d do it.”

And just like with that 
magical wedding, Jones is 

determined to make those 
dreams a reality.

“You have to follow your 

dreams as they come,” Jones 
said. “You don’t know if 
you’re going to have tomor-

row. You have to live life to 
the fullest and keep your 
head up high.”

KARRI 
JONES

THOM BRIDGE,THOM.BRIDGE@HELENAIR.COM 

Employee, Helena Industries

From: Helena Industries, PEERS Unlimited, West Mont, Montana Independent
Living Project, United Way of the Lewis and Clark Area, and Helena Civic Television.

We’re proud of you!

Karri!

THE CHAMBER

YOUNG PROFESSIONALS

Contact THE HELENA CHAMBER at
info@helenachamber.com

or 406-442-4120 for more information

Interested in learning more about the CYPs? Let us know!

CONGRATULATES THE 2017

20 UNDER 40

BUSINESS PROFESSIONALS!
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Helena native Nate McCarthy 
isn’t content using his back-
ground in accounting and finance 
just for his job. 

A partner at Wipfli LLP who 
has been with the accounting and 
consulting firm in 1999, McCarthy 
also uses his professional skills as 
a finance committee member for 
the Cathedral of St. Helena and 
the parent council treasurer for 
Hawthorne Elementary School.

After attending services at the 
cathedral for years and sending his 
children to Hawthorne, which he 
also attended as a child, he said 
both volunteer positions were a 
good fit.

“I have taken an interest in the 
Helena school district happen-
ings,” he added, noting that he 
and his wife have three children 
attending Helena’s public schools.

McCarthy also puts his pas-
sion for sports to good use as the 
treasurer for the Helena Babe Ruth 

Association and a coach for sev-
eral youth soccer, baseball and 
softball teams.

“I like youth athletics, and I 
think it’s important for kids to 
learn the sport but then learn a 

little bit about being on a team 
and wining, losing as a team,” 
McCarthy said. “I played soccer 

and baseball growing up too and I 
just like the sport, so it’s a pretty 
natural fit for me.”

It’s not unusual for him to coach 
up to five teams during the same 
season, said Marc McCauley, who 
nominated McCarthy for the 20 
Under 40 award.

“He is sincerely interested in all 
that he is involved with, organiz-
ing endless activities, and most of 
all, truly invested in the youth of 
Helena,” McCauley wrote.

After attending elementary, 
middle and high school in Hel-
ena, McCarthy earned a degree 
in business administration, along 
with his Masters of Accountancy, 
from the University of Montana. 
A Certified Public Accountant 
in the state of Montana, he now 
oversees a team of associates and 
consultants who specialize in the 
financial and operational needs 
of businesses and organizations 
at Wipfli.

McCarthy and his family en-
joy camping and boating, and 
he spends much of his off-time 
in the Bootcamp cycle class at 
Crossroads Fitness and riding his 
mountain bike on area trails.

“Nate gives tirelessly to his 
hometown Helena in so many 
ways – we are certainly a better 
community because of Nate Mc-
Carthy,” McCauley wrote.

NATE McCARTHY

THOM BRIDGE, INDETHOM.BRIDGE@HELENAIR.COM

CPA and  

Partner,  

Wipfli LLP
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Would you rather slave 9 
to 5 or hustle 24/7?

For Kyle Cicero, co-
owner of Ascension Physi-
cal Therapy, the answer is 
simple. He knows that true 
success in any area of life re-
quires a dedicated amount 
of hustling. And that is ex-
actly what he spends most 
of his days doing.

A single session of physical 
therapy following an injury 
in high school first sparked 
Cicero’s interest in the field. 
He admitted being attracted 
to the more hands-on, pa-
tient friendly profession of 
physical therapy and decided 
to pursue that as a career.

A 2006 Carroll College 
graduate, Cicero is also 
proud to have been a mem-
ber of two of their NAIA 
championship football 
teams. Cicero later attended 
Mayo Clinic School of 

Health Sciences and gradu-
ated in 2011 with a doctorate 
of physical therapy. He has 
been practicing in the Hel-
ena area ever since.

After working for Heuiser 
Physical Therapy for a few 
years, Cicero made the bold 
decision in January 2016 to 
open his own practice, As-
cension Physical Therapy, 
along with business partners 
Anna Larson and Jeff Shirley. 
At Ascension, Cicero spe-
cializes in low back pain and 
spine care, post-operative 
care, shoulder pain, knee 
pain, and any other physical 
therapy needs of his patients.

For Cicero, the greatest 
rewards from his physical 
therapy practice come from 
offering his patients a place 
to be comfortable during a 
stressful time and watching 
them walk through the door 
smiling and free of pain.

In addition to his physi-
cal therapy practice, Ci-

cero also spends his days 
hustling with a new busi-
ness venture in the Cross-
Fit industry, which Cicero 
has been part of for several 
years. He was first intro-
duced to CrossFit in 2010 
while attending physical 
therapy school.

“I instantly fell in love 
with it,” said Cicero.

Cicero’s passion for 
CrossFit compelled him 
to later acquire a CrossFit 
Level 1 (CF-L1) Trainer Cer-
tification in 2015 to coach 
others. His background 
in physical therapy makes 
Cicero very safety ori-
ented when it comes to his 
coaching. Since he under-
stands what the body can 
and cannot do, he trains his 
clients to properly perform 
dead lifts and other move-
ments to prevent injury. 
Cicero explained that he 
is considered the CrossFit 
physical therapist in town, 

as he’s worked with patients 
who have sustained injuries 
from CrossFit workouts.

At the end of the day, Ci-

cero relies on laughter to 
help get him through all of 
the challenges that come 
with running a business.

“Laughter is the only way 
you’ll get through it all,” he 
said. “I wholeheartedly be-
lieve that.”

KYLE 
CICERO

THOM BRIDGE, THOM.BRIDGE@HELENAIR.COM

Co-owner, Ascension Physical Therapy

CONGRATS
KYLE!

WAY TO GO!

WE ARE SO

HAPPY

FOR YOU!
(406)513-1422

3345 Colton Drive, Suite A

THANKYOU
Helena formore than 100

20 Under 40 nominees.

We are lucky our community has so

many talented,highly regarded

young professionals.

WELL
DONE!

See this and

other community

publications at

helenair.com
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Melissa Lewis started Melissa 
Lewis and Associates with a lap-
top, printer, cellphone and lobby-
ing license.

“I’ve always had a pretty hardy 
work ethic – I’ve been an entrepre-
neur since age 7 when my brother 
and I started a lawn business,” she 
said. “I paid my way through col-
lege, and that’s a big part of who I 
am because from an early age I’ve 
had to pull myself up by the boot-
straps and do it myself.”

The 39-year-old is the first 
person in her family to graduate 
from college, and she has staked a 
career in state and national poli-
tics. After earning a bachelor’s 
degree from Western Washing-
ton University in 2001, she got 

started working on former Sen. 
Max Baucus’ 2002 re-election 
campaign.

Lewis worked for a national 
consulting firm, where she says 
she learned the importance of 
working with clients from both 
sides of the political spectrum.

When she moved with her 
husband John back to Montana, 
she registered Melissa Lewis and 
Associates, but the business just 
didn’t take off.

“I always wanted to own my 
own business, but I realized I 
didn’t have the relationships to 
establish a robust client base,” 
she said.

Lewis worked for an engineer-
ing firm when in 2011, she “took a 
leap of faith” to start her own firm. 
Years later and boasting that cli-

ent base, she still keeps the busi-
ness flexible, employing an assis-
tant during the legislative session 
and contracting with associates as 
needed.

“I love my job, and I like the di-
versity of issues I get to work on,” 
she said. “I’m naturally a people 
person. I like interacting with 
state and local elected officials 
and Montanans in general, and 
I’m also kind of a policy wonk.”

The most challenging part of 
her work is balancing family and 
work with providing service to her 
clients and being a wife to John 
and mother to their three kids.

Lewis received 17 nominations 
for the 20 Under 40 award, in-
cluding one from Montana De-
partment of Health and Human 
Services Director Sheila Hogan.

“I’ve watched her over the years 
work at the Legislature and how 
well she does working across the 
aisle,” Hogan said. “She listens. 
She brings people together. And 
quite frankly I’m impressed with 
a young woman who has been so 
successful at starting her own 
business.”

One of the most important 
things for Lewis is sharing her 
experience with other young pro-
fessionals.

“I take a lot of pride in mentor-
ing other young professionals and 
letting them know that starting 
your own business is totally do-
able,” she said.

MELISSA LEWIS

THOM BRIDGE, THOM.BRIDGE@HELENAIR.COM

Owner, Melissa Lewis and Associates

We celebrate and appreciate

everything you are, and all

that you do.

Spectrum is pleased to recognize Melissa Lewis

for the 20 under 40 award.
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It must be hard for Laura 
Smith to sit still and wait for 
the birth of her first child. 
The baby is due in Septem-
ber, but Laura is receiving 
prenatal medical care in Mis-
soula and staying at the Ron-
ald MacDonald House there.

“I’m excited to meet her,” 
Smith said of her soon-to-
be-born daughter. “She’s a 
feisty gal. I suspect she’s a 
redhead.”

If that turns out to be the 
case, the baby will have in-
herited her mother’s hair and 
her mother’s energy.

At 35, Smith has had a ca-
reer that would leave a less 
passionate person exhausted 
and ready for retirement. 

Among her early accom-
plishments, even before 
graduating from the Utah 
State University with degrees 
in English and political sci-
ence, Smith interned at Na-
tional Public Radio in Wash-
ington, D.C., and broadcast 
two noteworthy pieces – 
one on a Pancake Mountain 
dance club for kids in D.C. 
and another on a seasonal 
celebrity in Salt Lake City 
(her hometown) known as 
Hanukah Harry.

As a child, Smith said she 
was drawn to the legal pro-
fession, and she ended up 
earning a law degree with a 
concentration in public ser-
vice from the University of 
Pennsylvania. While intern-
ing at the Department of Jus-

tice in D.C., Smith met Mon-
tana Supreme Court Justice 
Bill Leaphart who offered her 
a clerkship in Montana.

“It was such a gift to be 
back in the West,” Smith 
said.

After about a year into the 
clerkship, Smith was hired 
to be a federal prosecutor for 
the U.S. Attorney’s office in 
Great Falls. She prosecuted 
everything from health care 
fraud to violent crime. She 
also spent some time pros-
ecuting misdemeanors in 
Glacier National Park. It 
was also in Great Falls where 
she met her husband, Mac 
Smith. Their first date ended 
at the Great Falls landmark – 
the Sip ‘n Dip Lounge.

Smith moved to Helena 

and worked as the commu-
nications director for the 
Montana Department of Ad-
ministration. And in January 
of 2017, Smith became the 
deputy director of the Mon-
tana Department of Public 
Health and Human Services, 
under Director Sheila Hogan.

In her spare time, Smith 
plays violin in the Helena 
Symphony and enjoys run-
ning Helena’s trails system.

When asked what keeps 
her so motivated, she said: 
“It’s the desire to contribute 
in a positive way and truly 
enjoying positive work.”

Smith was nominated for 
the 20 Under 40 award by 
two people, her husband and 

her current boss.
In her nomination letter, 

Hogan wrote that as a former 
federal attorney, Smith “… 
prosecuted child abuse, do-
mestic violence, and capital 
cases on Montana’s reserva-
tion. She felt this work was 
often the end of the story. 
She changed occupations 
to impact the beginning of 
the story: She is the DPHHS 
Deputy Director. She fo-
cuses on reengineering the 

child welfare system, public 
health, prevention, and en-
suring access to medical care. 
She leads the department’s 
health policy initiatives in-
cluding suicide prevention 
and childhood hunger.”

Mac added in his letter: 
“She is generally an inter-
esting and talented person. 
(And I may be a little biased 
since she is my wife, but 
most people would say the 
same thing).”

LAURA SMITH
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Laura and Mac Smith

Deputy Director, Department of Public Health and Human Services

LACEY MIDDLESTEAD

For the Independent Record 

The swinging action of a 
leg as it shoots up and out to 
plant a foot in another gap 
in the rock. The careful un-
folding of an arm from the 
shoulder all the way down to 
the fingertips as it stretches 
up to grab another hold. The 
intuitive way the body flows 
from one movement to the 
next, creating a seamless 
line up a mountainside.

For Zach Bushilla, co-
founder of Stonetree Climb-
ing Center, rock climbing is 
a true art form.

“I love the creativity of the 
sport and finding a line that 
looks inspiring to climb,” 
said Bushilla. “It’s not just 
a ladder straight to the top.”

A Helena native, Bushilla 

grew up loving the Montana 
outdoors and especially rock 
climbing. He shared that he 
was first introduced to the 
sport while shooting hoops 
at the YMCA one day. Bush-
illa noticed a man scaling a 
small climbing wall nearby 
and was immediately in-
trigued. Only a day or two 
later, Bushilla had purchased 
his own pair of rock climbing 
shoes and never looked back.

“I was hooked,” said 
Bushilla, smiling.

Bushilla explained that 
climbing is very much a 
puzzle that you have to 
piece together as you go 
along. The most subtle 
movement or body shift 
can either move a climber 
farther along their line or 
cause them to get stuck in 

their current position.
“I love the challenge of the 

sport,” said Bushilla. “It’s 
difficult, but it’s a challenge 
that’s always within reach.”

For the better part of 20 
years, Bushilla has worked to 
hone his skills as a climber. 
For the past 10 years, he has 
worked at getting others ex-
cited about climbing as well.

ZACH BUSHILLA

THOM BRIDGE, 
THOM.BRIDGE@HELENAIR.COM

Co-founder, Stonetree Climbing Center

Please see BUSHILLA, Page 19
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It must be hard for Laura 
Smith to sit still and wait for 
the birth of her first child. 
The baby is due in Septem-
ber, but Laura is receiving 
prenatal medical care in Mis-
soula and staying at the Ron-
ald MacDonald House there.

“I’m excited to meet her,” 
Smith said of her soon-to-
be-born daughter. “She’s a 
feisty gal. I suspect she’s a 
redhead.”

If that turns out to be the 
case, the baby will have in-
herited her mother’s hair and 
her mother’s energy.

At 35, Smith has had a ca-
reer that would leave a less 
passionate person exhausted 
and ready for retirement. 

Among her early accom-
plishments, even before 
graduating from the Utah 
State University with degrees 
in English and political sci-
ence, Smith interned at Na-
tional Public Radio in Wash-
ington, D.C., and broadcast 
two noteworthy pieces – 
one on a Pancake Mountain 
dance club for kids in D.C. 
and another on a seasonal 
celebrity in Salt Lake City 
(her hometown) known as 
Hanukah Harry.

As a child, Smith said she 
was drawn to the legal pro-
fession, and she ended up 
earning a law degree with a 
concentration in public ser-
vice from the University of 
Pennsylvania. While intern-
ing at the Department of Jus-

tice in D.C., Smith met Mon-
tana Supreme Court Justice 
Bill Leaphart who offered her 
a clerkship in Montana.

“It was such a gift to be 
back in the West,” Smith 
said.

After about a year into the 
clerkship, Smith was hired 
to be a federal prosecutor for 
the U.S. Attorney’s office in 
Great Falls. She prosecuted 
everything from health care 
fraud to violent crime. She 
also spent some time pros-
ecuting misdemeanors in 
Glacier National Park. It 
was also in Great Falls where 
she met her husband, Mac 
Smith. Their first date ended 
at the Great Falls landmark – 
the Sip ‘n Dip Lounge.

Smith moved to Helena 

and worked as the commu-
nications director for the 
Montana Department of Ad-
ministration. And in January 
of 2017, Smith became the 
deputy director of the Mon-
tana Department of Public 
Health and Human Services, 
under Director Sheila Hogan.

In her spare time, Smith 
plays violin in the Helena 
Symphony and enjoys run-
ning Helena’s trails system.

When asked what keeps 
her so motivated, she said: 
“It’s the desire to contribute 
in a positive way and truly 
enjoying positive work.”

Smith was nominated for 
the 20 Under 40 award by 
two people, her husband and 

her current boss.
In her nomination letter, 

Hogan wrote that as a former 
federal attorney, Smith “… 
prosecuted child abuse, do-
mestic violence, and capital 
cases on Montana’s reserva-
tion. She felt this work was 
often the end of the story. 
She changed occupations 
to impact the beginning of 
the story: She is the DPHHS 
Deputy Director. She fo-
cuses on reengineering the 

child welfare system, public 
health, prevention, and en-
suring access to medical care. 
She leads the department’s 
health policy initiatives in-
cluding suicide prevention 
and childhood hunger.”

Mac added in his letter: 
“She is generally an inter-
esting and talented person. 
(And I may be a little biased 
since she is my wife, but 
most people would say the 
same thing).”
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For the better part of 20 
years, Bushilla has worked to 
hone his skills as a climber. 
For the past 10 years, he has 
worked at getting others ex-
cited about climbing as well.
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Laura is a former federal attorney, who prosecuted child
abuse, domestic violence, and capital cases on Montana’s
reservations. She is now the DPHHS Deputy Director, and
focuses on reengineering the child welfare system, public
health, prevention, and ensuring access to medical care. She
leads the department’s health policy initiatives including

suicide prevention and childhood hunger.
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Rebekah Larson is no stranger to 
being in the newspaper. In fact, it 
was the first thing she ever did.

As the first baby born in Helena 
on New Year’s Day 1983, she was 
the Independent Record’s center-
piece photo.

She’s grown up quite a bit since 
then, taking on the role of Vice 
President of Financial Services at 
Helena Community Credit Union. 
In seven years, she rose through the 
ranks from a lead, to a manager, up 
to vice president.

“When it comes to managing 

and coaching, she really excels,” 
HCCU president Greg Strizich, 
who nominated Larson for the 20 
Under 40 award. “She is excellent 
with her staff, and has developed 
a highly effective and dedicated 
team.”

Larson is the mother of two 
young daughters, Elyse, 8, and 
Calysta, 12, and has been married 
to her husband Randy for almost 
13 years.

In addition to overseeing the fi-
nancial services division at HCCU, 
Larson contributes much of her 
time to the charitable work the 
credit union sponsors, including 

National Alliance on Mental Ill-
ness efforts, the Night to Shine 
program for local youth, and the 
Empty Bowls fundraiser for The 
Friendship Center.

She has distinguished herself as 
an innovator and is responsible for 
building several critical projects, 
including HCCU’s Phone Lending 
Center, Strizich said in his nomina-
tion of Larson.

Graduating as a salutatorian 
from Broadwater High School, she 
went on to study mass commu-
nications at MSU-Billings, where 
she worked full time to put her-
self through school and graduated 

summa cum laude. In her junior 
year, she started working at Wells 
Fargo as a teller, and fell in love with 
financial business. She focused on 
business for her last two years in 
college and continued to grow at 
Wells Fargo.

Her current job at HCCU is a far 
cry from her first job at the A&W 
in Townsend, but from the young 
age of 16, she learned the rewards 
of hard work and professionalism.

She is grateful for her family’s 
strong support system and her 
“amazing staff,” which makes her 
so proud.

“I don’t look at myself differently 

just because I’m in a VP role now,” 
she said. “I think part of the key to 
my success is I just try to treat oth-
ers how I would want to be treated.”

REBEKAH LARSON

THOM BRIDGE, 
THOM.BRIDGE@HELENAIR.COM

Vice President of Financial Services, Helena Community Credit Union

As a member of the Helena Rec-
reation Foundation, Bushilla was 
instrumental in bringing the 11-foot 
tall outdoor climbing boulder to 
Centennial Park in 2013. For the past 
several years, Bushilla has coached 
a local climbing team called the 
Thunder Chickens — mostly from 
a gym constructed in Bushilla’s 
garage. While Bushilla admits that 
there have been smaller climbing 
gyms in Helena in years past, there 
was never a proper facility to really 
bring together the whole climbing 
community.

“Opening a climbing gym is a 

dream I’ve had for forever,” said 
Bushilla. “But I never would’ve 
been able to do it on my own.”

The idea for Stonetree was born 
after making a climbing connec-
tion though the Base Camp one day 
when Bushilla and his wife, Tiffany, 
met Tim and Barb Wetherill. The 
group started talking and found a 
mutual connection in their love for 
climbing. As they began to form a 
friendship, the idea for building a 
rock climbing facility in Helena got 
thrown around. The more discus-
sion the families had, the more of a 
reality the gym seemed.

“We just went for it,” said Bush-
illa.

With three young daughters at 
home with their mom, Tiffany, and 

working full time as an electrician 
for his father’s company, Integ-
rity Electric, Bushilla nevertheless 
began construction on Stonetree. 
Working nights and weekends, 
the two families worked together 
to slowly give life to the dream of 
Stonetree.

In October 2015, Stonetree 
Climbing Center finally opened. 
The center encompasses 2,100 
climbable square feet of 16-18 foot 
tall bouldering walls, top of the line 
climbing holds, and industry stan-
dard safety features.

Bushilla’s ultimate goal for 
Stonetree was to create an indoor 
space where outdoor enthusiasts 
and children could recreate and 
embrace the sport of climbing year-

round. As a sport, bouldering builds 
strength and confidence while mo-
tivating people to push their physi-
cal limits. As a side effect, Bushilla 
explained, climbing also leads to the 
development of lifelong friendships 
and partnerships.

“Zach has been instrumental 
in building not only the climbing 
community in Helena, but a com-
munity that crosses generations 
and fosters the future of our town,” 
said a friend, Megan Helton. “He 
has been instrumental in creating 
an inclusive, supportive and en-
gaging environment at Stonetree 
where people of all ages can enjoy 
the sport of climbing.”

Recently, Bushilla made the tough 
decision to hand over full owner-

ship and management of Stone-
tree to the Wetherills. With only 
so many hours in the day, Bushilla 
admitted that he struggled to keep 
all the pieces of his life in balance.

“I just wanted to get it going and 
build community,” said Bushilla of 
Stonetree. “But I am still passion-
ate about coaching and helping the 
sport and community continue to 
grow.”

Bushilla explained that while the 
sport of rock climbing is still pretty 
low key in Helena, it is definitely 
growing.

“Climbing can come off as a su-
per extreme sport,” admitted Bush-
illa. “But it’s a super chill sport in 
all reality. Nothing is cooler than 
creating a perfect line that flows.”

Bushilla
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thank you!

Innovator. Leader. Volunteer.

thecu4u.org

915 Kessler • 3150 N Sanders • 1930 Prospect • VA Center/Fort Harrison

Federally Insured by NCUA. Equal Housing Opportunity.

Congratulations, Rebekah! You are an outstanding HCCU professional,
and we thank you for your dedication, your talent, and the
volunteer work you do in our community!

HCCU Vice President of Financial Services


