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Friday, December 28, 2018 at 9:57:18 AM Central Standard Time

Fwd: Iowa audit
email: "jdraper@masoncityschools.org Jodi Draper"
To: email: "llala@masoncityschools.org Lorrie Lala" , email: "ecllipse1@mchsi.com Doug Campbell" , email:
"bseaton@masoncityschools.org Brent Seaton" , email: "jaschweitzer@masoncityschools.org Jake Schweitzer" , email:
"asteckman@masoncityschools.org Alan Steckman" , email: "pswarren@mchsi.com Scott Warren" , email:
"dversteeg@masoncityschools.org Dave Versteeg"

Dear Directors
We are still under the contract set in place with Previous Administration on the buy out. There is 
language in that contract of certain topics that we as a board are not to comment on,  so be very mindful 
of your communications and or responses to press. 
 I am sending you emails I am getting and I am not responding until all is vetted out.  I will not send every 
email just this example for you to be aware they are probably coming to your inbox soon. 
We do not want to put our district at risk  We want to be transparent and yet we need to be responsible 
 
Thank you
Jodi 
 
 
 
---------- Forwarded message ---------

 From: Jodi Draper <jdraper@masoncityschools.org>
 Date: Fri, Dec 28, 2018 at 9:51 AM

 Subject: Fwd: Iowa audit
 To: Dave Versteeg <dversteeg@masoncityschools.org>, Doug Campbell <ecllipse1@mchsi.com>

  
 
 
Dave
This just emailed to myself and Doug
I am not sending out a response at this time
thanks
Jodi

 ---------- Forwarded message ---------
 From: Lampe, Nelson <nlampe@ap.org>

 Date: Fri, Dec 28, 2018 at 9:47 AM
 Subject: Iowa audit

 To: jdraper@masoncityschools.org <jdraper@masoncityschools.org>, ecllipse1@mchsi.com 
<ecllipse1@mchsi.com>

  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

mailto:jdraper@masoncityschools.org
mailto:dversteeg@masoncityschools.org
mailto:ecllipse1@mchsi.com
mailto:nlampe@ap.org
mailto:jdraper@masoncityschools.org
mailto:jdraper@masoncityschools.org
mailto:ecllipse1@mchsi.com
mailto:ecllipse1@mchsi.com


1/3/2019 Google Apps Vault - Fwd: Iowa audit

https://ediscovery.google.com/discovery/DisplayMessage?hl=en&m=0526cde9-9bc6-4d4a-ac30-a0eec1717f18&at=ACD7onrLy6BUK67hk_s4byB7Og… 2/2

Morning:

 

 

 

Nelson Lampe here with The Associated Press in Omaha, helping my colleagues in Des Moines.

 

 

 

I’m preparing a small story about the results of the latest Iowa audit, which has uncovered $2.13 million 
more in improper disbursements by the school district.

 

 

 

Now the you and the rest of the school board have the audit information, what will you do with it? Seek 
reimbursement from the current or former employees, including Dr. Micich? Seek criminal or civil action 
in the courts?

 

 

 
 
Nelson Lampe, The AP, Omaha
402-391-0031

 
 
The information contained in this communication is intended for the use of the designated recipients 
named above. If the reader of this communication is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified 
that you have received this communication in error, 
 and that any review, dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If 
you have received this communication in error, please notify The Associated Press immediately by 
telephone at +1-212-621-1500 and delete this email. 
 Thank you. 
 
 
 
 


