
ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE
FOR CHANGE OF NAME

PETITION OF:
ANGELA HINES

CASE NUMBER: CU25-04652

TO ALL INTERESTED PERSONS:
Petitioner: Angela Hines filed a petition
with this court for a decree changing
names as follows:
Present Name:
a. Angela Hines
Proposed Name:
a. Aneemah Bakar
THE COURT ORDERS that all persons in-
terested in this matter shall appear before
this court at the hearing indicated below to
show cause, if any, why the petition for
change of name should not be granted.
Any person objecting to the name
changes described above must file a writ-
ten objection that includes the reasons for
the objection at least two court days be-
fore the matter is scheduled to be heard
and must appear at the hearing to show
cause why the petition should not be gran-
ted. If no written objection is timely filed,
the court may grant the petition without a
hearing.

NOTICE OF HEARING
Date: Sept. 15, 2025; Time: 9:00am;

Dept: 5; Rm: 301
The address of the court is:

SUPERIOR COURT OF CALIFORNIA,
COUNTY OF

Hall Of Justice
600 Union Ave.

Fairfield, CA 94533

A copy of this Order to Show Cause must
be published at least once each week for
four successive weeks before the date set
for hearing on the petition in the following
newspaper of general circulation, printed
in this county: Daily Republic. Please file
Proof of Publication 5 business days in
advance of hearing date. (newspaper
does not file w/ court).

Date: 05/23/2025
/s/ Power
Judge of the Superior Court
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