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Fordecades,TheBillingsGazette’s
40UnderFortyhascelebratedour
community’sbest andbrightest
people.Manyof those featured in

thepasthavegoneon toevenbigger and
brighter things.They’vebuilt successful
businesses, risen through the ranksof their
companies, landed inpolitical officeswhere
they’vechampionedabetterMontana, and
perhapsmost importantly, they’vehelped
others to succeed.

But, it’s beenawhile sincewe’ve seen
aclass like thisone.Thisgroupofyoung
leaders inbusiness,healthcare, trades,
community service, thearts andother

fields,haveachievedgreatnessduringa
verydifficult stretchofpandemicandeco-
nomic slowdown.

With that inmind,weasked thisyear’s
class abit of a trickquestion.Wewanted to
get their thoughtson failure.And, almost
universally, theconsensuswas that failure
doesn’thave tobeabad thing.

Smart leaders fail on theirwayup, ar-
rivingat aplace theycouldn’thavewithout
learningwhat they learned fromthe fail-
ingprocess.For example, theubiquitous
iPhone isn’t evenclose to thedeviceSteve
Jobsfirst attempted. Itwashis failures that
kept steeringhim in the rightdirection.

And, considerStephanieKwolek.She
inventedKevlar, thematerial in armored
vests.Thinkofhowmany liveshavebeen
savedbyher invention.And,here’s thebest
part,Kwolek’sdiscoveryofKevlarwas it-
self amistake.Shewas trying tofindaway
to turna solidpolymer intoa liquidwhen
she realized thefibers shewascreating in
herprocesswerefive times stronger than
steel.

Here’swhat a fewof thisyear’s40Under
Fortywinnershad to sayabout thevalueof
their ownfailures.

JanielOlsonBegger called failures“a
great thing” that canhelpus reflectonhow

wecando thingsbetter.
KristeneBoglementioneda failed

relationship that forcedher toquickly learn
twothings thathavehelpedher succeed in
business:howtoproblemsolveandhowto
multi-task.

RyanCremer said thatwhenhisgrades
slipped incollegehis fathergavehim“the
butt-chewingof a lifetime.”Theskills he
developed in revivinghis gradesare skills
thathave liftedhim inbusiness.

And,TaraKirschenmannsaid she
doesn’t evenbelieve in failure. “If some-
thingdidn’tworkout, thenyou’ve received
somevaluable feedback.”
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Failure is just another word for success, if you work it right
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on being named 40 Under Forty!

Thanks for all you do for our members
and communities. We are honored to

have you on the Altana team!

Congratulations Ryan
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www.sibanyestillwater.com

Congratulations to all 40 Under Forty recipients!

Proudly mining and recycling critical
minerals in Montana for the USA

Congratulations to our own Ashley
Chancellor. Ashley is the Environmental
Affairs manager at our East Boulder

Mine and is passionate about educating
the world about responsible mining and
promoting diversity & inclusion within

the mining industry.
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Age:38
CompanyandTitle:RockyVista

UniversityMontanaCollegeofOsteopathic
Medicineand I amtheDirectorofSimula-
tion.

Hometown:Billings
Educationand/orBackground: I

graduatedwithmy (DNP)Doctorateof
NursingPracticeEducationalLeadership
in2021.Before that I earnedmyMastersof
Nursing in2015andmyBachelor’sofSci-
enceNursing (BSN) fromMSUBozeman in
2007. I’veheldvarious roles inhealthcare
andhigher education, includingworkingas
afloornurseandchargenurse (orthopedics,
labor anddelivery, and long-termcare),
assistantprofessor,RNtoBSNDirector,
Healthcare servicesDepartmentChair,
andsimulation instructor.

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? It is incredible theendless
possibilities inhealthcareprofessions. I feel
very fortunate that frommynursingde-
gree, I havebeenable toexperience somany
professions, fromworkingat thebedsideas
anurse to teachingour futureandcurrent
nurses andhealthadministrators tonow

medical students in the innovativeworld
of simulation.However, if I couldnotbe
inhealthcareandhigher educationas the
DirectorofSimulation. Iwould still be in
educationasa teacher at anelementary
school.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?Myotherpassion in life
besides chasingmythreekidsaround to
activities andsportingevents is I love to
becreative. I love tocraft invariousways,
frommakingblankets tocraftingwithmy
Cricut. I enjoymakingcharcuterieboards.
I think it is so fun to see thedifferentways
youcanput themtogether andmake them
looksoappealing to theeye.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy? I amnot sure Ihave
ever reallygottenbadadvice. I guess atone
point inmycareer, Iwas told to just “put
yourheaddown,do theworkanddon’t ask
questions.” I amnotone tousuallynot ask
questions, as throughaskingquestions,we
growandcontinue to learn throughout life
andourcareers.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Your success cannot

bemeasuredbyanotherperson’s stan-
dards.Eachperson is striving for success in
their ownway.Howyouchoose tomeasure
shouldbebasedonyourgoals.Take it in
strides, successdoesnot alwayscomeeasy
orall at once.Youmustworkhardandput
yourbest effort intoall youdo. It’s through
thatyouwill findyour success.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Sappy
movies! It isnice to turnonagoodwhole-
somemovieandwatch twopeople fall in
love!Oh, andchocolate!

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve?
Mentoring. Ihavebeen fortunate enough to
have somegreatmentors alongmy journey,
andstill havea fewhelpingme inmyrole
today. Iwant theability topay it forward to
helpothersbe successful in their roles.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess? Inmyrole it falls backon the success
of the students aroundme.Whenthe stu-
dents areable towork through the simula-
tionandcorrectlymeet thegoalsof it then I
have succeeded inmy job.

Whatfailurehaveyoulearnedthe
mostfrom? IcannotthinkofafailureIhave

hadpersonally.But inthesimulationworld,
weoftenfailormakeamistakequiteafew
times.Students learnwhenwetalkabout
it,figureoutwhyitwaswrongandthen
startthesimulationover.So,wecanlearn
fromthemistakeandcomplete itcorrectly
toensurewerememberthecorrectsteps.
This iswhywehavesimulationtohavea
safeenvironmenttopracticeandcanmake
mistakesbeforegoingintotherealworldof
healthcare.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Thehardestpartofmy jobbutalsoapiece
Iverymuchenjoy is thecoordinationand
scheduling. I have tocoordinateandsched-
ule thevarious simulationevents toensure
wehave thecorrect rooms, equipment,

Age:33
CompanyandTitle: Intermountain

HealthcareHeart andVascular Institute,
Cardiologist

Hometown:Newmarket,Ontario,
Canada

Educationand/orBackground:
Undergraduatedegree fromtheUniversity
ofWesternOntario,medical school atSt.
George’sUniversity, residencyand fellow-
ship trainingatCooperMedicalSchoolof
RowanUniversity.

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? I truly lovepracticing
medicine so if I couldn’tbeaphysician, I
wouldprobablybeaveterinarianas I love
all animals.That, oropenupacat sanctu-
ary.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?Traveling theworldwith
myhusband, spending timewith family,
andof coursemytwokitties.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?“Justpower through.”
Youhave to listen toyourbodyandcreate
balance.Otherwise, youwill just endup

burningout.
Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-

ageraboutsuccess?Tobesuccessful, you
have toenjoywhatyouarepursuing.Take
time toexplore interests andonceyoufind
apassion, just go for it andworkhard.Suc-
cesswill comenaturally.Hardworkalways
wins.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Any-
thingpumpkinpieflavored.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? I
havean interest inpreventativecardiology
so Iwould like toeventuallybeboard-cer-
tified inLipidology.

Howdo youmeasure your own
success? I find success through the
positive outcomes and wellbeing of the
patients I treat. There is no better feel-
ing than seeing my patients feel better
after a prescribed treatment or proce-
dure.

What failure have you learned the
most from? In college, I played varsity
ice hockey and one year I did notmake
the team. This was very difficult forme

because I played hockey competitively
since I was 8 years old and it felt like I
lost my identity. In hindsight, it was the
best thing that could have happened as
I hadmore time to focus onmy studies
and pursuemedical school. This “fail-
ure” taughtme themeaning of the phrase
“when one door closes, another one
opens.”

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Deliveringbadnews.Asaphysician, it is
inevitable thatyouwill have toprovidebad
news toapatientor their familymembers.
Incardiology,wehavenumerous thera-
pies thatwecanofferpatients forheart
health, but at times therapies fail towork
and that is verydifficultwhenyouhave to

tell apatient that thecurrent therapy isnot
workingand that thereare limitedoptions
available.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“Houseof theDragon.”

What isyour favoritebook?“The7
1/2DeathsofEvelynHardcastle”byStuart
Turton. I loveagood“whodunnit.” I also
really liked“Educated”byTaraWestover.

What is the most rewarding/im-
portant aspect of your occupation?
The most rewarding aspect of being a
cardiologist is building relationships
with my patients and seeing them
thrive and live their life to the full-
est. Many times it may just be with
a medication change, whereas other
times it may be performing lifesaving
interventions for patients in critical
situations.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration? I find inspiration throughmany
people inmy life. It is important tohave
differentpeople inyour life for specific
mentoringneeds.Thatbeing said, I donot
think Iwouldbewhere I amtodaywithout
the loveandsupport frommyhusbandand
parents.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby?
Treatothers likeyouwouldwantyour fam-
ilymembers tobe treated.

BECKYANGLIN | FALL ASLEEP WITH A
DREAM ANDWAKE UPWITH A PURPOSE

CARINEBASMADJIAN |
HARDWORK ALWAYS WINS

Please see Anglin, Page 29

Please see Basmadjian, Page 29
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Age:39
CompanyandTitle:MontanaState

UniversityBillings,DirectorofAthletics
Hometown:Philadelphia
Educationand/orBackground:MSU

Billings-Master’s inSports,Recreation
andFitnessManagement (‘14);Michigan
StateUniversity-Bachelor’s inSociology
(‘06),Bachelor’s in InterdisciplinaryStud-
ies (‘05)

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? If I couldnotbe inathlet-
ics administrationdirectly, Iwouldmore
than likelygravitate towardcoaching foot-
ball either at thehighschoolor collegiate
level. If I couldn’tbe involved inathletics
completely, Iwouldprobablybe involved in
anumberofoutlets thathelppeoplewith
personal growth/development.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life? I’mextremelypassionate
abouthelpingpeoplegrowand thisfieldal-
lowsmetodo thatonadailybasis.Ath-
leticshasalwaysbeenmyNorthStar and
providedaplatformtoallowmetodevelop
andexpressmyself. I feel fortunate tobe in

aposition tohelp shorten the learningcurve
for individuals that arewalkinga similar
pathasmyself.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?Fake it ‘till youmake
it. It creates amindset that focuseson
shortcomings.Weareallworks inprogress,
and justbecausewemaynotbeat apoint
wherewewant tobe, thatdoesn’tmeanwe
haven’t earned theopportunity to transi-
tionourpotential to thefinishedproduct.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Success is a journey
notadestination.You trulyhave tobe
infatuatedwith theprocess just asmuch,
if notmore, than theoutcome.Knowthat
youareenough; thatdoesn’tmean thatyou
get comfortablewithwhereyouarebutyou
have thenecessary resolve tofigure it out
andkeepmoving forward.Learn tooperate
inchaos; themorecomfortableyouarewith
beinguncomfortable, thebetter equipped
youwill be to succeed.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Dance
movies, thecheesier thebetter!That and
chocolate chipcookies.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve?
Iwant tobeapartof anadministration
teamthathelpswinacollegiatenational
championship.

Howdoyoumeasureyourown
success?Greatquestion.Navigatingmy
professional andpersonal responsibilities
at ahigh level andgetting themostoutof
myself onadailybasis is ametricof suc-
cess.Creatinganenvironment that fosters
holisticdevelopmentandhelpingeveryone
involvedexcelpast their expectations to
becomethebestversionof themselves is
what I amactivelyworking toward.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from? I can’tpointoutonespecifi-
cally at themoment,but failure is apartof
theprocess togrow. I amconstantly replay-
ingmeetings, emails, conversations, etc. to
evaluate if I articulated theway Iwanted to
ensure Iwas fullyunderstood.Trying todo
toomuchatone timeandspreadingmyself
thin iswhere Ihave failed in thepast and
amhonestly stillworkingon.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?

Managingpeople and learninghowto
balance themultitudeofpersonalities. I’m
more reservedand introvertedbynature
andhavegottencomfortablewith thispart
of the jobbut it does require a lotofmy
energyandmental bandwidth.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“AncientApocalypse”on
Netflix.

What isyour favoritebook?“The
Alchemist”byPauloCoelho.

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?Working
withpeople andcelebrating their accom-
plishmentsandsuccesses, small and large.

Age:29
CompanyandTitle:RBCWealth

Management-FinancialAdvisor
Hometown:Billings
Educationand/orBackground:

Bachelor’sDegree inBusinessManagement
fromMontanaStateUniversityBillings.
Master’sDegree inHealthcareAdmin-
istration fromMontanaStateUniversity
Billings.CompletionofSecurities Industry
Essentials, Series 7,Series66and Insur-
anceLicensureExams

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? Iwould takeacomplete
pivot and runananimal rescue/sanctu-
ary. I havealwayshadavery soft spot for
animals since Iwasa little girl. Itwould
still bringvariety tomydayeachandevery
day.However, it is veryhard, yet rewarding
work,which is something I enjoyaboutmy
currentposition.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?Past callingsofmy life

havebeenany typeof athletic eventor
sport. I havealwaysenjoyedcompetition
anddevelopedapassion forbasketball that
led toacollegecareer atMontanaState
UniversityBillings.Otherpassionsofmy
life thatflowthroughmyworkarehelping
people.Whether that is advisingaclient
onmonetarydecisions, coachingayoung
athleteorbeing there for someonewho
needsanear.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?This is a stumping
question. Iwould just reiterate thatyou
canalwaysfindanugget fromsomeone’s
advice.Youmaynot takeevery suggestion
anduse it, but thereusually is anugget that
youcanapply.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?There is something
positive tobe saidaboutbeing theunder-
dog.Hardworkwill at somepoint, at some
time,payoff.Therearegoing tobe times in
lifewhenyouaregoing togetoverlooked,

nothired,bypassed–don’tquit.Allow
yourself to feel theemotionof certain
rejectionbutkeepshowingup,keepdoing
thework, andat somepoint, I promiseyou
itwill payoff. Itmay takefiveyears, but it
will.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Shoes,
all the shoes.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? In
thefinancial industry thereare somany
differentdesignations that canbeattained.
Thenextprofessional accomplishment I
would like toachieve is gettingmyCFP
‘CertifiedFinancialPlanner’designation.

Howdoyoumeasureyourown
success?Myownsuccess ismeasuredby
the success andsentimentofothers. Ifmy
clients areable toobtaina solidpictureof
theirfinancial goals, a roadmapofhow
wearegoing toachieve them,knowingwe
haveoptionsavailable and thenworking
together topush to fruition–thatwouldbe

mymeasureof success.
What failurehaveyou learned the

most from?Not trustingmygut, be-
causemost timeswhen Ididn’t, it caused
conflict. It alsodoesn’tmean that listening
tomygutwas the easyway, it is almost al-
ways theopposite.Asweget further inour
lives therebecomesmorepropensity for
conflict anddifferences in thoughts, pro-
cesses andopinions.When fostered right
this is a great thing!Nobodyenjoysbeing
wrong, always try to seekmiddle ground,
take time to reflect onwhat youcouldhave
donebetter, sincerely apologize for things
youmissed andmoveon.

MICHAEL BAZEMORE | THINK INSIDE
THE BOX AND OUTSIDE THE BOX

JANIEL OLSONBEGGER | THERE ARE TIMES
WHEN YOU ARE GOING TO GET OVERLOOKED,
NOT HIRED, BYPASSED — DON’T QUIT

Please see Begger, Page 30

Please see Bazemore, Page 29
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Age:39
CompanyandTitle:BigSkySpas,

Owner
Hometown:Vancouver,Washington
Educationand/orBackground:

MountainViewHighSchool andEvergreen
HighSchool, 11-plusyears in thepool and
spa industry.

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? Iwould still be in sales. I
enjoy the salesprocess andall of the rela-
tionships thatgowith it.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?Mythreekids,Kloe,
Maya, andXanderarewhy Idowhat Ido
everyday,but I still like toenjoy time for
myself aswell. I like to spendmysummers
outsideonmymotorcycle, camping,hik-
ing,dirt biking, andexploringbothwith
myfamilyandonmyownand in thewinter
months I like to spendmytimeoffcooking,
and reading. Ihavea soft spot for teenagers
andyoungadultswhoare struggling, and
try tobeamentor asbest as I can for them.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?Workhardernowand

youwill beable tonotworkasmuch later.
Workingharder isn’t theanswer,because
youcan’t outwork issues inbusiness, but
working smarter is theanswer.Does this
meanyoudon’tworkhard, absolutelynot,
sometimesyouareworking reallyhard,
but itmeans thatyoudo theworkmore
effectively.

What advicewould you give a
teenager about success?Nomatter
what anyone says, don’t be afraid to take
the chance and go after it. It’s not going
to be easy, in fact sometimes it will be
really hard, frustrating, and feel like it
will never get easier, but if you keep at it,
it will get better.

What’syourguiltypleasure? I love
jellybeans, andnot just the fancy Jelly
Bellysbut theold fashionedbig jellybeans.
If youputabag in frontofme, Iwill eat
them...All of them.Mykidshave tried to
bribemetogetoutof choresmore than
oncewith them,and ithasworkedonoc-
casion.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve?For

mybusinesspartners, staff, andmyself, I
would love to seeusachieve the statusof
Dealerof theYear.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?By the successesofboth thebusiness
and the staff, andhavinghappycustomers.
Noneof thiswouldbepossiblewithout the
teamandourcustomers.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from?The failureofmyfirstmar-
riagewasahugeeyeopener forme.Still
beingnewtoBillingswithno family, and
very fewfriends, I had toquickly learnhow
to takecareofmyself andmychildrenwith
very little local support. I learnedvery fast
howtoproblemsolveandmultitask. I also
learned the importanceofhaving the right

people inyour life thatyoucancounton.
What is thehardestpartofyour job?

Thehardestpartofmy jobcandefinitelybe
thedecisionmakingprocess.Everydeci-
sionmadeeffects thebusiness, employees,
andcustomers in someway, shape,or form,
sounderstandinghowthosedecisionswill
affect everyone is extremely important.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“TheMightyDucks”onDis-
ney+.Mysonand I startedwith themovies,
andcaughtupon theepisodes together.

What isyour favoritebook?“Take the
Stairs: 7Steps toAchievingTrueSuccess”
byRoryVaden.

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?The
most rewardingpartofmy job is seeingour
customersand family enjoying theirnew
hot tub.This is onepurchase that tends to
bring families together, andgivespeople a
place to relax.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration? I have fourof them.TomStotthas
alwaysbelieved inmeandsupportedme
sincemyfirstday in theworldofpools and
spas.Healwayshasanear andawayofgiv-
ingadvice that is easy tounderstand.Rob
Richardshas taughtmemore than I can
ever thankhimforwhen it comes toowning
ahot tubstoreandbusiness ingeneral.

Age:37
CompanyandTitle:Kampgroundsof

America, Inc.
Hometown:Billings
Educationand/orBackground:B.S.

inMarketing&M.B.A fromtheUniversity
ofMontana

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? Inaworldwithno limits, I
would love tobeaprofessional singer.More
realistically, after a longathletic career, I
haveadeep interest inhownutritionaffects
thebodyand itsoutput. I coulddefinitely
seemyself as adietician inaclinical or
sports-basedsetting. I’d also like toown
myownbusiness.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life? I love to travel andwish I
could spendmore timeexploring theworld.
I havebeen fortunate to spenda lotof time
inEurope throughoutmy life; thoseexperi-
enceshavemademeappreciate learning
aboutnewcultures andplaces.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy? I can’t recall anyone
pieceof advice I’vebeengiven thatwas

objectivelybad. I believe that adviceof all
kinds isultimately anopinionbasedon in-
dividual life experiences.We’re allwalking
different roads, andweneed toconsider the
advicewereceiveandutilize thepieceswe
findvaluable.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Youdon’tneed to
findanyone’sversionof successbutyour
own.What is important toyou?Howdo
youenvisionyour life?Whatbringsyou
joy?Success canbe thebigwins,but it’s
alsoall the smallmoments inbetween.

What’syourguiltypleasure? I have
anot-so-secret love forkaraoke. I also love
live sports—the ticketpricesdefinitely
make that feel like aguiltypleasure.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? I
haveaccomplishedmany things that I am
proudof inmycareer. Iwould like toutilize
myexperienceandexpertiseonanon-
profitboard.Oneof thegreatest thingswe
canaccomplish is givingofourselves and
our strengths tohelpothers.

Howdoyoumeasureyourown

success? Inmywork,nearly everything
is trackable.Success canbemeasured in
videoviews, impressions, revenueand
more.While these thingsare important, I
prefer to focusonhowI feelwhen Igohome
for theday.Whenyou’vegenuinelygiven
yourall, youknow.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from?Mybiggest failurewasaper-
sonal one that taughtmethe importanceof
lettinggoandallowingpeople towalkout
ofyour life if they’remeant to. Itwasagood
lesson thathas servedmebothpersonally
andprofessionally.

Professionally, I hada job that felt all
wrong fromthebeginning. I quit after just
a fewmiserablemonthsand felt like Ihad
givenup.Lookingback, I realize itwasn’t
a failure at all. Instead, I took thecorrect
steps to leavea role andcompany that
wasn’t right forme.Cultureandfitmatter.
Findingwhat’s right foryouandgoing for it
isnever abad thing.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Working inpublic relations, I get theop-
portunity to share lotsof goodnews.But

I also take leadwhen thingsgowrongand
the situation isn’t so rosy.While theyarea
small partofmy job,dealingwith largeand
small crises canbeemotionallydraining.
You’re alsomakingdecisions that canhave
severeconsequences forboth individu-
als and thebrand, so it’s essential tobe
thoughtful and intentional. It’s a responsi-
bility Idon’t take lightly.

Onthe socialmedia sideofmywork,
themost challengingpartofwhat Ido
is alsooneofmyfavorite components.
Socialmedia is constantly evolving.Every
aspect, fromwhatplatformsarepopular to
the typeof content thatperformswell, is

KRISTENEBOGLE | BE SURE
YOU HAVE A GOODMENTOR

SASKIA BOOGMAN | SUPPORT YOUR
PASSIONWITH A STRATEGIC PLAN

Please see Bogle, Page 30

Please see Boogman, Page 30
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Age:39
CompanyandTitle:VP,AgLoanOf-

ficer atStockmanBankofMontana
Hometown:Billings
Educationand/orBackground:El-

ementaryEducation
Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould

youdoinstead? I grewupona ranch in
Brusett,MT. I love spending timeat the
ranch. I’vegot someofmyowncattle that I
runonshareswithmydad.When I started
atStockmanBank Ifigured if I couldn’tbe
at the ranch thatworkingwith farmers/
rancherswas thenextbest thing. I’msure
if Iwasn’t at thebank Iwouldbebackat the
ranch.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?Spending timewith
myfamily. I’manaunt to threenieces and
threenephews. I lovegetting towatch them
growupandseeing themstartparticipating
inall activities!

What is theworstadviceyou’vere-
ceivedandwhy? I’msure therewas some
badadviceout there. If yougetbadadvice
just take it as a learning tool!

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Don’t giveupwhen
somethinggets tough!Youhave toput in
effort and ride through the tough learning
curvesof any job/occupation.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Lately
it hasdefinitelybeenspendingmoneyon
turquoise jewelry!

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve?You
cannevermakeeveryonehappybut Iwould
like tocontinue tobeawell-respected
memberof thecommunityandatwork.

Howdoyoumeasureyourown
success?ByhowI enjoymy job and the
connections that havebeenmade through-
out this industry!Whenyouhave agreat
teamthat youareworkingwith I think
that in turnmakes for a great experience
withyour customers.Hopefully that leads
toyour customersmentioningus thenext
time they are visitingwithothermembers
in the ag industry.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from? Its 100%better tobeupfront
withpeople than tobeat around thebush.
Don’t try toavoid the toughconversations
if theyneed tobehad.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Definitelywhenyouhave tohave the tough
conversationswithyourcustomers.Some
aregoodexperiencesandsomearebad.You

wish theycouldall begreatbut they just
unfortunately aren’t.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?TedLasso- I likehis attitude!

What isyour favoritebook?Notsure
Ihavea favoritebookbut I guess the last
book I readwas“Where theCrawdads
Sing.”

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation? I enjoy
seeing theyoungergenerationcome in
andstart operatingon their own. I’vehad
a fewbank relationships thathave started
with the folks andnowthenextgeneration
isworkingonstarting their ownfarms/
ranchesor takingover thehomeplaces. It’s
reallygreat to see!

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration? I havehadmanymentorsgrow-
ingup.Mygrandparents andparentshave
alwaysbeensuchhardworkers andhave
passed theirworkethicdownto their kids
andgrandkids.As far as at thebank Iwill
givecredit toBrianCooleywhohiredme
hereatStockmanBankasa lender.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby?
Therearea lotof them.Acoupleof thegood
onesare“Liveeachdayas if itwereyour
last”and“Thegrass isn’t alwaysgreener
on theother side”! I thinkpeopleget too
workedupwithwhatotherpeoplehave
goingon.

Whatadvicewouldyougive to
anyonewantingtostartanewbusiness
orexcel inabusinessorfield? Justmake
surewhatyouaredoingmakesyouhappy.
If there is a certain industry that intrigues
you takea job that can teachyouabout that
industry.Then just keepworkingyourway
upand if that eventually leadsyou to start
yourownbusiness, great!

TIERANI BRUSETT |MAKE
SURE WHAT YOU ARE DOING
MAKES YOU HAPPY

Please see Brusett, Page 31

CONGRATULATIONS!
BECKY ANGLIN, DNP, RN

DIRECTOR OF SIMULATION

Your expertise and leadershipmake a tremendous
impact atMontana's firstmedicalschool.

RVU.EDU/MCOM

Montana College of
Osteopathic Medicine
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Age:37
CompanyandTitle:BigSkyEconomic

Development,DirectorofMarketingand
BillingsWorks

Hometown:Ekalaka
Educationand/orBackground:Bach-

elor’sdegree inBusinessAdministration
fromRockyMountainCollege

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead?Havinggrownup in
Ekalaka,Montana, therewasalwaysa lot
ofopportunity tobearoundandcare for
animals. If Iwasn’tdoingwhat I’mdoing
now, I’d love tobeavet.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?Traveling. I havealways
loved traveling,domestically andas I’ve
gottenolder, internationally. I loveexperi-
encingnewplaces, I always feel recharged
and inspiredafter a trip!

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?Theworst advice I
receivedwasalong the linesof“loweryour
expectations, that’snothow itworks.”
That advice struckmeas short-sightedand
unambitious.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Lean intowhatyou
arenaturallygoodat and focusonbetter-
ing thosenatural talents.Weall tend to
focusongettingbetter at the thingsweare
theworst at,which it’s important toget
better in thoseareas,however if you take
that energyandshift it to focusing inand
developing the talentsyouarenaturally
goodat,wow,you’ll beofftoagreat start
tofindingacareer that allowsyou toutilize
those skills.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Reese’s
Sticks-aperfect combinationof aReese’s
cupandKit-Kat,dreamy.

What is one professional accom-
plishment you still want to achieve?
To build BSED’s Better Off in Billings
into a widely adopted brand by the
Billings business community to help
showcase Billings as the vibrant, grow-
ing community that we are to current
and potential residents.

Howdo youmeasure your own
success?The energy that follows the
event or the project or the “thing” you’re

working onwhether it’s completing a few
miles of new fence, completing a proj-
ect, or executing an event, when it goes
well there is always a buzz of energy that
follows, an excitement when reflecting
on the journey and a sense of pride for all
that you did to get it done.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from?What I’vegenerally learned
about failure is that it onlycomesabout
whenyourefuse tofinda lesson inyour
shortcomings.Even if youdidn’t execute
exactly asyouwanted to, youhave the
opportunity to redoubleyoureffortsnext
time, and if youdo that, itwasn’t a failure
at all.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Onlybeingable tobe inoneplaceat a time.
I envyHermioneGranger’s time turner
necklace inHarryPotter.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“Wednesday”onNetflix. I’ma
sucker for theAddamsFamilymovies and
anyTimBurtonmovie/show.

What isyour favoritebook?Profes-
sionally, “ExtremeOwnership:HowU.S.

NavySealsLeadandWin”by JockoWillink
andLeifBabin.

What is themostrewarding/im-
portantaspectofyouroccupation?
Bringingpeople together, buildingconnec-
tionsbetweenothers that sparknew ideas,
programs, relationships, andsuccesses.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/in-
spiration?Myfamily,myparents andmy
littlebrother.Fromayoungagemybrother
and Iworkedalongsideourdad in the
summersbuildingbarbedwire fences.Our
parents trustedus toworkwith themand
build this fencingcompany together.My
parents inspiremebecause they raisedmy

Age:33
CompanyandTitle:BerkshireHa-

thawayHomeServicesFlobergRealEstate
–Realtor

Hometown:Denver
Educationand/orBackground:

GonzagaUniversity-Bachelor’sdegree in
BusinessAdministration

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead?Thedreamwouldbe to
owna food truckandbringColorado-style
Mexican food toBillings.Oneofour fa-
vorite thingsgrowingupwasmakingchili
rellenoswithourgrandma,withgreenchili
of course. If I didownarelleno food truck,
Iwoulddodifferent typesof rellenos to
provideaflare to thedishes.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?Our family loves to travel
and trynewplaces.Wehope tobeable to
takeour twoboys travelingasmuchas
possible as theygrowup.Anotherpassion
Ihave is getting involved in the local com-
munity. In2023, I look forward to serving
on theRonaldMcDonaldHouseboard.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy? I haven’t received
muchadvice that trulywasbadadvice;
however, I’ve learned thatpersonal growth

sometimesmeans recognizing that certain
advicemaynotapplywell tomeormyper-
sonal situation.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?“Fail toplan,plan to
fail.”Myfather always says this tome, even
asanadult. In recentyears, I havedefinitely
realized if youdon’t start outyourdaywith
somesortofplanyouaren’t settingyourself
up for success.Haveaplanandexecute it. It
mightnot turnoutperfect everyday,but at
least youhaveadirection.

What’syourguiltypleasure?S’more
Mix fromCostco.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? I
would like togetmyBroker’sLicenseand
eventuallybeaSupervisingBroker. I have
hadsomewonderfulSupervisingBrokers
throughoutmycareer and Ihope tooneday
beable to sharemyknowledgeandexperi-
encewithother agents.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?Whetherornot aclient feels I pro-
vided themwith thebest servicepossible in
oneof thebiggestdecisions theywill ever
make. I approach real estateprovidingwhat
is in thebest interestofmyclientswhile
maintainingmyownpersonal values.At

theendof theday Iwantmyclients to say
theyhad thebest experiencewhilepur-
chasing theirhomesandenjoyedworking
withme in theprocess.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from? Iwanted togo tonursing
school incollegeandunfortunatelydidn’t
make it throughanatomyandphysiol-
ogy.A lotof thathad todowith“failing to
plan.” Inowknowthat successdoesn’t just
comebyattendingaclass.Success comes
throughstudying, experienceandpractice
ofyourprofession.Youhave tocontinue
to“work”onyourprofessionandfine tune
whoyouwant tobewithin thatprofession.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Mostclients areonlyavailableduring their
non-workhours, so Ioftenhave towork
duringnights andweekendsat the same
timemyhusbandandkidswant to spend
family time together. I amsuper thankful to
haveahusband that supportsmybusiness.
Plus,mostofmyclients endup likingmy
husbandandboysmore than they likeme.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“Ozark”and“WorkingMoms.”

What isyour favoritebook?“GoDog,
Go,PoutPoutFish,”or anyotherbook that
helpsourkidswinddownbeforebed.

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?Getting
people into theirnextdreamhome.
I love lookingathomeswithpeople and
watching theirwholepersonality change
when theyfind“thehome.” It is really
rewarding toknowthatwewereable to
workasa teamtomakeoneof thebiggest
financial decisions theywill evermake.
Evenafter the transaction isover and they
move in I try tocontinue that relationship
withmyclients asmostof thembecome
friends throughout theprocess.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration?Myparents andparents-in-law.

MARCELL BRUSKI | LEAN IN ON
WHAT YOU ARE NATURALLY GOOD AT

ERIKABURKE | FAIL TO PLAN, PLAN TO FAIL

Please see Bruski, Page 31

Please see Burke, Page 31
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Age:36
CompanyandTitle:Sibanye-Stillwa-

ter;EnvironmentalAffairsManager-East
BoulderMine

Hometown:ColoradoSprings,Colo-
rado

Educationand/orBackground:B.S.
ChemicalEngineering;ColoradoSchoolof
Mines

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead?Aftergraduatinguniver-
sity,myfirst jobwasasaproject engineer
inagoldmine inNevada. Itwas there I fell
in lovewith the industryandespecially its
people!Since then Ihaveheldmanyengi-
neeringandsupervisory roles including in:
projects,mineral processingandenviron-
mental.Over theyears,my favorite aspect
of each rolehasbeen theamazingpeople
that Ihavehad theopportunity towork
alongsife. If I couldn’tdo this job, Iwould
want tofinda rolewhere I couldcontinue to
advocate for the sustainabilityof themin-
ing industry.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare

partofyour life?Regardlessof the roles I
havebeen in throughoutmycareer, I have
thoroughlyenjoyed teaching. I ampassion-
ateaboutSTEMeducationandoutreach
especially to thosewhomay initially think
that it is boringor toodifficult.The founda-
tionofWomen inMining (WIM) is edu-
cating itsmembersand thepublicon the
benefitsofminingand theamazingcareers
in themining industry.Oneofmyprimary
reasons for joiningWIMwas tomarrymy
passions forpromotingminingandnon-
traditional careerswithSTEMoutreach.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?That thebestway to
advance inmycareerwas followaprede-
terminedscript. Sooften technical profes-
sionals are told that thereareonlya few
fixedpaths theycan take toadvance.This
is far fromtrue.Bycontrast, it hasbeenmy
personal experience thatbyallowingmy-
self tobeopen todifferentopportunities, I
havebeenable tofindmore fulfillmentand
accumulatedmorebroadexperiences than
if I had followed theprescribedpath.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Theuseofmetrics
ornumericvalues tomeasure successonly
givesyoupartof the story.Toborrowa
popular climbinganalogy, somepeople
start at thebaseof themountainwhileoth-
ers start fromthevalley.While theultimate
goal is tocomplete theclimb, reaching
the summit requires adifferent amount
of time, energyandresources for each
person.Thisonlymakes itmore impressive
when thosewhostart in thevalleyachieve
their goals.That iswhy it is so important
tonevermeasureyourself againstothers
when it comes toyour success.

What’s your guilty pleasure?Mak-
ing a large bowl of homemade popcorn
to enjoywhile watching the Great British
Baking Show! Similarly, I find cook-
ing and baking a great way to de-stress
after a longweek. A hobbywhich usually
results in cookies, bread or cupcakes that
I can share withmywilling co-workers.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? I

would love to seemoreunder-represented
groups, includingwomen, and their allies
becomepartof themining industry toaid
inensuring its sustainability.To this end,
it ismygoal throughbothmycurrent role
atSibanye-Stillwater aswell asWomen in
Mining, tohelpmake themining industry

Age:35
CompanyandTitle:ArchieCochrane

Motors, Inc.Controller
Hometown:Billings
Educationand/orBackground:

Masters inAccountancy,KellerSchoolof
Management.B.S.BusinessAdministra-
tion:Major inAccounting.B.S.Business
Administration:Major inFinance.Minor
inSmallBusiness andEntrepreneurial
Experience

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? If I couldhaveany job, I
wouldwant tobe in the real estate industry.
I love theability to researchhomes, rental
projections, rehabilitationcosts, andhelp-
ingpeoplepurchase theirfirsthomes.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life? I dohaveapassion for
accountingandfinance. I enjoywork-
ingwithcalculationsandhelpingothers
understandhowincremental, consistent
changescanmakea large impact across
their life.Outsideof thefield that Ihave
studied I enjoymyracquetball competi-

tionswithmyclose friendsat theYMCA.
It is alwaysan intensecompetitionwhere
youmightwalkawaywith somebumpsand
bruises, andshowupthenextweek for even
more. I play recreational volleyball, and I
amhappy to say thatour team,“HowISet
YourMother,”wontheFall 2022 recre-
ational volleyball league thatBillingsParks
&Recorganizes. Iwouldplayvolleyball
everyday if Iweregiven thechance.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?“That’s just theway
wehavealwaysdone it.”Theway that
youhavealwaysdonesomethingdoesn’t
mean that it is the rightway, anddoesn’t
mean it is thebestway.Whenyouwant to
achieve something,bigor small, it takesan
approach fromadifferent angle.Wecanall
strive tobebetter, and it is time tobreakout
of themindset thatwhatworkedbeforewill
workagain.Youcando this, and I amhere
tohelp.

Whatadvicewouldyougivea
teenageraboutsuccess? I don’t thinkall
successes shouldbecelebrated inpublic,

putout there for everybody.Sometimes
successes are celebratedandenjoyed
internally, and that isperfectlyfine.Your
life shouldnotbedetailedon the internet
oronsocialmedia.Whenyoufindsome-
thing thatmakesyouhappy, realize it, live
with theknowledgeknowing thatmoment
is somethingyouworkedhard for and
remember thatyouareanamazingperson.
Themoreyouwork for it themoreyouwill
realize that successes comeeasily.Asuc-
cess at 18 isdifferent from30or 50.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Lemon
Oreos. I recently cameacross themand in-
dulge in far toomanyeveryday.Therewas
a shortageofLemonOreos inSeptember
andOctober, and Imissed thecombina-
tionof thecrispy, lemoncookiewith the
creamy, lemonfilling. I amnotnecessarily a
fanof lemontype foods,but thecraving for
a sweet treatwitha satisfyingamountof
lemon-flavoredfillinghits the spot.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve?
Mygoal/accomplishment is topurchase

52homes inoneyear, onehomefor every
week. Ihavea strategyand I amcurrently
workingon thatplan. Ihave told some
people in the real estate industry thatplan
and they laughedat the idea. It isnot far-
fetched, even in today’s real estate environ-
ment, toaccomplish this.

ASHLEY CHANCELLOR | COLLABORATION AND
COMMUNICATION ARE INTEGRAL COMPONENTS OF SUCCESS

SCOTT CICHOSZ |WILL YOUR FUTURE SELF BE HAPPY
WITH THE DECISIONS YOU ARE MAKING NOW?

Please see Chancellor, Page 31

Please see Cichosz, Page 32
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Age:39
CompanyandTitle:AltanaFederal

CreditUnion,BranchManager,Project
ChristmasMiracle,President/Founder

Hometown:GreatFalls
Educationand/orBackground:Bill-

ingsWestHigh
Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould

youdoinstead?Thebestpartofmy job
isworkingwithpeople andhelping them
achieve their goals,whether I’mworking
withmembersor teammatesatAltana.
I learnedhowtobesuccessfulwith the
resources thatwereavailable tomewithout
finishingcollege.We live ina timewhen
college isno longer theonlyprescription for
success, so I’d love toworkwithkids—asa
counseloror speaker—tohelp themnavi-
gate thosechoices.

What other passions/callings are
part of your life? I have two.Mywife
and I have three great kids— two in col-
lege and one in high school. The other is
Christmas. For 10 years I’ve been part of
the Christmas LightMap and each year
my display seems to grow! Two years
agowemoved, and I had two artificial
Christmas trees that didn’t fit intomy

display anymore. I was floodedwith over
200messages from people whowanted
one ofmy trees. That’s the day Project
ChristmasMiracle was born. Our non-
profit was created to help families in need
with Christmas trees and decorations to
help celebrate the holiday season.We’re
on year three.We’ve helped 62 families
in two years. I am guessingwe’ll break
the 100 familymark soon.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?Being told that Ihad
togo tocollege tobe successful. I am living
proof thathardworkanddedicationcanget
you just as far.Youhaveoptionsandcollege
isn’t theonlyone.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Success is great, but
failure isnecessary.Takechances then
learn fromthem.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Video
games. “Call ofDuty”- Imean is therea
better gamethan that?

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve?
I’d love togrowProjectChristmasMiracle
statewideor even take it toanational scale.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-

cess? If I’mhelping tocreate leaders, I feel
successful.Helpingothers reach their goals
makeeverything Idoworth it.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from? I used to thinkdroppingout
of collegemeant I failed,but the reality is
droppingout exposed tomemany,many
jobs, and I learnedsomuch fromall of
them.All of thoseexperienceshelpedme
getwhere I amnowand lookingback, I
wouldn’t changewhat Idideven if givena
secondchance.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Iwearmanyhats atAltana,but if I could
onlywearone, itwouldbe servingmy
teammates.Mybiggest challenge isbeing
deliberate aboutmaking time todo that
everychance Iget, but Ineverquit trying.
ForProjectChristmasMiracle, thebiggest
challenge isnotbeingable tohelpevery
familywhoneeds it.Hopefullywecanget
there someday.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“GameofThrones.”Multiple
times.More recently though, thenew
“UnsolvedMysteries” series.

What isyour favoritebook? Imostly
read leadershipbooks. I’vegottengreat
things fromall of them. I amatruebeliever
thatyouhave tocontinually learnandgrow
inyour role as a leaderofpeople.

What is themostrewarding/im-
portantaspectofyouroccupation?At
thebeginningofmycareer in thefinancial
services industry, itwashelping folkswith
theirfinancialwellbeing. I still love that,
but afternearly 13years, thebest thinghas
nowbecomesupportingmyteammates

Age: 37
CompanyandTitle:FamilyService

Inc.
Hometown:Billings
Educationand/orBackground:Bach-

elor’sofArts,UniversityofMontana
Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould

youdoinstead? I becameextremely
interested incookingat anearly age.While
mybrotherswereawaywithmydad for
basketball tournamentsorfishing trips,
I often stayedhomeand learnedhowto
cookwithmymother.Thirtyyears later, all
things involving foodhavebecomeanear
obsession. If I had it todoall over again, I
would love toattendaculinary institute to
garner theappropriate educationso that I
couldownandoperate a restaurant.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?Mywifeand Ihavebeen
luckyenough to travel theglobe together.
Openingourhearts andourminds to
another’s culturehasbecomeoneof the
greatestpassionsofmy life.Mostpeople
that I knowcan takea familyvacationor

unwindonabeachevery fewyears. I on
theotherhandcannotfight theurge tohop
onaplane to see theworld.Thispassion
hasdeveloped intoanunendingamountof
wanderlust.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?Luckily forme, Idon’t
think that Ihaveever receivedadvice so
bad, that I canpinpoint it as theworst. I
guess Iwould sayanytimesomeone toldme
toquietdown, fall in line, or“actnormal”.
Weareall built sodifferently, andneed
tohaveourownuniqueness shine.Being
anythingother thanmehasnever seemed
likeanoption that Iwant topursue.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Success isn’tmea-
sured in theamountofmoneyyouacquire;
it ismeasuredby thenumberof lives that
youareable to impact.Donot setyourbar
for successparallel toyour social classor
status, but ratherbymerit and reputation.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Simply
put, I love foodanddrink.Tome, cuisine
is like art, youdon’thave todefend it, or

havea rationaleonwhyyou think it is good.
If you like it, that is reasonenough. Ihave
been luckyenough to spend timeeating
mywayacross theglobe.Having said that,
mybiggest guiltypleasure is gas station
food!Whiledriving the state, youwill find
there isn’tmuch tobe found in theculinary
scenebetweenThreeForksandMissoula,
LavinaandGreatFalls besidesgas stations.
I havebecomechickenstrip connoisseur,
anexpert inpizza sticks, andaBoscostick
fanatic.LikeAndrewZimmersays, “If it
looksgood, eat it.”

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve?
WhenIbeganworking in thenon-profit
field, I knewthatmygoalwas tobecomethe
executivedirectorof anon-profitagency.
That is still theaccomplishment that I
wouldmost like toachieve.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?Byhowmany lives I can impact,how
happy I am,andhowIwill be remembered.
Iwakeupeverydaywith the intentionof
makingapositive impactonat leastone

person.Hold thedoor for a stranger, give
someoneacompliment,help feed the
needy…everyactofkindnessgoesa long
way.That, in turn,hasadirect correlation
withhowIhappy I amat theendof theday
andhowIwould like tobe remembered.
I think themorepositivity Iput into the
world, themore successful I am.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from?Notnecessarily a failure, but
awakeupcall.Duringholidaybreak inmy
sophomoreyearof college I foundout Ihad
goneonacademicprobation.Myfather
gavemethebutt-chewingof a lifetime.He
mademeunderstand that itwasn’t that I

RYANCOX | TAKE CHANCES AND LEARN FROM THEM

RYANCREMER | I MEASURE MY SUCCESS BY
HOWMANY LIVES I CAN IMPACT

Please see Cox, Page 34

Please see Cremer, Page 33
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Age:37
CompanyandTitle:First Interstate

Bank,VP/CommercialGroupManager
Hometown:Billings
Educationand/orBackground:Bach-

elor’s inBusinessFinanceatMontanaState
University.

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead?Sincecollege, I’vealways
wanted todoexactlywhat I’mdoing right
now incommercial lending for acommuni-
tybank,buildinga team,andgettingdeeply
ingrained in thecommunity throughbusi-
ness andpersonal connections. I think the
daysofmedreaming toplayprofessional
sports are in the rearviewmirror, but I’ve
always found thecapitalmarkets, private
equity, andattorneyfields fascinating.

Whatotherpassions/callingsarepart
ofyourlife?Myfamilyismymainpas-
sion,mybeautifulwifeBrooke,3-year-old
daughterCoralia,andexpectingnewbabygirl
Mckinliinearly2023.Mygirlsaremylifeand
Ilovewatchingourfamilygrowandexperi-
encingnewadventureswiththem.I’malso
blessedtohavegreatparentsandalittlesister,
aswellasalovingmother-in-lawandmany

ofmywife’ssiblingsandtheirfamiliesinmy
life.Myfriendshavealsobeenlikefamily,and
Iwouldn’tbewhoIamwithoutthem.

Outsideofbeingactively involvedwith
non-profits andserviceorganizations, I just
enjoybeingpartof this great community
andenjoyingall the thingsMontanahas to
offer.Whether it’s golf, hunting,fishing,
skiing,playingmen’s league softball, or
runningup toBobcat football games,we
live in suchanamazingpartof theworld to
experienceahighqualityof life.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy? I honestly can’t think
of any terrible advice I’ve received. I’m
agood listener andat timesmayusebad
adviceor characteristics I observe tohelp
changewhat Ido in the future. I’vebeen
veryblessed tohavegreatmentors inmy
life,manyofwhichhavebeenbosses I’ve
been lucky tohave inmycareer.Myfamily
hasalsoprovidedgoodadviceandallowed
metofindmyownwaywhenneeded.

Whatadvicewouldyougivea teen-
agerabout success? I’d tell a teenager to
embracewhoyouare, don’t be afraid tobe
yourself.At the samepoint, youhave to

learnhowtonavigate the teenageyears,
your 20s, set goals andput yourself in a
position to achieve themby the timeyou’re
30. Speakupwhenyouneed tobut listen-
ing canbemorepowerful.Don’t be afraid
to trynewthings andget outsideof your
comfort zone.Beinguncomfortable builds
character andhelps in identifying thegoals
youwant to achieve in life.

What’syourguiltypleasure? I’d saya
nice thick,medium-rare steakwithaglass
of goodbourbonor redwine.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve?
I thoroughlyenjoymyteamandclients
in the job Ihave rightnow, it’s extremely
rewarding. I do look forward tomanaging
a regionof teams, layingout strategicgoals
andworkingcollectively todominate those
goals, allwhilehaving fun indoing so.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess? I startby lookingatmyfamily every
dayandmakingsure theyarehappyand
healthy. Ifwehave that, I considermyself
tobea successfulman.Obviously, thereare
othermoremeasurablemetricsout there.
I setmygoalsofwhat Iwant toaccomplish

inwhatever Idoprofessionallyorperson-
ally,whether it’s growing loansacertain
percentageora specificgolf score I aim
toshoot.At theendof theday though, I
truly think the relationshipswe form, the
memorieswecreate, and thewayyoumake
people feel is the truemeasureof success.

What failurehaveyou learned the
most from?Being cut fromthe sopho-
morebasketball teamatBillingsWest.The
humility learned, and the friendships and
opportunities I found insteadof basket-
ball helped shapemypriorities in life even
fromanearly age inhigh school.There
havebeen several other failures I’vehad
andhard lessons, just learning fromthem,
tryingnot tomake the samemistake twice,
andcomingawayabetter personhavebeen
invaluable tomeas I’ve gottenolder.

TYLERCRENNEN | FORMRELATIONSHIPS AND
MEMORIES; THAT’SWHAT COUNTS IN LIFE

Please see Crennen, Page 34

Billings Clinic is Montana’s largest health care system.We have excellent career opportunities for both clinically trained and
non-medical professionals. Learn more about our career opportunities at billingsclinic.com/careers.

Congratulations
for being named 40 Under Forty.

Justin Robison
Director of Facility Services

Lacy Tangedahl, NP
Internal Medicine/Medical Oncology
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Age:35
CompanyandTitle:AliciaDonovan

Team@MontanaRealEstateBrokers /
TeamOwner&Realtor

Hometown:Biddle,Montana
Educationand/orBackground:Bach-

elor’sDegree inBusiness (MSUBillings)
Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould

youdoinstead? I’dbea therapist focusing
onchildrenandcoupleswithanemphasis
ondepression, anxiety, shame, andworthi-
ness.Observinghumanbehavior and iden-
tifying theconnections, relationships, and
patternsofour lives is so interesting tome.
Oneof themost influential people inmy
life,KeeDunning,has taughtmeconcepts
thathavechangedmy life in somanyposi-
tivewaysand Iwould love to share them
withothers. Incaseyou’rewondering, they
include:Understanding the importanceof
respect, how important it is tobevalidated,
meetingpeoplewhere theyareandnot
whereyouwant themtobe, askingyourself
“Whatdon’t I know”before reacting, and
backingoutof thepower struggles.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare

partofyour life? I love tohelppeoplewith
theirfinancial goals.Conversationsaround
investing,minimizingdebts, compound
interest, the stockmarket, college savings,
etc.—I love it all!

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?Thevictim is always
morally right,neither responsiblenorac-
countable, and forever entitled to sympa-
thy.Thevictimstance is apowerful one.
Asamillennial, thismentalityhasbeen
engrained intoour society in somanyways.
I’mgrateful for amentalityof extreme
ownership. I learnedearlyon that the
complaints, drama,blaming, andexcuses
haven’t gottenanyonea single stepcloser to
their goalsordreams.

“Youdon’thavea right to thecardsyou
believeyoushouldhavebeendealt.You
haveanobligation toplay theheckoutof
theonesyou’reholding.”

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Loveyourself enough
to setboundaries.Your timeandenergy
arepreciousandyouget tochoosehowyou
use it.You teachpeoplehowto treatyouby

decidingwhatyouwill andwon’t accept.
Lastly, apositivemindset is crucial. Posi-
tivity allowsyouseeopportunities instead
ofobstacles.

What’syourguiltypleasure?There’s
nothing I lovemore thananewpurseor
eating ice creamoutof thecartonwithmy
kids, but I’mnotone to feelmuchguiltwith
these sortsof thing. If I’mallowingmyself
theopportunity tounwind, laugh, anden-
joymyself, that’s goodenough forme.Can
weagree that fun-lovingguiltypleasures
likemine shouldbeenjoyedguilt-free, and
wecanandshouldbeourauthentic selves
without judgment?

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve?
I havemanygoals so it’shard topick just
one!Professionally, obtainingmybroker’s
licenses in2023 ison the list!

Howdoyoumeasureyourown
success?Mydefinitionof successhas
changedover time.At thispoint inmy life
andcareer, success ishelpingpeoplewho
needhelp.Success ishelping restorehope
in someonewhohas lost it. Success isbeing

a rock to someonewhoneedsguidance,
trust, andsecurity.Success is loveand
connectionwithmyhusbandandkids.
Success ishelpingothersgrowto levels they
didn’t thinkwerepossible.Thesinglemost
importantmeasureof success isnot status,
power, orwealth. It’showmuch freedom
youhaveandhowmuch freedomyougive.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from? I don’t think that Iwould
say there is a specific“failure” that Ihave
learned themost from.What I’ve learned
themost fromis theemotional baggage
I carryafterward.Self doubt, regret,
disappointment, andembarrassmenthave

Age:32
CompanyandTitle:VisitBillings,

LeisureMarketing,Sales, andSocialMedia
Manager

Hometown: Jordan,Montana
Educationand/orBackground:Bach-

elor’s andMaster’s fromMontanaState
UniversityBillings

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead?Working in tourism is
tough tobeat.However, I love football, so
I think itwouldbe fun towork for a team,
specifically theGreenBayPackers.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?Myjob is thepassion
andcalling Ididn’t knowIhad.When I
applied for a role atVisitBillings, Iwasn’t
surewhat itwouldentail.As I settled in, I
quickly realized thatworking in tourism
wouldbea lifelongcareer forme. I truly feel
fortunate tobeable toexperienceBillings
as adestinationeachdayandboast about
why it is suchagreatplace tovisit.This
portionofmyrolepairswellwith traveling
thecountryandbuilding relationshipswith
people fromall over theworld,with thegoal
ofbringing themtoourcity. It’s a special

job, and I amsoproud tobeapartof it.
What is theworstadviceyou’ve

receivedandwhy? I thinkadvicegiven
byan individual can tell youa lot about the
personoffering it and their intentions.The
times inmy life Ihave receivedbadadvice,
it’s been in situationswhere thatperson
wasn’t inmycorner.

What advicewould you give a
teenager about success?As a teenager
I remember being asked throughout high
school what I would dowithmy life, and
I knew I needed to go to college, get a de-
gree, and get a job. Later, I found out the
world really isn’t that black andwhite. I
didn’t knowwhat a variety of options the
world had to offer, and I would encourage
teenagers to not be afraid to explore new
opportunities and find their creativity.
When you do, youwill findwhat you are
passionate about, and live amuch fuller
life.

What’syourguiltypleasure? I lovea
nightwatching“BelowDeck”or“Selling
Sunset”withany fried food!

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve?

Iwould love foroneofourcampaigns to
win theUSTravelAssociation’sDestiny
Awards.Wewerenominatedasafinalist
last year.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess? I amaverygoal-orientedperson. I
think it’s important to set goals, but those
goalsdon’thave tobe thesegiant accom-
plishments that takemonthsoryears to
achieve.Forme, if I amsettingandachiev-
ing those smaller goals, then I amsucceed-
ing.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from? I don’t see failures, I see les-
sons. I amthankful tohavehadmany les-
sons thathavehelpedmegrowasaperson
andaprofessional.

What is thehardestpartofyour
job?Myjob is to invitevisitors toenjoyour
beautiful community. It’s sodisheartening
when Ihear about the lackofpride some
ofour localshave inourcommunity.We
aren’tperfect (nocity is) butwehaveamaz-
ing things tooffervisitors and locals alike.
Somanypassionatepeople areworking
hard tomakeBillings evenmore special.
It’sdisappointingwhensomeonechooses

to talkdownonacommunity insteadof
lifting it upandspeaking to thegreatness
it has tooffer. It canhurt thehealthof the
communityand its economy.The incred-
ible attractions, small shops, restaurants,
andbrewerieswehaveall need thevisitor
dollar, too, sowhenwetell a visitorourcity
isn’tworthenjoying ithasamuchbigger
impact thanwerealize.

ALICIADONOVAN | I’M A FIRM BELIEVER IN
NEVER FORGETTING WHERE YOU COME FROM

ALY EGGART | SURROUND YOURSELF WITH
PEOPLE WHO ALLOW YOU TO FAIL AND GROW FROM IT

Please see Donovan, Page 34

Please see Eggart, Page 35
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Age:33
CompanyandTitle:Scheels,Assistant

StoreLeader andStoreLeaderCandidate
Hometown:Billings
Educationand/orBackground:

Bachelor’sdegree inHealthandHuman
Performance.

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? Iwouldprobablybeahigh
schoolhealthandhumanperformance
teacher andcoachhighschool athletics. I
love to teachandcoachpeople.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life? I love spending timewith
myfamily.Beingwithmywife andkidsand
going through this adventurecalled life
together.Myfamily ismyNo.1passionand
priority.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy? Iwasonce toldbya
former leader“If youwant somethingdone
right, youhave todo it yourself.”Thebest
part aboutmy job is thepeople I get towork
witheverydayandhaving theopportunity
towatch themandhelp themgrow inevery
aspectof the job.Thatwouldn’tbepos-
sible if I didn’tbelieveand trustothers to
succeed.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Never stop learning.

It doesn’tmatterhowmuchexperienceor
timeyouhave invested inwhatever it is that
youaredoing.Therewill alwaysbe some-
thingelse to learn thatwill helpyougrow
andachieveyourgoals.

What’syourguiltypleasure? I ama
fanofgoodbeer. I love to trydifferentbeers
fromall over thecountry.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve?
Tograduate theStoreLeaderCandidate
programandbecomeaStoreLeaderwith
Scheels.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?Through the relationships that Ihave
builtwith thepeople aroundme.Asking
myself if I havepositively impacted their
lives andwatching themsucceed in their
ownendeavors.Alsohavingandmaintain-
ing thebestwork/lifebalanceas I canand
tobeable tobewithmyfamilywithout
stressingaboutwork.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?Through the relationships that Ihave
builtwith thepeople aroundme.Asking
myself if I havepositively impacted their
lives andwatching themsucceed in their
ownendeavors.Alsohavingandmaintain-
ing thebestwork/lifebalanceas I canand
tobeable tobewithmyfamilywithout

stressingaboutwork.
What failurehaveyou learnedthe

most from?Beingafraid to fail. For the
longest time Iwas terrified to fail, and for
that reason, Iwasn’t settingmyself up for
successor allowingmyself to reachmy
maxpotential. I havefinally accepted that
it isOKto fail, as longas I learn fromit and
continue togrowasan individual.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
I absolutely lovemy job,whichcanalsobe
thehardestpartofmy job.Thereare times
where Ihaveahard time leavingmywork
atworkandnotbringing ithomewithme.
Whenworking in retail and leading sucha
largenumberof associates, there is always
somestress that comesalongwith it.Man-
aginganddealingwith that stresshas tobe
mynumberonepriority, tomakesure that
I amable tobe thehusbandand father that
myfamilydeserves.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?Thenewest seasonof“Yellow-
stone.”Also I canneverget enoughof“The
Office,” thanks tomywife.

What isyour favoritebook?“The21
LawsofLeadership”by JohnC.Maxwell
and“Hatchet”byGaryPaulsen

What is themostrewarding/im-
portantaspectofyouroccupation? I

lovedevelopingpeople andwatching them
doamazing thingsboth inandoutsideof
Scheels.There isnothingbetter thanhav-
ing theopportunity toworkwithpeople
andwatch themgrowalong theway. I love
seeingwhere theyendupandhearingall
of the things theyaccomplish.Thebonus
is that I end learningandgrowing in the
process through thoseexperiences.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/in-
spiration?Myparents aremygreatest
inspiration.Mydad is thehardestwork-
ingperson Iknowandhas taughtmehow

MATTERICKSON|MYPARENTSAREMYGREATEST INSPIRATION

Please see Erickson, Page 35

CONGRATULATIONS

KAITLIN!
At Montana Psychiatry & Brain

Health Center, we are dedicated
to serving the mental health
needs of children and adults

in our region.

Our Services:
-Psychiatric Evaluation

-Medication Management
-Psychotherapy
-IV Ketamine
-Spravato

-TMS

Montana Psychiatry & Brain Health Center
3737 Grand Ave UNIT 6, Billings, MT 59102

(406) 839-2985
MtPsychiatry.com
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Age:33
CompanyandTitle:DirectorofOp-

erationsatBillingsOb-GynAssociates
Hometown:Billings
Educationand/orBackground:

Pursuingmydegree inHealthcareAd-
ministrationandover 14yearsofwomen’s
healthcare.

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? Iwould lovebeinga
veterinarian. I’vealwaysbeen intriguedon
howanimals loveunconditionally. I also
have interests inbeingaprivatefishing
charter captain. I absolutely love tofish
andwhile living inAlaska for 14years, the
oceanandriversweremypeacefulplace.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life? I trulybelievewomen’s
health ismycalling. I got into thefieldof
medicineat ayoungagewithnoknowledge
of thedirection Iwanted togo. I quickly
fell in lovewith learningwomen’shealth
andhowfascinatingandresilientwomen
canbe.When Idida rotation in theclinic I
worked inREI (reproductive, endocrinol-
ogy, infertility) it solidified this is trulymy
path.Theability tohelp families growand
support families throughsuchadifficult

process ispriceless andmost timescanbe
rewarding.Otherpassions includephotog-
raphy,fishingandhunting.Younever come
homeemptyhandedwhenyou takeaday in
thewilderness. It calmsyour soul and the
memoriesyoumake last a lifetime.

What is theworstadviceyou’vere-
ceivedandwhy?“Youcan’tdo that.” I’ve
never likedbeing told limitationsbasedon
historical viewsandvalues. I grewupwith
brothers andwouldoftenget toldgirls can’t
play sports aswell asboys. Iwas that sister
thatwouldalwaysprove themwrongwitha
smileonmyface.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Developa strong
workethic, staypositive,motivateyourself,
keep learning, acceptwell deliveredcriti-
cism,have funandwhistlewhileyouwork.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Pedi-
cures andmassages.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve?As
clichéas itmaybe, Iwould just like to retire
knowing Igavemycareermyall. Iwould
like tomentor fellowandyoungerhealth-
careworkers tobe thebest theycanbe in
this industry.Beingable to reflecton those

Imentor andsee thempassionateandsuc-
cessfulwouldmeana lot.

Howdoyoumeasureyourown
success?Knowingyourprofessional and
personal corevaluesand livingby them.
Sharing successbymentoringyoungpro-
fessionals inyourfield,having theability to
giveback inameaningful capacity. I believe
it’s extremely important tonot compare
successbyothers.TheodoreRoosevelt once
said“comparison is the thief of joy.”

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from?Questioning if healthcare
is really formeandpursuingbanking. I
quickly foundout thatwasnotmygig!

What is thehardestpartofyour
job?Healthcareoverall is veryhardand
isnotgettinganyeasier since it turned
on itsheada fewyears ago.Thechallenge
withwomen’shealth is that it canbevery
complex.Oftenpatientswill presentwitha
concern, andwewill needadditional test-
ing, imaging, etc. that can result inmore
thanonevisit.This cancause frustration
with today’s societywanting immediate
responses.Patience is avirtue.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“AlaskaDaily.”

What isyour favoritebook? I love
professional growthbooksandbiographies.
The recentbook I read, “Moniqueand the
MangoRains”hadagreatperspectiveon
Africanmidwiferycare.

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?Taking
careofwomenand families inourcom-
munity. I truly enjoyall aspectsofwomen’s
healthbuthaveaniche for fertility care.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration? I’vebeen incrediblyblessed tobe
able toworkalongside some incrediblephy-
siciansand leaders inAlaskaandBillings.

Age:33
CompanyandTitle:Owner/Bro-

kerofNorthAcreRealEstate;Ownerof
Billings365.com;Presidentof theBillings
AssociationofRealtors 2023

Hometown:Billings
Educationand/orBackground:BAof

UniversityofNebraska;RealEstateBrokers
Designation,SupervisingRealEstateBro-
kersDesignation.

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? Iwouldgoback to school
andbecomeaprofessor. I loveempowering
others to liveout theirdreams.Plus, the
food incollege towns is epic.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?Beforehavingkids,my
passionwas traveling.Afterhavingkids,
mypassionhasbeen raising themtoap-
preciate theworldaroundus.As theygrow
up, Ihope to integrate the twoeverychance
Iget!

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy? Iworkedat aFortune
500companyrightoutof college.Thead-
vice frommysupervisors andco-workers
wasalways to followtheplan laidoutby
otherpeople. I likedmyownplansbetter.
Sometimes it is better to followyourown

instincts.
Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-

ageraboutsuccess? I used toviewsuccess
as the standards that society set. Success is
somethingyouhave todefine foryourself.
Atdifferentpoints in life successwill look
different. In the interim,helpothers suc-
ceedeverychanceyouget.

What’syourguiltypleasure?OhI
havea few...lattes all day, cookies, books
uponbooks, anda littlebit of realityTV.Oh
and lookingat real estate ineverycity I go
to....mypoorhusband.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? I
hope toputa female student fromanau-
thoritariancountry throughcollege. Iwant
to seegirls fromall over feel as empowered
as Ido.

Howdoyoumeasureyourown
success?Throughmyrelationshipswith
others and feeling like I amcontributing to
otherpeople’s goals andsuccesses.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from? I’ll spare thedetails but I once
thought I couldconquer theworldonmy
own. I learnedhavinga support system is
notnegotiable andhavebeenbuilding it out
ever since.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
The things I cannotcontrol...like the rising
interest rates affectingmyclients’ buying
power,

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“TedLasso.”

What isyour favoritebook?That is
an impossiblequestion! Ihave20onmy
nightstand I amreading rightnow. I love
motivational books likeAtomichabits and
historicalfiction like thebookOutlander.

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?Helping
familiesfindahomenevergetsold.The
confidence I seewhen theyobtain sucha
milestone is everything.Ahome is sucha
vital pieceof everyone’s life and it feels so
wonderful tobeapartof this.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration?Mymom.She’s alwayshadmy
back.Herconsistencyandunconditional
love is something I strive toemulate every
day.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou live
by?“Behappywithwhatyouhavewhile
working forwhatyouwant,”HelenKeller.
And,“Gratitude is thekey tohappiness,”
C.S.Lewis

Whatadvicewouldyougive toany-

onewantingtostartanewbusinessor
excel inabusinessorfield? Identifyyour
team.Youmightbe the leaderbutyouwill
not excelwithouthelp fromothers.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-
cess? I think itwouldbecool if I said“from
the rear-viewmirror”buthonestly I too
oftendismissmysuccesseswhiledwelling
onmyperceived failures.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/
hobby?Travelinganywhere,warmbeach
preferred.Gettingquality timewith family
and friends.Nestling inwithagoodbook.

What’s thegreatestgiftyoueverre-
ceived?Why?Beforehedied,mygrandpa
tookmyhusband (newboyfriendat the
time)out topickabouquetofwildflowers
which theypresented tome inanoldcoke
bottle. Itwasa sweetgesture fromtwoof
myfavoritemen.

JAMIEFESSENDEN |ATTITUDE IS EVERYTHING

LIZ FRANCIS | BE HAPPY WITH WHAT YOU
HAVE WHILE WORKING FORWHAT YOUWANT

Please see Fessenden, Page 35
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Age:39
CompanyandTitle:RiverstoneHealth,

AssociateDirectorofMontanaFamilyMedi-
cineResidency

Hometown:Belgrade,Montana
Educationand/orBackground:M.D.,

SchoolofMedicine,UniversityofNorthCar-
olinaatChapelHill,August 2006-May2016;
Ph.D.,Cell&MolecularPhysiology,Univer-
sityofNorthCarolinaatChapelHill,Aug
2008-May2013;M.S.,CellandMolecular
Biotechnology,WashingtonStateUniversity,
July2005-June2006;B.S.,Biochemistry,
GeneticsandCellBiology,WashingtonState
University,Aug2001-May2005.

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwouldyou
doinstead?Iwouldhavepursuedaposition
asalabscientistorbotanist,eitherinaca-
demiaorindustry.Icouldalsoimaginebeing
alibrarianorafoodtruckchef,butIspared
folksfrommycookingskills.

Whatotherpassions/callingsarepart
ofyourlife?I lovelearning.Ispendfartoo
muchtimewatchingdocumentariesonhis-
tory,economics,andtechnology.Myfamilyis
alsoveryimportanttome.Ienjoyspendingas
muchtimewiththemasIcan.

Whatistheworstadviceyou’vere-
ceivedandwhy?“Youcandoorhaveitall.”
Butyoucan’t.It’simpossibleandimprac-
ticable.Therearelimitations.Thisadvice
generatesunrealisticexpectationsandleads
todisappointment.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateenager
aboutsuccess?Modeledaftermyfather’s
wisdom,“Getgoodgrades.”Itissimple,
practical,andgoal-oriented.Itservedmeasa
cornerstoneforsuccessincollegeandmedical
school.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Playing
computergames,andicecream.

Whatisoneprofessionalaccomplish-
mentyoustillwanttoachieve?Iwould
beenthusiasticforanopportunitytoserve
asanactiveleaderinthedevelopmentand
transitionofBillingsintoacohesivemedical
educationhub.

Howdoyoumeasureyoursuccess?
Twomeasures:objective(patient-oriented
outcomes)andsubjective(patientfeedback
aboutmybedsidemanner).Thesuccessofthe
partislimitedbythewholehowever,asIam
acoginalargermedicalecosystem.Ittakesa
villageofdedicatedmedicalprofessionalsto

supportourentirecommunity.
Whatfailurehaveyoulearnedthe

mostfrom?Myfirstandonly“D”onacol-
legeEnglishcompositionpaper.Arevelation
asIrealizedtheworldisfullofpeoplewith
skillsandgiftsbeyondmyown.Ihadtostep
upmygameandworkhardertoachievethe
samesuccessthatcamenaturallytoothers.

Whatisthehardestpartofyourjob?
Thesufferingofpatients.Madefarworse
whenit’snofaultoftheirownbutthepolitical
orfinanciallimitationsofthesystem.

Whatwasthelastshowyoubinge-
watched?“Heartstoppers”onNetflix.

Whatisyourfavoritebook?TheEx-
panseseries,especially“Abaddon’sGate.”

Whatisthemostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?WhenI
connectwithpatientsandsupportthemin
realizing,achieving,andlivingtheirgoalofan
improvedqualityoflifethroughmedicine.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspira-
tion?Myfather.HepassedawaywhenIwas
10fromcoloncancer.Heforeverchangedmy
life.Hewastheinspirationformycareerin
medicine.

Doyouhaveamottoyouliveby?Ina

worldwhereyoucanbeanything,bekind.
Whatadvicewouldyougivetoanyone

wantingtostartanewbusinessorexcelin
abusinessorfield?Becurious,takeinitia-
tive,workhard,sticktoit,andsurroundyour-
selfwithateamsmarterthanyourself.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuccess?
MuchdifferentlythanwhenIwasyounger!
Failureandsuccessaretwosidesofthesame
coin.Conceptsonlythatserveasstepping
stonesonlife’sjourneytoabetterself,career,
andfuture.

Whatdoyoudoforfun/relax/hobby?
Read,cuddlewithourdogTeddy,andwatch
TVwithmyhusbandBrent.

What’sthegreatestgiftyouever
received?Why?Myengagementring!Itwas
anunexpectedsurprisethatforeverchanged
mylifeforthebetter.Oneofthegreatestgifts
istohavesomeonebyyoursideforlife’scrazy
joyride.

JAMESDENISAR-GREEN: IN A WORLD
WHERE YOU CAN BE ANYTHING, BE KIND

2905 Millennium Circle
Suite 8

Billings, MT 59102

and all 40 Under 40 Winners from
Big Sky Spas!

Kristene Bogle

Congratulations Erika on the achievement!
We can’t wait to see where
the next 40 years lead you!

-Your friends and co workers at

©2023 A member of t e sys

Your friends and co-workers at...

the franchise system of BHH Affiliates, LLC.

Congratulations,Congratulations,

Ryan!Ryan!

Thank YOU for helping
Family Service prevent
hunger, homelessness
& poverty in our
community.

BillingsFamilyService.org
406.259.2269
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Age:22
CompanyandTitle:BillingsCham-

berofCommerce,BusinessDevelopment
Manager

Hometown:Laurel
Educationand/orbackground:Lin-

colnCenter
Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould

youdoinstead? I knowthisquestion is
askedaswhat Iwoulddo instead,however,
Idonotbelieve that there isanythingelse I
wouldratherdo. IhavemydreamjobandI
amso incredibly thankfulandhappywith
where Iamat. Ihave theopportunity to
help,watch,andconnect somanyorganiza-
tions in thiscommunity thriveandprosper.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?People andcommunity
ismypassion. I always say Imightnot
knowhowtodoeverything,but Ipromise
I canconnectyouwith the rightperson.
Youcan’t forgetgolf.Golf is thegreatest
thingnext to toastedbread.Theamountof
networkingandconnectionsyoucanbuild
onagolf course isonce ina lifetime.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?Youare still soyoung,
slowdown,youhaveplentyof time.This is

theworst advice Ihaveeverbeen told. I am
suchastrongbeliever that everythingyou
doasayoung individual ispavingyour road
in the future.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess? Inthefamouswords
ofMasterOogway,“Yesterdayishistory,to-
morrowisamystery,buttodayisagif.That
iswhyit iscalledthepresent!”Treatevery
daylike it isyourlastandmakethemostof it.

What’syourguiltypleasure? I prob-
ablygolfway toomuch.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? I
would like tobecomeapublic speaker/mo-
tivational speaker foryoungprofessionals
going into sales.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?Bybecoming 1%better everyday.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from?Relationships.Personal and
working.Noteverybodysees the sameas
yourself, butunderstandinghowothers
workandcreatinga relationshipon the
understandingofbothparties

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Thedeskwork. I amapeopleperson. Iwant
theopportunity tobuild connectionsand

meetasmanypeople as I can.
Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-

watched?“Yellowstone.”
What isyour favoritebook?The“Go-

Giver”byBobBurgand JohnDavidMann
What is themostrewarding/im-

portantaspectofyouroccupation?
Knowing that I amgivingopportunities
toorganizations small and large to thrive,
grow,andprosper in this amazingcommu-
nity Iwill call home forever.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/in-
spiration?MyGrandfatherDarwin is

mygreatestmentor.Mygrandfatherhas
shownmepatience,hardwork, ethics.He
has shownme it is important to stand true
toyourmorals andself codeevenwhen it is
easiest to strayawaystay true toyourword.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby?
“Never tellme the sky’s the limit,when
thereare footprintson themoon!”

Whatadvicewouldyougive toany-
onewantingtostartanewbusinessor
excel inabusinessorfield?Alwaysbe
willing to learnandgrow. It is okay tobe
vulnerable andaskquestionswhenyoudo
notknow.Most importantly,networkand
alwaysbegenuinewitheveryconnection
youbuild.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-
cess?Failuremeansyou’re trying. If you
fail 100 timesandsucceedonceyouareon
the right track.To fail is to succeed Ibelieve
wholeheartedly.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/hob-
by? I have said it a fewtimesbut I lovegolf-
ing.Spending timewithmybeautifulwife
andmydoggosmeans somuch tome.

What’s thegreatestgiftyouever
received?Why?Thebestgift I haveever
receivedwas the“Go-GiverBook!”

Age:33
CompanyandTitle:PegHospitality

Group-AreaDirectorofSales
Hometown:Siletz,Oregon
Educationand/orBackground:AA

HospitalityManagement
Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould

youdoinstead?Honestly,mypassion is
andhasalwaysbeenhospitality ever since I
was 15.Anytime I’veever looked for anoth-
er careeropportunity I’vealways reverted
back towhat I lovedoing themost.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life? I immensely enjoy
volunteeringwithSpecialOlympics
Montana.Thehotel group that I’mapart
of,wevolunteerduring the trackandfield
inApril, and Ivolunteermytimebeinga
UnifiedPartnerwithgolf inMayandhave
alsohelpedcoachbasketball during the
Fall.HowIstarted inSpecialOlympicswas
watchingmysister grow intoherownath-
leticismwhile shewasapartofbasketball,
softball, bowlingandswimming.Watching
theseathletes cross afinish line,makea
basket andsinkaputt is truly thebest gift
that I canever receive.

What is theworstadviceyou’vere-

ceivedandwhy?“Yourhighschool years
will be thebestonesofyour life.” I loved
highschool, loved the friendships Ibuilt,
the school activities andsports, but life
graduallygetsbetter after graduating. I’m
inmythirties and I’mthriving!

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?“Howeverdifficult
lifemayseem, there is always something
youcandoandsucceedat it.”-Stephen
Hawking

What’syourguiltypleasure?Costco
hotdogs.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? I
would like togoback to school andgetmy
bachelor’s inhospitalitymanagement.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess? I value feedback frommypeers and
management team. I set goals for the team
and if theyaremotivatedbycommunica-
tionand thecorrectdirection then that says
that theyare thriving in their current role.
Ifmyteams thriving, soamI.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from? In thepast, being impatient
inmywork life andpersonal lifehasgotten
thebetterofme. Ithasmadememakehasty

decisionsbefore,whichcloudedmyvision
andpreventedme fromenjoying thepres-
ent.Now, I take the time tobreathe, take in
themomentandfigureout the solution.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Managinga teamandthedifferentperson-
alitieswithina team.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“Wednesday.”

What isyour favoritebook?“When
BreathBecomesAir.”

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?Creat-
ingavision that aclienthasandmaking the
eventalive.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/in-
spiration?Myparents.Theygaveus the
best life that theycouldgiveus.Theywere
selfless andadopted fourof their great
nieces andnephewandalteredour lives for
thebetter.Theycoachedus throughour
adolescentyears,were strictwhen itwas
neededandcontinue to loveandsupportus
ineverywaypossible.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby?
“Dogood.”

Whatadvicewouldyougive to
anyonewantingtostartanewbusiness

orexcel inabusinessorfield?Take the
time to learnandknowthebusiness.Build
the rapportwithclientswhichwill endwith
long lasting relationships.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-
cess?Whenfailingormakingmistakes,
you take that and learn fromtheexperi-
ence,which then transforms into succeed-
ing.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/
hobby? I love takingdrives tobeautiful
destinationswith road trip snacks.Love to
golf in the springtimeandNetflixandchill
withmywife.

What’s thegreatestgiftyouever
received?Why?Finding the loveofmy life
who lovesme formeandhasalwaysbeen
supportivewithmycareer andhasalways
beenmypersonal cheerleaderwhen Ineed
it themost.

ISIACHAMMER | ALWAYS BE WILLING TO LEARN AND GROW

MONIQUE LANE-HARASYMCZUK | TAKE
TIME TO LEARN AND KNOW THE BUSINESS
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Age:36
CompanyandTitle:MontanaMuscle

Movers,CEOandWorldwideExpressLo-
gistics,MajorAccountExecutive.

Hometown:Tualatin,Oregon.
Educationand/orBackground:

WesternOregonUniversity:Bachelor’sof
Science inHealthandHumanBiology

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? Iwouldbeaphotogra-
pher. I plan to stayonmycurrentpath for a
while, but I knowIwill beaphotographer in
oneofmyfuturechaptersof life.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life? I lovecooking, reading
wheneverpossible and travelingasoftenas
I can.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy? If it’snotbrokedon’t
fix it!Well itmightnotbebrokenbut that
doesn’tmean it’sworkingaswell as it
shouldor that it (whatever IT is) couldn’tbe
optimizedor improvedupon.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Learneverything.
Anyopportunity to learnanewskill, take
it! Start reading (audible counts) andcom-

mitting topersonaldevelopmentnow,and
watch the trajectoryofyour life change.
Youwill be lightyears aheadofyourpeers if
you implement thisonehabitnow.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Online
shopping. It doesn’t getmuchbetter than
checkingeverythingoffyour listwhile
avoidingcrowdsand lines, amI right?

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? It’s
hard topick justone.Weplan toopenaset
of storageunits forMuscleMoversclients in
thenear future (stay tuned) andexpandour
serviceofferingsaroundBillings.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?WhenIamable tohonormypriori-
tiesbothathomeand inworkat apace that
is challengingbutnot stressful; that’s the
sweet spot! If at theendof theday, Ihave
given itmyall atworkand I amable tocook
myfamilydinner andspendquality time
connectingwithmykidsandhusbandand
showupconsistently andauthentically;
nowthat’s success.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from? I don’tbelieve in failures. I
believe if somethingdidn’tworkouthow

youwanted it to thenyoureceived themost
valuable feedback, experience.Don’t let
theattemptbeawaste, let it guideyourap-
proach fornext time.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Beingpulled in somanydirectionsat the
sametime, and itnever stops.Asa small
businessowner, I get anotificationonmy
phoneevery three seconds; anewemail,
missedcall, text, socialmedia comment,
voicemail etc. and it is 24hoursaday (I

wish Iwasexaggerating). Itwill driveyou
mad if you let it. I have toaccept that I am
justonehuman, justone. I candoanything
butnot everything, ashardas that is to
admit sometimes.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?Myhusbandand I started“The
BigBangTheory”when Iwasonmaternity
leave. It’snowahousehold favorite!

What isyour favoritebook? I have
many!Most recently anythingwrittenby
MelRobbins; “The5SecondRule” isoneof
myfavorites.

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?Helping
others achieve something theywereunable
todo themselves.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/in-
spiration?Mygrandmother,Karen.She
was thehardestworker andkindestperson
youhaveevermet simultaneously.Tobe
aroundherwas to feel loved times three.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby?
Don’t accept criticismfromanyoneyou
wouldn’t seekadvice from.

TARAKIRSCHENMANN |MAKE SURE THE LIFE
YOU’RE SEEKING SUITS YOUR LIFESTYLE AND GOALS

Please see Kirschenmann, Page 35
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Age:29
CompanyandTitle:Westernand

wildlife artist
Hometown:Billings
Educationand/orBackground:Bach-

elor’s inart, bachelorof science inbiology,
andaminor inpsychology fromRocky
MountainCollege.

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? I neverplanned tobe-
comeaprofessional artist, but Ididplan to
practicemedicine. Incollege, I tookall the
prerequisite courses formedical school,
and IwasacertifiedEMT,CNA,andphle-
botomist. Iwouldn’t changemycurrent
professionasanartist for theworld,but if I
hadnotdiscoveredmypassion for art, I am
certain that Iwouldbeaphysician today.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?Mybiggestpassion is
betteringmycommunity, so Iutilizemy
artistic ability tobeautify someofBillings’
mostneglected spaces. I amalsopassionate
abouthorses, rodeo,hunting, the livestock
andagriculture industries, andMontana’s
wildlife. I serveon theboardofdirectors
for theMontanaProRodeoHall andWall of
FametohelphonorourWesternheritage,
aswell as raisemoney for scholarships for

Montanahighschool rodeoathletes tohelp
ensure the futureof the sportof rodeoand
theWesternwayof life.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?Topursuemoney, cre-
ateart that sells, andbe likeother artists. I
have themost successwhen I create from
myheart andsoulbecausenotonlydoes
makesmehappiest, but theviewers can feel
myemotionandconnectwith thework.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Don’t compareyour-
self toothersbecauseeveryonehas their
owntimeline, their ownstory, and their
ownversionof success.Workhard,never
giveup, andpursueyourpassion.

What’syourguiltypleasure? I am
hopelessly addicted tocoffee.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve?
Oneofmygoals is towrite andpublisha
bookaboutmy life, experiences, andmy
journeyasanartist. It hasbeenawild ride!

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?Tome, success is achieving thegoals
I set formyself,makingapositive impacton
mycommunity, knowing that Ihavegiven
mybest effort inall that Ido, andbeing
contentwithwhere I amandwho Iam.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from?WhenIwasa freshman in
highschool,myteacherdrewangry faces
onmydrawings, and I struggledwithmy
grade in theclass.The failurewasneither
myworknormygrade,but that I stopped
creatingartuntil Iwas required to takean
art class incollege. I learned that criti-
cismdoesnotdefineme,mywork,ormy
success, but it provides feedbackandan
opportunity togrow.Noteveryonewill like
youandyourwork, andwhile thatmaybe
difficult, it’s okay. It justmakes it evenmore
specialwhensomeone falls in lovewith
yourwork.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
WhenIwasfirst startingoutas aprofes-
sional artist, thebiggest challengewas
promotingmyself andsellingenoughwork
tomakea living.Nowthat I ammoreestab-
lished, themostdifficultpartofmy job is
timemanagement. It is a challenge tocreate
public art, remain involved in thecommu-
nity, anddisplayandsellmywork, allwhile
constantlyproducingnewand inspired
worksoffineart.While it has takena lot
ofhardworkandperseverance, I amvery
fortunate tobeable tomakea livingdoing
what I love.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched? I rarelywatchTV,butwhen Ido,
it’s a truecrimedocumentary!

What isyour favoritebook? I canonly
narrow itdowntomytop three: “TheBig
Sky”byA.B.Guthrie, Jr., “TheDaVinci
Code”byDanBrown,and“TheSilenceof
theLambs”byThomasHarris.

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?Mak-
ingan impactonpeoples’ lives!When I

Age:37
CompanyandTitle:St. John’sUnited,

ClinicalLaboratoryManager
Hometown:Hardin
Educationand/orBackground:BS

Biology,MinorChemistrywithClinical
LaboratoryScienceOption

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead?BeingaMedicalLabora-
toryScientist is thebigcareer change inmy
life! I changedmycareerpath to laboratory
sciencewith thegoal of showcasing the
valueofdiagnostic testingand the impor-
tanceofhighly trained laboratorians.Post-
retirement theplan is towaterflowersat a
greenhouseor learnhowtobeabarista.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?Promoting the roleof
laboratoriansandscience inourcom-
munity. I’veparticipated inavarietyof
community-basedeventspromotingSTEM
includingGirls-in-Science,MagicShows,
ScienceFairs, andcareerdays.Science is
important and there is thismisconception
thatonlybrainiacs are capableof science-
basedcareers.Themedical community is
full of careers thatmosthaveneverheardof
including: lab scientists, radiology techni-
cians, cytology technicians, embryologists,
histologists, respiratory therapist, bio-
medical engineers, technology informatics,

dataanalytics, andsomanymore.Medi-
cinehasaplethoraof careerpaths.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?“Bepatient andgood
thingswill come,” is theworst advice I’ve
ever received. Iprefer toactivelyprepare for
andseekout thegood in life. It isup tometo
makeawonderful life formyself.Whywait
for someone tobringyouroseswhenyou
cangrowyourowngarden?

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Success is amindset
thatyouset foryourself.Youwill never feel
satisfiedchasingotherpeoples’ ideasof
success.Bighouse, fancycars, and job titles
arenotnecessary tohaveaworthwhile life.
It is soeasy togetwrappedupdisplaying
your importance to theworld.Thepeople
inour society that aremakingmeaning-
ful impacts areoften those that choosea
simple lifestyle.Youcanbesuccessful in an
entry level jobormowing lawnsevery sum-
merbecause it setsyouup for thenext step
inyour life. I haveacquiredcrucial life skills
as awaitress,CNA,and IT tech that Iuse in
mycurrent role.Graduatehighschool then
findapassionandpursue itwithvigor!

What’syourguiltypleasure?Espresso
andcollectingart supplies.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? I

amcurrentlyworking towardsacertifica-
tion inPathology Informatics.Long termI
would like tocontinue tocultivate skills to
formulate a sustainable laboratory inun-
traditional settings to increaseaccessibility
toquality testingoptions.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?Success is about feelinggood inyour
ownskinandstandingbehindyourchoic-
es.Somethings thatmakeme feel success-
ful aremeetinggoals that are challenging,
cominghometoa family full of laughter,
and feelinghealthy.Success extendspast
excellingat aparticular job function. I feel
like Ihaveconqueredsomanymountains
inmy life ranging fromhealthproblems
topoverty. I havehadamillionexcuses to
giveupandcoast through life, but I chose
todo thehardwork. I feel like I’mexactly
where Ineed tobe in lifewhich inmybook
is success!

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from? I failedmyself by trying tofit
into jobs thatdidnot showcasemytalents.
It’s aggravating to feel underappreci-
atedandunskilled.Years later Ihave the
privilegeofhindsightbutgoing through it
I remember feeling like Iwouldneverfind
myplace in theworld.Every time I felt like I
wasatmy lowestpoint Iwould set analarm
andwakeup thenextdaywithpurpose.

Thatpurposedrovemeback tocollegeand
intoafield that feels likehome.Somany
things thatmademe feelweirdarenowas-
sets inmysuccessplan.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
I try to respect everyone’spointofview
about theCovid-19pandemic.Oneof the
hardest things I’veeverhad todo is return
toworkafter a familymemberpassedaway
fromCovid-19andbeconfrontedbyseveral
angrypatient rantingaboutCovid-19
beingahoax.Maintainingaprofessional
demeanorwhilekeepingcomposurewas
immenselydifficult. I cried inabroom
closetduringmy lunchbreak thatday.
Covid-19hasbrought to light a lotof issues,
but I think it’s important tobe respectful

ELYSSA LEININGER | DO IT WITH PASSION, OR NOT AT ALL

MYLINDA LOVELL | YOU CAN DO HARD THINGS!
Please see Leininger, Page 35

Please see Lovell, Page 36
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Age:39
CompanyandTitle:EideBaillyBOS

(BusinessOperatingSystem)Manager

Hometown:Billings

Educationand/orBackground:Mas-
ter’s inaccountancy

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? I’vealwayswondered
howitwouldbe todosomethingmore
mechanical. Probably something in the
automotivefield.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?The ideaof taking some-
thing that isn’t andmakingsomething that
is. I enjoyworkingonworndownvehicles
andbringing themback to life.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?Dosomething that is
secure.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Don’tbeafraid to
take risks.Failure isnot abad thing.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Watch-

ingvideosonMotorTrend forhoursonend.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve?De-
sire tohave independence inmywork life.
Continue to serveona teambut tobecome
more secure inmyautonomyandposition
on the team.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?Success isbasedon influence.The
level of influence Ihavewithpeople Iwork
with,withmyfamilyandwithmyfriends.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from?Not takingmore risks.As
mostpeople, Ifindmyself pursuingwhat
ismorecomfortable rather thanwhat is
uncomfortable.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Meetingeveryexpectation.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“RoadworthyRescues.”Notmy
favorite showbut it is the lastone Ibinge-
watched.

What isyour favoritebook?“Some-

howIManage.”

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?Getting
tohelppeople inaway thatbuildsvalue
into their lives.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/in-
spiration? I don’thaveagreatestmentor.
Thereare threepeoplewhohavehelpedme
atdifferent stagesofmy life. Iworkedona
tree farm inBozemanduringcollege.She
was theepitomeofhardworkpayingoff.
There is alsoapartner atEideBaillywho
hashelpedguideme inmyprofessional
pursuitsbyprovidinghonest andhelpful
feedback.The lastonewouldbemybest
friend.Hehaspushedmetopursue things I
wouldn’thaveonmyown.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby?
If youcan’t stop thinkingabout it, don’t
stopworking for it andalwaysfinda reason
to laugh.

Whatadvicewouldyougive to
anyonewantingtostartanewbusiness
orexcel inabusinessorfield?Finda

balanceofpassionandprovision.That in-
cludesbecomingcomfortablewith failure
and risk.Findamentor anddon’tbeafraid
to take risks.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-
cess?Failure isnot takingchancesand
success is continuing to takechanceseven
afteryou’ve failed.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/hob-
by? I likeoutdoor recreation.Off-roading,
4-wheeling, camping.Road tripswithmy
family.

What’s thegreatestgiftyoueverre-
ceived?Why?Thenewswhen I foundout
mywifewaspregnant. I’vealwayswanted
tobea father.

ADAMMALLOY | SUCCESS IS CONTINUING TO
TAKE CHANCES EVEN AFTER YOU’VE FAILED

ONGRATULATIONS,
TIERANI! TOP 40

UNDER FORTY

Member FDIC | Equal Housing Lender

ONGRACONGRA

TIERANI BRUSETT
VP, AG LOAN OFFICER
BILLINGS KING AVENUE

Montana’s Brand of Banking

Stockman Bank is
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Age:25
CompanyandTitle:StockmanWealth

Management-DeputyChief Investment
Officer

Hometown: Laurel
Educationand/orBackground:

Bachelor’sdegree ineconomicsandfinance
-CharteredFinancialAnalyst charter-
holder.

Ifyoucouldn’tdothiswhatwould
youdoinstead? Iwould love towrite
books. I’vealwaysbeenanavid reader and
believe there is somuchpower inbooks
andstorytelling. Iwouldverymuch like to
sit downsomedayandsee if I couldcreate
something forothers toenjoyand learn
from.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life? I feel verypassionate
aboutmany things, but tohighlightone
specificallywouldbemusic. I don’thave
any inklingofmusical talentmyself, but
I lovewhatmusicdoes forus.Music can
bringpeople together.Music canhold
memories forus.Musicbrings the joyoutof
us. I indulge inmusic toextreme (probably
annoying) levels, but I think it truly is an

amazing thing.
What is theworstadviceyou’ve

receivedandwhy?The idea thatonce
you’vegraduatedhighschool, or college,
orgraduate school, etc., thatyouaredone
learning.Formal educationdoesnotmark
theendof the learningexperience forus
hereonEarth.Learning is a lifelongexperi-
ence, and Iwouldencourageall to continue
to learn throughout life andnot fall into the
trapof thinking learningendswhen formal
educationends.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Don’t let society
determinewhat success looks like foryou.
Success exists inmanyareasof life: career,
family, friendships,health, andmany
more.Decide foryourselfwhat is impor-
tant toyouandwhatyouwant foryour life.
Thenmeasureyour successbasedonwhat
you’vedefined foryourself anddon’t com-
pareyourself toothers.Success isdifferent
for everyoneofus, andwhenyoureachone
goal, set another.Never settle.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Moose
Tracksandamovie (“TheSecretLifeof
WalterMitty”nevergetsold).

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? I
want tocontinue togrowpersonally inmy
career, helpothersgrow in theirs, andcon-
tributemeaningfully to thecommunity. I
believeall of that canbeaccomplishedwith
the rightmindset andworkethic.What the
futureholds exactly I amnot sure, but I am
confident that the right thingswill come in
due time.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess? I take time to reflecton thegoals I

have setpersonally andprofessionally, as
well ason themanthat Iwant tobe. If I am
consistently acting inways that alignwith
myvision(s). I tend toviewthat as success.
Success is adynamicprocess and I strive
tobebetter eachday, taking time to reflect
on thatprocess allowsmetoseewhere I am
makingprogress,where Imightbe lacking,
andadjust accordingly.

What failureshaveyou learnedthe
most from?Failure is aguarantee in life.
Failure isultimatelymore important than
our successesbecause theyareguaranteed
tohappenandallowus to learnandbecome
better for them. I can’tpickanyspecific
failure tohighlight, because theyall have
ledmeto thispoint and theperson that I’ve
become.All I know is that therewill be in-
numerable failures inmyfuture.What I’ve
cometo learnabout failure is toembrace it
rather than to fear it.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Ourwork inwealthmanagement isnever
complete. It is adynamicprocess that truly
never ends.Asapersonwho loves tasksand

Age:32
CompanyandTitle: Intermountain

Health—PeaksRegion:NursePractitioner
Hometown:ParkCity,Montana
Educationand/orBackground:Doc-

torofNursingPractice,MontanaState
University.BSN-MontanaStateUniversity.

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? If I couldn’tbe in thefield
ofmedicine, I reallydon’t knowwhat I
woulddo.Ever since I can remember, I have
alwayswanted tobe in thefieldofmedi-
cine.Ofcourse, I havewanted toexplore
different areasof themedicalfieldbut it
alwayscamedowntobeing in themedi-
calfield. If I couldfindextra timeduring
theday, Iwould love tobeable tocoach
softball!

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?Motherhood, it is truly
oneof themost challenging, yetmost
rewardingaspects inmy life.Myhusband
and Ihave twosonsanda little girl on the
way.Weareanactive family aswe farmon
the family farmand Ihope that thevaluable
lessons that I learnedgrowingup, I canpass
on to them. Iwantourkids to lookback
andsay that theirparentswerepresent and
made their childhoodmemorable.

What is theworstadviceyou’vere-

ceivedandwhy?“Youcansleepwhenyou
aredead.”Weall knowthatwe function
better ashumanswith theproper amount
of rest and recovery soget somesleep!

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Thesteps to success
maynotbeeasybut thechoices thatyou
make todaycanmake thatpatha little less
bumpy.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Besides
an iced latte—reading. I really enjoy read-
ing rightbeforebed tounwindandunplug
fromtheday.

Whatisoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwanttoachieve? I
would like tobe involved incommunityed-
ucation ingroupsessions. Iwouldeventual-
ly like to implementeducational sessions for
theLaurelandsurroundingcommunitieson
important topics/diagnoses.Somepeople
arenotcomfortablecomingtoamedical
clinic foraone-on-oneappointmentbut if
wecaneducate ingroupsessions,wemay
beable toestablish relationshipsso that
communitymembersarenotafraid tocome
discusshealthcareneedswithaprovider.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?Through thepositive impact that I
haveon thepeople aroundme including
mypatients, their families, coworkers,my

familyand friends.
What failurehaveyou learnedthe

most from? I cannotpickoutone failure
that Ihave learned themost frombecause
Ihavegrownfromall of them.Onemaybe
afraidof failurebut I always rememberone
ofmycoaches saying“failure—embrace
it, learn fromit andkeepgoing.Youare
stronger,wiser andbetterprepared than
youwerebefore that failure.”

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Givingbadnews.This is apartofmy job
thatwill neverget easier.Being in family
medicine isnot the initial track inmedicine
that I startedonbut it hasbeenoneof the

greatestopportunities that Ihavehadand
I amthankful everyday Iget to formthera-
peutic relationshipswithpatients.Having
this relationshipmakesgivingbadnews
evenharderbecause thesearepatients
and families thatyou trulycare for.Even
though it ishardevery single time, Ihope
thatmypatientsknowthat Iwill be in their
cornerbeinga supporter andcaregiver.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?Yellowstone

What isyour favoritebook?“Living
Fully”byMalloryErvin.Thisbook is for
you if youarecaughtup in“gettingbyand
going through themotionsof life.”

What is themostrewarding/im-
portantaspectofyouroccupation?An
aspectofmyoccupation that I ampassion-
ateabout is givingmypatientsoptions.
There isnotonesingle careplan thatwill
fit all patients’needs. I love toget toknow
mypatients andoffer themoptions for
their care that theywill feel comfortable
about. I don’t everwantmypatients to feel
pressured. Iwant themto feel comfort-
able about theirdecisionsandhowwecan
move forwardwitha treatmentplan that is
sustainable for them.

MASONO’DONNELL | DON’T FALL INTO THE TRAP OF
THINKING LEARNING ENDS WHEN FORMAL EDUCATION ENDS

KACI POPP |MAKE CONNECTIONS. WORK HARD. SMILE
Please see O’Donnell, Page 36

Please see Popp, Page 36
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Age:31
CompanyandTitle:NOVACenter for

thePerformingArts–YouthConservatory
Director

Hometown:RedLodge
Educationand/orBackground:

Bachelor’sDegrees inTheatrePerformance
andCommunications, internshipand the
SeattleChildren’sTheater

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead?Myprevious jobwasas
anevents coordinator. If thisopportunity
hadn’topenedup Iwouldprobably still be
doing that.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life? I loveanimals! I cur-
rentlyhaveadog, a cat, andfivechickens.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy? I’vebeengivensome
prettybadadvice, butnotmuchof it has
been related tomy joborcareer.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?That success looks
different for everyone.Somepeoplemay

think success comeswithhavinga lotof
money,orbeing famous,but somebodyelse
might think success ishavinga family and
theirhealth.Don’tbaseyour successoff
someoneelse’s.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Drink-
ingaglassofwinewhile readinga really
goodbook in the tub.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? I
would really like to teachat thecollege level
someday.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess? I’mdoingwhat Iwantand love todo!

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from? I don’t think there’sone in-
stance inparticular, but anytime Ioverfill
myscheduleor stretchmyself too thin.
That is alwaysa reminder tobe true tomy-
self andhave strongandclearboundaries.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
It doesn’thappenveryoften,but everynow
andagain I’llworkwithakidwho’sgoing
througha tough timeorhas somestuff

goingonathome.That’s alwayshard to
handle.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“Dead toMe”onNetflix.My
husbandand Iwatched theentire last
season inoneday.

What isyour favoritebook? I amre-
ally into the“Outlander” seriesbyDiana
Gabaldon.

What is themostrewarding/im-
portantaspectofyouroccupation? It is
prettycool to run into students and their
familiesoutsideofNOVAandhave them
get excited to seemeandsayhi. It’s also re-
ally cool towatchkidswhoarea littlemore
reservedcomeoutof their shell andmake
newfriends.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration? I’mnot sure. I’vehada lotofhelp,
loveandsupport along theway froma lotof
people.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby?
“Dothebestyoucanuntil youknowbetter.
Thenwhenyouknowbetter, dobetter,”

MayaAngelou
Whatadvicewouldyougive toany-

onewantingtostartanewbusinessor
excel inabusinessorfield?Seeabove.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-
cess?ByhowI feel at theendof theday.Did
Idomybest?AmIproudof thework I’ve
done?AmIhappy? If theanswer is yes then
I’d say that’s a success.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/hob-
by? I like to read, go forbike rides, and I
really like tocook.

What’s thegreatestgiftyouever
received?Why? I havemygrandmother’s
gold Irishcladdagh ring, and it’s agreatgift
for sentimental reasons.

DELANEYHARDYRAY | DON’T BASE
YOUR SUCCESS OFF SOMEONE ELSE’S

One of this
year’s 40 under
40 winners is
one of our own.
Congratulations,
Tyler Crennen.

Member FDIC. Equal Housing Lender.⌂
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Age:38
CompanyandTitle:DowntownBill-

ingsAlliance,CommunityEngagement
andEventsDirector

Hometown:San Jose,California
Educationand/orBackground:BS

fromSan JoseStateUniversity inAdvertis-
ingandMassCommunications/Back-
ground inmarketingandspecial events

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? I ambothacreative
personandpersonwhoreally loves tohelp
connectpeople topeopleorplaces somaybe
Iwouldconsider a role incontent creation
in thedestinationmarketingworld.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life? I loveeventdesignand
prior tomyrole at theDowntownBillings
Alliance IwasaneventdesignerwithBetter
toGatherEvents and if free timewas some-
thing Ihad (which Idon’thavea lot these
dayswithabusy toddler athome) Iwould
love tomoonlight as aneventdesigner
again.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?“Always stayposi-

tive.” Ido like to say I’maglass ishalf full
kindofoptimistbut I amso thankful for the
opportunities I’vegivenwithothers tobe
real inmomentswhere I’mfeelingchal-
lenged, sad,or frustrated.Feeling forced to
always lookon thebright sidecanbe toxic
toyourself or agroup. It’s totallyOKnot to
beOKrightnow.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Welcomechances
whereyoumight fail.

What’syourguiltypleasure? I ama
huge fanof learning randomfacts about
newtopics so I’mquiteobsessedwith the
“99%Invisible”podcast. I highly recom-
mend it.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? I
hope tohelpcreate and launcha largecom-
munityevent that currentlydoesn’t exist
andhave it liveonpastmytime in this role.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess? I amahelperbynatureandprofes-
sionally inmyroledowntown.Nomatter
what,mygoal is tohelp thedowntown
neighborhood (that’s thebusiness commu-

nity, residents, andworkforce, andvisitors)
succeed.Whether that’s creatinganevent
orpromotion thatwaseasy for thedown-
townbusinesses toparticipate inor coor-
dinatinganevent thatdrewa largeamount
ofvisitorsnot justdowntownbut inaway
that theyvisited to thevariousdowntown
businesses.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from? I havea sign inmyoffice that
says“Don’tbeafraid to fail, beafraidnot
to try”and that’sbecause themoments I
consider failures aremomentswhere I took
theeasier andsafer route insteadof taking
a riskwhere Imay fail.Myadversity toward
risk tends tobemybiggest failure.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Sometimes thehardestpartofmy job is
justfiguringout thebestway to saywhat
youwant to say sincecommunicating
downtownhappenings ispartofmyrole.
Inaddition I amnotusuallyworkingon just
oneeventorproject at a time. I’mgenerally
invariousphasesofplanningnumerous
events, promotions, andcommunication
project atone timeand thoseeachhave

many layersof logistics andvendors tokeep
trackof.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“TheEmpress”onNetflix.

What isyour favoritebook? I truly
enjoyedMalcomGladwell’s book“The
Outlier”but currently I’mreadingGlennon
Doyle’s “Untamed.”

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?Seeing
crowdsand thecommunityparticipation
with thevariousdowntownevents and
promotions is so rewarding.Evenmore is
whenadowntownbusiness tells us they
hadagreat salesdaybecauseof thedraw
oneofoureventshad todowntown.

Age:32
CompanyandTitle:BillingsClinic,

DirectorofFacilityServices
Hometown:Billings
Educationand/orBackground:Daw-

sonCountyHighSchool
Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould

youdoinstead?Beforemykidswereborn,
I alwayshad the thoughtofbeing in law
enforcement.Butnowasa father, Iwish
I couldbea stay-at-homedadso I canbe
with themall the time.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life? I lovebeingable tohelp
people, it givesmeasenseofpurpose. I love
when I amable tofixsomethingor sharemy
expertise andknowledge tohelp someone
out.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?WhenI’vebeen told
that success ismeasured in theamount
ofmoneyormaterialisticpossessions
youhave,when, inmyopinion, it really is
relationshipsyoubuildandself-worth that
bringyou truehappiness.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess? I thinkaboutmyself
as a teenager and remembernotknow-
ingwhat todo. I felt like Iwas in limbo,
wondering if I shouldgo tocollegeorwhat
trade to look into.So, Iwould say to just

followyourpassion,whatever thatmight
beand if it doesn’tworkout, try something
else.Everythingyou try is experienceand
knowledgeyougain.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Watch-
ingboatbuildsonYouTubeandbinge
watchingoutdoor survival shows.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? I
knowthat Iwant tocontinue tohelpdrive
myteamtosustainable success in their
careers andpersonaldevelopmentand
growth.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?Everyday I try toachieveat leastone
goal. So,onagoodday, I feelmost success-
fulwhenmore thanonegoal I have set for
myself hasbeenmet.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from? Inmyadolescence, Iwasabit
of amisfit.Toget fromrockbottom, I sur-
roundedmyselfwithgood,positivepeople
and learned thathardworkandpersever-
ancepaysoff.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Troubleshootingmajor systemsandcom-
plex issues right away.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“PeakyBlinders.”

Whatisyourfavoritebook? Ihaven’t
beenabletoreadmanynewbooksinawhile,

butIdohavetosaythatIdidenjoyreading
“12RulesforLife”byJordanPeterson.

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation? I love to
beable toprovide serviceandsupport for
ourpatients andstaff. It’s alwaysagreat
feeling toknowwhen I’vebeenable tohelp
someone.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration? Iwouldhave to saymymother.
She is an incrediblewomanwhohas taught
memany life lessonsandshownsomuch
perseverance inherownexperiences, she
hasalwaysbeenaverypositive influence in
my life.Then, Iwouldhave to say themany
exceptional leaders at theBillingsClinic. I
amveryappreciative that I amable tocon-
tinue toobserveand learngreat leadership
skills fromthem.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby?
“Measure twice, cutonce”maysoundsilly,
but I really see it asone should think/act
carefullybeforeactingonsomething.

Whatadvicewouldyougive to
anyonewantingtostartanewbusiness
orexcel inabusinessorfield?Youneed
to surroundyourselfwith like-minded
people.Shareyour ideasand listen to
advice fromyourpeers and teammembers.
Don’t takeeverythingonyourself, open
yourself up tocollaborationandsharecom-

mongoals.
Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-

cess? Inmy lineofwork, failure is always
anopportunity to learnand todevelop.
Learning frompast failureswill help topre-
vent future failures andcreate sustainable
outcomeswhichequals success.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/hob-
by? I really enjoy remodelingandcarpen-
try. I also lovefishing,dirt biking, camping,
andsharingnewexperienceswithmyfam-
ily, especiallymysoon tobe4-year-old son.

What’s thegreatestgiftyouever
received?Why? I honestlyhave to say that
myfamilyare thegreatest gifts inmy life.
Mywife andchildrenareeverything tome.
Thedaysmysonanddaughterwereborn
were so incrediblymonumental inmy life.
Theyare thebest gifts I couldhaveever
asked for.

LINDSAYRICHARDSON |WELCOME
CHANCES WHERE YOUMIGHT FAIL

JUSTINROBISON |MEASURE TWICE, CUT ONCE
Please see Richardson, Page 37
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Age:30
CompanyandTitle:Healthmine-

Director,ServiceOperations
Hometown:SpanishFork,Utah
Educationand/orBackground:As-

sociatesDegreeandnineyears incall center
experience

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? If I couldchoosea job
basedonlyonwhat I enjoy, itwouldmost
likelybe trainingdogs.Theyarebundles
ofpure joyand if you learnwhatmotivates
them, theyactually like learning.Watch-
ingnewthingsclick for themisoneofmy
favorite things.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life? I foundapassion the last
fewyears for runningandrockclimbing. If
I couldbea stayathomedadandclimbor
runwithmydaughter everyday, I’dhave it
made!Fornow,working fromhome is the
nextbest thingbecause I get to spendso
muchtimewithmyfamilyandstill doother
things I enjoy.

What is theworst advice you’ve re-
ceived andwhy?Coming downhard on
people in thework place is very overrated.
Inmy experience you rarely get the best
out of an employee bymicromanaging,
expressing frustration, or even yelling at
them. I’ve seen extraordinary growth in
people I’veworkedwith the last couple
of years by creating relationshipswhere
they feel safe bringing problems tome so
we can collaborate on overcoming those
challenges together.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Findingagoodwork
lifebalance is so important.Noteveryone
candowhat they love forworkand that’s
ok.Workinghardat something soyoucan
dowhatyou loveoutsideofwork, canbe
just as fulfilling.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Watch-
inganimeanddrinking scotch.Nothing is
more relaxing thenagood“Naruto”epi-
sodeandadrink to turnmybrainoffafter a
longworkweek.

Whatisoneprofessionalaccomplish-
mentyoustillwanttoachieve? Iwould
lovetorunacallcenterorbusinessoutof
Mexicosomeday.Inmyearly20sIspenta
fewyears livinginMexicoCityandabso-
lutely lovedmytimethere. I’d lovetheexcuse
somedaytomovebacktherewithmyfamily.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess? If I knowI’mworkinghard, treating
people the rightway, andstriving tomake
clients/coworker’s lives easier, I feel ac-
complished.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from? I still havea lot to learnbut for
too long, I failed to see someof the social

andeconomic inequality thatother races,
genders, andcultureshave todealwith.
I try to look through thingswithamore
critical lens, especiallymy internal biases,
beforemakingdecisionsabouthiring,pro-
motions, ordepartmentpolicies.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Theday-to-daystressnever seems togo
away, especiallywhenmanagingpeople.
Oneof themost important things forme
hasbeen learninghowtocopewith stress,
and turn it offwhenmydailywork isdone.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“OnePunchMan.”

What isyour favoritebook?RedRis-
ing- thewhole series is amazing.

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?Helping
tocreate jobsandopportunities forpeople.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration?DaveBrownwas thefirstperson in
theworkplace tohelpmeseewhatgrowing
inacompanycould look like.Howtosee
companyneeds,myboss’sneeds, andgrow
tofitwhatwasneeded.His energyandpas-
sionatworkwas infectiousandkey tomy
early career success. I also thinkmydad’s
workethic andexampleatdoing the job
right, hasalways stuckwithme.He’s the
typeofguy thatwill doa jobwithout some-
oneneeding toask, the jobwill bedone
rightwithnoshort cuts, andyouknowhe’ll
work longandhard toget it done.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby?
“Youmiss 100%of the shotsyoudon’t take
-WayneGretzky/MichaelScott”

Whatadvicewouldyougive to
anyonewantingtostartanewbusiness
orexcel inabusinessorfield?Lookat
peopleyouadmireor consider successful
andemulatewhat theydo.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-
cess?Success ismore than justmaking
money, getting thenext jobpromotion,or
attainingacertain job title. Ifindsuccess
when Ihaveawork lifebalance, canspend

JESSEROSS |YOUMISS 100%
OFTHE SHOTSYOUDON’T TAKE

Please see Ross, Page 38

St. Vincent Healthcare is focused on

quality, and driven to provide the best

patient care experience in the region.

Our core values are reflected in the

work of these outstanding associates.
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Carine Basmadjian, MD
SCL Health Heart & Vascular Institute -
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SCL Health Medical Group - Laurel
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Age:35
CompanyandTitle:EEC, Inc.
Hometown:Billings
Educationand/orBackground:Grad-

uated fromBillingsSeniorHighSchool. I
havecompletedextensive trainingwithin
the scopeof construction includingbuild-
ing techniques, safety, andmanagement.

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead?Possibly anoutdoorguide
ora rep for anoutdoorgear company.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?Hunting,fishing, rafting
andhiking in thebackcountryofMontana
rightnow.Spending timewithmytwokids,
RubyandRoscoeaswell asmywife,Katie.
I alsoenjoywoodworkingandbuilding
uniqueandbeautiful furniture.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?Toavoidpaying taxes,
I hada taxaccountant tellme to“make less
money.”Asayoungadult trying togrow
wealth, thiswashard tounderstandanddid
not seemtomakesense.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Thereareopportuni-
ties for success innon-traditional routes.
Themost importantpart ishavingagoal
andworking toward thatgoal.Notevery-
onehas to followthe samepath, therecan

besuccess inexperience, trade training,on
the job trainingandcollege for thosewill-
ing towork towards their goals.

What’syourguiltypleasure?The
most innovativeoutdoorequipment. I love
beingable topack light andefficientlywith
advancedgear technology.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? I
would like todesignandbuilda stunning
cabinusing traditional logmethodscoupled
withmodern timber framing.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?Theability toprovide formyfamily
aswell asopportunities formyemployees
toprovide for their families.Also fromthe
positiveoutcomes I seewhenourcompany
completes aproject for a satisfiedclient.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from?Friendship loss. It is easy to
get caughtup inworkandexcelling ina
professionand lose sightofwhat is impor-
tant in life, suchas friendship.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Oneof thehardestpartsofmy job isman-
agementof employees.Everyonehasavery
important role inmakingEECsuccessful,
but any little thing suchasa small dispute
orbigdisaster canaffectworkflowandthe
successof a job. I spenda lotof time trying

tomakesureeveryone’sneedsaremet,
whether it be the job site, client, employee
ora subcontractor.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“MeatEater.”Weeat a lotof
wildgameand I enjoy seeing thewayhe
prepareswildgame. It givesmemotivation
tocookgreatmeals!

What isyour favoritebook?“Sheep
andSheepHunting”by JackO’Conner.

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?Seeing
aproject fromconception tocompletion in
knowing that thequalityofworkourcom-
panyprovides is longstanding.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration?QuentinEggart.Heprovidedme
with theopportunity togrowand learn
thisprofessionandhis legacycontinues
throughmypartnershipanddedication to
EECand theworkwedo.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby?
“Leadbyexample.”

Whatadvicewouldyougive to
anyonewantingtostartanewbusiness
orexcel inabusinessorfield? It takes
timeandhardwork tobe successful. It isn’t
alwayseasyor enjoyable, but theoutcome
isworth theeffort.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-

cess?Failure is anopportunity forgrowth
and learning. It is a time to reflect and
researchwhatcouldbedonedifferently.
Successmotivatesme todomore. It helps
mecontinue to seepotential.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/hob-
by? I amanavidhunter andoutdoorsman,
whether thatbehiking/backpacking in the
Beartooths, scouting for animals, shed-
hunting, attendingevents toadvocate for
public landsorfishingwithmykids.Raft-
inghasalsobeen relaxing forme thepast
fewyears. It is enough tokeepmeoccupied
andcontentbetween rowing,flyfishing
androckhuntingwithmyfamily.

What’s thegreatestgiftyouever
received?Why?Fatherhood. Ithas taught
mepatience,givenmefitsof frustrationand
worryaswell as someofmygreatest joys.

Age:32
Companyandtitle:HUBInternational

Insurance,SalesExecutive
Hometown:RedLodge
Educationand/orBackground:Bach-

elor’sDegree inBusinessMarketing from
MontanaStateUniversity.

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead?Myhusbandownsa
plumbingbusiness andwealsoenjoy in-
vesting in real estate so Iwouldprobablyget
more involvedwith thoseaspectsofmy life.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?With real estate, I really
enjoy theprocessof takinganeyesore that’s
rundownandoverlookedandrenovating it
intoagreatplace to live.Seeing thepoten-
tial in a space, comingupwith thedesign
andultimately seeing theoutcome is really
rewarding forme.Otherwise, I love spend-
ing timeoutdoorswithmyfamilywhenever
weget thechance.

What is theworstadviceyou’vere-
ceivedandwhy? Iwas toldone time to set
more realistic goals. I think settingeasily
reachablegoals limitsourgrowth.Chal-
lengeyourself. Set thebarhigh.What’s the

worst thing that canhappen?
Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-

ageraboutsuccess?Nowis the time to
findoutwhatyou’regoodat,whatyou like
todo, and to take somerisks.Trymany
things.Thedefinitionof success is only
yours tomake.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Foul
language?Haha.Andpizza.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? I
still haveacertaingrowthfigurewithinmy
business that Iwant toachieveaswell as
earninga specificawardatourcompany.

Howdoyoumeasureyourown
success?Bysettinggoals andprioritiz-
ing them.Reflectingandevaluating them
consistentlywithmycolleaguesand family.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from?Anytimewe loseaclientor
aclient choosesoneof themanyother
optionsout there, I amconstantly asking
for feedback.We learn themost aboutour
processes andwhatwecando to improve
fromthoseclients.

Wealsowere recently involved ina
socialmedia frenzybasedona lotof false

informationand thatwasvery interesting.
Weultimately justhad topivotourplans
but, in themeantime, itwashard forme
because I caredwhatpeoplewere thinking
andsaying. It forcedmeto learn thehard
way thatyoucan’tpleaseeveryoneandul-
timately,people aregoing to sayand think
what theywantaboutyou.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
This industrycanbeverygeneralized.You
can’t turnon theTVwithoutan insur-

ancecompanypromising lowerprices.No
oneenjoyspaying for apieceofpaper and
apromise…until theyneedappropriate
coverageandunderstandhowvital it is.
Providingclientswith theknowledgeand
helping themunderstand their coverages
before it’s too late is a challengeour indus-
try faces everyday.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?Does“Cocomelon”count? If
youhavea toddler, youknowthepain.

What isyour favoritebook?For fun,
theHarryPotter series. Forprofessional
development, 10XbyGrantCardone.

What is themostrewarding/im-
portantaspectofyouroccupation?
Forbetterorworse,weare thepeoplewho
are involvedwhen tragedystrikes.Acar
accident, ahouseburning. I don’t take that
lightly.Knowing thatourclientswill be
takencareof appropriately isboth themost
rewardingand important aspectof the
insurancebusiness.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration?Myhusband. Iwouldnotbewhere

BRANDONSAM | LEAD BY EXAMPLE

JAMI SHANKS |WRITE DOWN YOUR GOALS AND
WORK TOWARDS YOUR OWN DEFINITION OF SUCCESS

Please see Shanks, Page 37
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Age:31
CompanyandTitle:NILE,Livestock

DepartmentManager&YouthEducation
Director

Hometown:Worden
Educationand/orBackground:B.S.

inanimal sciencewithanoption in live-
stockproductionandmanagement-minor
inagriculturebusiness fromMontanaState
University

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? I honestly cannot imagine
doinganythingelse. Iwasveryblessed to
step intoaprofession that I ampassionate
about rightoutof college.However, if I did
have towork inanotherfield, Iwouldwork
for theairlinesor as anair trafficcontrol
agent.Clichéas itmaybe, theAvGeek in
mehasa fascination for airplanesand the
sciencebehindflight.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?Thepromotionof agri-
cultureandyouth.Growingupparticipat-
ing inyouthorganizations suchas4-Hand
FFA,AmericanPaintHorseAssociation
andavarietyof cattlebreedassociations
havehelpedshapeme into theperson I am
today. It also ledmetomychosencareer
path. I canattributemyability to speak in
frontof a crowd,understandingof agri-

culture systems, and responsibility for
livestockdirectlyback to lessons learned
inmytimeasamemberofboth4-H&
FFA.Nowadays, Iworkdirectlywithhigh
school agriculture teachers, extension
agents, cattlebreed representatives and
other agricultureprofessionalsonavariety
ofprojectswithinmyprofession. It is an
honor toworkwith those that I lookedup to
not too longagowhen it comes toplanning
andexecutionof anyevent.

What is theworstadviceyou’vere-
ceivedandwhy? It’s all aboutperspective,
I don’t recall ever receivinganybadadvice.
Everyone’sopinionsmaycomefromparts
of their lifestyles thatmayaffectothersdif-
ferently.Thebest thing tonote is, if it truly
isbadadvice, take it as a lesson learnedand
moveonwith that advice inmind.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Youwon’tfindsuc-
cessby living inyourparents’ basement,
waiting forhandouts.Findacareer and try
tofindyourplace in this crazyworld.Suc-
cessdoesnot comeeasy–showup,work
hard, stayhumbleandbeyou!

What’syourguiltypleasure?Mint
chocolate chip ice cream,chocolate, any
other sweets!

What isoneprofessionalaccom-

plishmentyoustillwant toachieve?
Findmoreways to incentivize andprovide
additional opportunities to the livestock
exhibitors that cometoexhibit at theNILE
eachyear.Withcontinuedgrowth, I could
see theNILEStockShowbecome labeled
asoneof themostprestigious stock shows
nationally.Later inmycareer, anaccom-
plishmentwouldbeoneday tobecomethe
generalmanager at a stock showorexposi-
tion, suchas theNILE.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess? It’smore thanaccomplishing tasks
andgoals forme. It’s about thepromotion
of agriculture inaworldwhere the industry
is criticized for trying to feed theworld.
Success tome ismeasured in theability to
celebrateothers and toproduceanevent
wherehopesanddreamscometrue! It’s
trulyaboutcelebrating theyouth inagri-
culture throughscholarships, internships,
MeritHeiferProgramandchampionselec-
tions. It’s aboutwatching livestockexhibi-
tors receive that championhandshakeand
theirmillion-dollar smiles.Without their
successes theeventwouldcease toexist, as
longasweareable toprovideaconsistent
place tocelebrate topnotch livestock,we
areprovidingopportunities foryouthand
adults alike topromote their livestockand

rise to thebestof theirpotential.
What failurehaveyou learnedthe

most from? I havenotalwayshad the
utmost confidence inmyself anddoing
agoodenough job. Ihaveoften labeled
myself as aperfectionist,which isokay,
however the self-doubt that comeswith
notachievingperfectioncouldbe labeledas
a failure.Over theyears, I have learned to
continue to strive forperfection,buthave
gainedconfidence inmyself personally
andprofessionally. I cannowask thehard
questions thatmayneed tobeaddressed,

Age:34
CompanyandTitle:RimrockPediatric

Dentistry,DirectorofMarketing
Hometown:Worden
Educationand/orBackground:Bach-

elor’s inHealthcareAdministrationwith
aminor inbusiness.Associate’sDegree in
HumanResources.

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? Iwouldmost likelyown
myownboutiquewithawestern/ranch
flare forwomenandchildren.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life? I truly careaboutpeople
andchildren. Ihavebeenblessed tobepart
ofmultipleorganizations that Ihavebeen
able to supportwithinmycareer.But,my
mostpassionateonesareChaseHawksMe-
morialCrisis andToys forTots.Thesehave
suchamassive impactwithinourcom-
munity.Tobepartof theseandseeingwhat
adifference their supportprovides,means
themost tome.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve
receivedandwhy?Thatyouhave toget a
degree inorder tomoveuporgoanywhere.
I did receive several degreesbut Ifind the

older I get, themore trouble Ihavewith
this as therearemoreandmoreadultswho
haveneverhadany life experienceoutside
of abookoruniversity settings.Once they
receive thisdegree, they feel theyhavean
entitlement toapaygrade.Thisdoesn’t
apply toeverydegree,but thisdoesapply
tocertaindegreesatwhich real lifehands
onexperience isworthmore thanapieceof
paper. I believe thereneeds tobeanempha-
sisonhandsonexperience toouryounger
generation rather thanpushinga school for
themtogo to.

Whatadvicewouldyougivea
teenageraboutsuccess? Iwouldencour-
age themtoenjoy theprocess.Success is
measuredonlybyeach individual and in
order tobe successful youhave toenjoy the
process. Itwill bedifficult andscarybut it’s
partof the ride.Life is short and it shouldn’t
bewastedonbeingmiserable andnegative.

What’syourguiltypleasure? Iced
coffeeandrealityTV.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve?
I have somanymore that Iwould like to
achieve. Iwant tobeable tohaveall of our

officesbeingahouseholdname. Iwant tobe
able tomakesure that schools all over the
stateofMontanahavea stashof tooth-
brushes togive tokidsat any time. Iwould
like tobeableprovideamobile service for
childrenwhoareunable tocome intoour
office. Iwould like tohavepolitical voice in
making it amoreaffordablebenefit for chil-
drenso that theydon’thave to sufferwith
painora smile thatgetsmade funof.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess? I ama“give it 110%”ateverything I
do. If I canwalkawayat theendknowing I
did that, then I cangivemyall to theother
needs inmy life likemyhusbandandkids.
If eitherof thoseareoff, then it canmess
with the successofother things inmy life.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from? It’sOKto fail.Thiswasavery
hard lesson to learnbut itwasworth it in
theendandsomething that Iwillmost
likelydoagain.Whenyou fail youareable
togrowand learn fromthosemistakes.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Knowing that ashardas I try tomakecom-
ing to thepediatricdentist funandexciting,
therewill alwaysbea level of fear forkids

that I amunable to takeaway.
Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-

watched?“TheCrown.” I sent the family
away togoplayandbingedwatched this
while I spent theday folding laundry.

What isyour favoritebook?“Not
MyFirstRodeo”byKristiNoem.Thiswas
the lastbook I just readand itwasa really
insightful book.

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?Good-
ness, itwouldhavebewatchingkiddosget
soexcited to seemeat events togive them
toothbrushes. I domybest tomakesure
there is a level of excitementwhen theysee
meso if theyget thechance tocome into the

SHELBYSHAW| SHOWUP,WORKHARD, STAYHUMBLEANDBEYOU!

MIKELSHERMAN|IT’SHARDTODOSOMETHINGNEW
BUTTHATISPARTOFTHEPROCESSFORSUCCESS

Please see Sherman, Page 37
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Age:32
CompanyandTitle:MontanaPsychi-

atryandBrainHealthCenter,Psychiatric
PhysicianAssistant andPracticeOpera-
tionsAdministrator

Hometown:Laurel
Educationand/orBackground:Doc-

torofMedicalScienceandMasterofPhysi-
cianAssistantStudies, both fromRocky
MountainCollege.

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead?Mychildhooddream
was tobecomeanattorneyandeventually
a judge.Asanadult, I’ve consideredbeing
aday-traderor Iwouldgoacompletely
differentdirectionandownabakery/res-
taurant.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life? I enjoybeingaclinical
preceptor andmentoringphysicianassis-
tant studentsnowthat I amarmedwith the
perspectiveofpracticalmedical experi-
ence. Ifindsharingmyknowledgeabout
psychiatryvery rewardingandvaluegiving
back to the school that trainedme.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve

receivedandwhy?“Don’t judgeabookby
its cover.”This is terrible advicebecause
weshouldbebetter about trustingour
instincts.That“gut feeling”youhave isn’t
just “instinct”but rather acompilationof
all of yourexperiences that leadyou toa
visceral reaction longbeforeyourbraincan
articulatewhyyou feel thatway.Longstory
short, your subconscious judgmentsare
usuallymoreaccurate thanyourconscious
ones.Read“Blink”byMalcolmGladwell
and judge thebookby its cover.

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Success and failure
comehand inhand.Anothermentoronce
toldme“Noone is lookingatyou, they
may lookatyou,but they’re thinkingabout
themselves.”Challengeyourself, trynew
things, anddon’tbeafraid to fail because
noone’swatching.You’ll neverbe stronger,
morecapable, andmore resilient thanwhen
youareyoung, so fail, but strive to fail bet-
ter every time.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Watch-
ing terrible realityTVshowsandeating
macaroni andcheese.

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? I
hope to teachpart-time in theDoctorof
MedicalScienceprogramatRockyMoun-
tainCollegeandbeapartof educating
fellowPhysicianAssistants/Associates
seeking theirdoctorates.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?Bymakingmyself andmysupporters
andmentorsproud. Ideemthings success-
ful inmy life if theyalignwithmymorals
andvalues,mentally andemotionally fulfill
me, furthermycareer, andareanasset to
my lovedonesandme.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from?Notgetting intoPhysicianAs-
sistant school thefirstyear I applied. It gave
metime tobuckledown,workharder, get
moremeaningfulmedical experience, and
improvemyresume. I lookbacknowand
amso thankful for that extrayear and the
skills andknowledge Igained in that time.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Theadministrative sideofbusiness com-
peteswithand frequentlyoutweighs the
frustrationsofpracticingmedicine.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“Yellowstone.”

What isyour favoritebook?Anything
writtenby JodiPicoult, current top favor-
ites are“WishYouWereHere”and“Mad
Honey.”

What is themost rewarding/im-
portant aspect of your occupation?
Providingmental health treatment to as
many patients as possible in our region
and seeing people get well. Also, fol-
lowing patients through every aspect of
their journey, good and bad, and being
a constant confidant and safe person in
their lives.

Age:38
CompanyandTitle:BillingsClinicand

CentralWellnessFamilyNursePractitioner
Hometown:Bismarck,NorthDakota
Educationand/orBackground:Mas-

ter’s innursing
Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould

youdoinstead? Iwouldbeavetor train
dogsbecause I loveanimals especiallymy
two labsLexi andNova.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?Beingamomto two
beautifulwonderfullymadegirls ages7
and9.Theykeepmegroundedandon the
go frombasketball to softball andsoccer
anddance. I thoroughlyenjoy teachingmy
girlshowtonavigate thisdifficultworld
just like they teachmewhat’s important in
life and lookingat things through theeyes
of achild. It’s agreatblessingand joy tobe
calledMom.

What is theworstadviceyou’vere-
ceivedandwhy? Justbecontent. If you’re
just contentyouwill notgrow. I always
strive to learnmoreeveryday inafield
that’s alwayschanging.

Whatadvicewouldyougivea
teenageraboutsuccess?Don’t strive
forperfection;nothing’sperfect andyour
oftenyourownworst critic, justdoyour
best.Andrememberyouareonly incontrol
of yourself.

What’syourguiltypleasure?Chips
andsalsaornachos

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? I
would like tobecomecertified ina spe-
cialty.Possibly evengoback to school toget
adoctorate and teach theupcominggroup
ofnurses.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?Happiness.Work isnot“justwork”
whenyou truly lovewhatyoudo.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from?Don’t giveup. Imaynothave
gotten intomyfirst schoolof choice.This
didn’t stopme, just reroutedmyfuture.
Andnowthat I lookbackall thingshappen
for a reason.Yougotta just trustGod.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Feelinghelpless.Thereare timeswhen
you’rewithpatients andhave togive them

sometoughnewsonadiagnosis.This can
be life changing for themand I justwant to
take it all awayand tell themitwill beOK.
But theunknown lies aheadandfinding the
rightwordscanbe toughsometimesand
the feelingofhelplessness canset in.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“VirginRiver.”

What isyour favoritebook?At the
moment Ihavenothad time to sit and read
anythingother thenmedical journals,
which Idofind funand interesting.So, I
guessmyfavoritebook ismedical journals.

What is themostrewarding/im-
portantaspectofyouroccupation?
Getting tohelppeople. I strive tohelpmy
patients feel informedheardandvalued.
Education ispowerand I enjoyempower-
ingmypatientswith theirhealthcareplan.
I’mblessed toworkwithpatientsnotonly
inpreventative/wellness carebut also in
diseasemanagementwhich is alsovery
rewarding tohelp frombothsides.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration?All theproviders Ihaveworked
with in the last 15years.Dr.Argani andDr.

Duvalhave shapedme into theprovider I
amtodayand I feel blessed tohave learned
fromthebest.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby?
Onedayat a time—stay in thepresentyou
can’t change thepastbut cancontribute to
your future.

Whatadvicewouldyougive toany-
onewantingtostartanewbusinessor
excel inabusinessorfield?Don’t stop—
setyourmind to it andkeepgoing forward.
Therewill be trials and tribulationsbut
when it’s one stepback it’s alwaysdouble
forward.Don’t let anyone tell youyoucan’t
do it if it’s yourpassion. If there is awill
there is away.

KAITLINSTAEBLER | COURAGE IS BEING
SCARED TO DEATH BUT SADDLING UP ANYWAY

LACY TANGEDAHL | IF YOU’RE
JUST CONTENT YOUWILL NOT GROW

Please see Staebler, Page 28

Please see Tangedahl, Page 38
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Age:36
CompanyandTitle:CharterCom-

munications,FieldOperationsBusiness
PlanningManager

Hometown:Colstrip
Educationand/orBackground:

DoctorofBusinessAdministration-ABD,
MasterofBusinessAdministration, and
MasterofScience inOrganizationalMan-
agement

Ifyoucouldn’tdothis,whatwould
youdoinstead? Iwould love to start a
partyplanningcompanyor small business
consultingfirm-orboth!Themajorityof
myfriendsand family canattest to the fact
that I loveholidaysand I loveparties-and
I canbeWAYover the top!Owningaparty
planningcompanywouldbe rightupmy
alley.Sincehighschool, I havehadan inter-
est inwriting small business andmarketing
plans.There is somethingvery rewarding
abouthelpingothersbring theirbusiness
ideas to life andenrichingacommunity
and local economywithdiverse serviceand
productofferings.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
partofyour life?Advocacy for colorec-
tal/coloncancer is adearpassionofmine.
I share thispassionwithmyfamily, and
especiallymyoldestdaughter,Kambria.

Mydadwasdiagnosedwith this typeof
cancer roughlyfiveyears agoand it abso-
lutelydevastatedmyfamily.Theoutlook
wasbleakand theavailabilityof resources,
knowledge, and treatmentoptions locally
werevery limited. I knewIwasnotwilling
toacceptwhat thedoctorswere tellingour
family so Idove right into researching the
diseaseandfindingadvocacyorganizations
andother resources tohelpwith thefight
against thisdisease.

Thispastyearmydaughter,Kambria,
decidedshewasgoing tobecomeayoung
advocateandsheorganizedakeychain
mission to raisemoney for colorectal/co-
loncancer.She truly inspiredmetokeep
findingotherwaysandmeans toadvocate
aswell.Together,mydaughter and I raised
funds for theFightCRCorganization,
spreadawareness regarding the importance
of colorectal cancer screeningsandearly
screenings, andpassednotonlya state
proclamation forMontana,but also local
proclamations inBillingsandColstrip, to
declareMarchasColorectalCancerAware-
nessMonth.Currently,weare in thepro-
cessof forminganon-profit.Thenon-profit
will continue todriveawareness locally in
areaswhereawareness isneededmost.

What is theworstadviceyou’ve

receivedandwhy?Silence is golden.
Silencenevergotmeanywhere,personally
orprofessionally.Learningwhenandhow
toarticulateyourself is truly important.
And if you’re aparentwith small children,
silence is scary!

Whatadvicewouldyougiveateen-
ageraboutsuccess?Getcomfortable
withbeinguncomfortable.Thebestway to
growandprogress isbygettingoutofyour
comfort zone.

What’syourguiltypleasure? Iced
coffee. I absolutely love icedcoffee, and
shopping forunnecessary thingsonAma-
zonandatTarget!

What isoneprofessionalaccom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve?A
VP leadership role.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?Everyone’s ideaofwhat success is
supposed tobeor look like isdifferent.For
me, Imeasuremyownsuccessonwhether
ornot I’vehadapositive influenceon those
aroundmeand/orwhetherornot I’vemade
an impact for thebetter inagivenarea.

What failurehaveyou learnedthe
most from? I donothaveamajor failure
topinpointnecessarilybut I’vehadmany
minor failures andsetbacks that endedup
beingopportunities forbothpersonal and

professional growth.
What is thehardestpartofyour job?

Managingchange.Change is inevitable and
being ina leadershippositionmeans Inot
onlyneed tobeflexible and resilient, but I
alsoneed tohelp thosearoundmebe recep-
tiveof changeand to focuson thepositive
that cancome fromit.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?The last showIbinge-watched
was“UmbrellaAcademy.”

What isyour favoritebook?“Girl,
WashYourFace”byRachelHolliswasa
great read!

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?The

KORRYTHOMPSON | NEVER STOP LEARNING

Please see Thompson, Page 38

Congratulations
Monique!

2465 Grant Rd. Billings, MT 59102
(406) 655-8800

Come check out our newly remodeled facility.

And thank you again to everyone who voted
for us the #1 hotel in Billings.
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Age: 36
CompanyandTitle:Rebel RiverCre-

ative; Account Executive andSocialMedia
Strategist

Hometown:Lambert,Montana
Educationand/orBackground:B.A.,

MassCommunication;Minor, Interna-
tional Studies–MontanaStateUniversity
Billings, 2009;M.A., Broadcast Journal-
ism–University ofMontana, 2011; Post
GraduateDiploma,DigitalMarketing
Expert–DigitalMarketing Institute and
AmericanMarketingAssociation, 2022; In
my family, I ama fourth-generation col-
lege-educatedwomanandMontanan.My
great-grandparents onboth sides ofmy
familywere immigrants andhomesteaded
near Lambert,Montana–myhometown.
Growingup rural has both influencedme
andgroundedme. I am incredibly proud to
be fromEasternMontana.

If youcouldn’t do this,whatwould
youdo instead? Iwould start awedding
videographybusinesswithmyhusband.
I’ma trained broadcast journalist, and
I love video storytelling.Coupledwith
myhusband’s artistic and technological
talents,we’re a great team.

Whatotherpassions/callingsare
part of your life? I ampassionate about
animal rescue and advocacy.Grow-
ing up,my family always took in the
neighborhood stray.As an adult, I seek
opportunities to help animals through
on-the-ground rescuing and supporting
rural animal rescuers. In the future, I hope
to start a nonprofit that focuses on rural
animal rescue, advocacy, and support.

What is theworst adviceyou’ve re-
ceivedandwhy?When Iwas coached to
“hit the ball like youwould hit your dog”
while playing onour school’s volleyball
team.With this language, the environ-
mentwas obviously not right forme. I
learned a valuable lesson early in life: If
you’re not surroundedbypeoplewhoup-
lift you and create a healthy environment,
it is alright towalk away andfindyour
place elsewhere.

Whatadvicewouldyougivea teen-
ager about success?When Iwas a young
teen attendingMontana4-HCongress for
the first time,myparents toldme, “You
get out of itwhat youput into it.” I had
the choice to either sit back andbreeze
through the experience–or actively
engage inworkshops, competitions, and
networking. I chose the latter, and itwas
life changing. This is theway I operate in
life to this day. I encourage others to get
themost out of their experiences by giving
it their all – nomatter their life stages.

What’s yourguiltypleasure?My
guilty pleasure is nail products. I enjoy
doingmanicures andpedicures formy
family,my friends, andmyself.

What isoneprofessional accom-
plishmentyoustillwant toachieve? I
am in the process ofwriting afictionnovel
that has the potential to be a bestseller!

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?Hardwork is behind everything I do.
I have a constant, innate drive to succeed.
I’ve been called “driven”—as I amalways
striving to achieve and accomplish.

What failurehaveyou learned the
most from? Iwas in a toxicwork environ-
ment at a previous place of employment.
At the time, I felt like the situation ended
in failure. Since then, I learned itwas not
failure, but itwas a launching pad to get
me towhere I am today.Without that
volatile situation, Iwould not have found
myway toRebel RiverCreative. I amso
grateful to bewhere I amnow.That “fail-
ure”was just a part of the path I needed to
take to get here.

What is thehardestpart of your job?
Leavingmywork atmydesk. In themar-
keting communications field, I amalways
plugged into socialmedia and learning the
latest trends andbest practices.When it’s
time to gohomeor take a vacation, it takes
me awhile to turn off thenoise andhustle.

Whatwas the last showyoubinge-
watched?The 1980s-’90s series, “Mur-
der, SheWrote,”was the last show I binge-
watched. I ama fan of the late actress

Angela Lansbury. I love her impeccable
grammar andhowher character, Jessica
Fletcher, handles situations in the show. I
also have greatmemories ofwatching this
serieswithmygrandparents as a child. It
bringsmeback to a timewhenourworld
was very different, and it’s a fantastic
escape.

What is your favorite book? I have
always loved the “Anne ofGreenGables”
series. I feel a special connection to the
story’smain character, asmymiddle name
is “Annewith an ‘e’”–named aftermy
late aunt, AnneRehbeinWiprud.These
novels are timeless classics. The series also
introducedme tohigher-order vocabulary
at a young age,

What is themost rewarding/im-
portant aspectof youroccupation?At
Rebel RiverCreative,we are encouraged
to be innovative,which I believe is a rare
opportunity. It is also rewarding that the
Rebel River partners invest inmyongoing
education so I can continue to be the best I
can be. I am thrilled to be usingmy skills,
talents, and education there every day.

Who isyourgreatestmentor/in-
spiration?Thewomen inmy family are
mygreatest inspiration. Inmy family,
I’ma fourth-generation college-educated
woman.Mymaternal great-grandmother
earned a business degree in the early 20th
Century– long before itwas the norm.My

maternal grandmother,MaryAliceReh-
bein,wasRichlandCounty’s first public
health nurse andwas thefirst—andonly
—first responder.Her daughters—Anne,
Martha, andMary (mymother)—have all
had impressive careersworkingwith and
educating youngpeople. Theyhavemod-
eled how fulfilling it is to have inspira-
tional andmeaningful careers.

Doyouhaveamotto thatyou live
by?When Iwas graduating fromcollege,
Iwas having a difficult timedeciding be-
tween going to graduate school or pursu-
ing an internship inWashington,D.C. I re-
ceived two excellent pieces of advice I still
live by today:Myparents toldme, “When
you set yourself upwith great options, you
canonlymake great choices.”Mymater-
nal grandma toldme, “You’ll figure it out,
or youwon’t.”

Whatadvicewouldyougive toany-
onewanting to start anewbusinessor
excel in abusinessorfield?Don’t settle.
Listen to your heart. Persevere.

Howdoyouview failure andsuc-
cess?Failure and success are relative. It’s
what youdowith those failures and suc-
cesses thatmatters.

Whatdoyoudo for fun/relax/
hobby?Myhusband and I love going to
movies, especially at the historic Babcock
Theater in downtownBillings. I also love
to travel. So far, I’ve visited approximately
30 states and four continents…and I’m
not done yet!

What’s thegreatest gift youever
received?Why?The gift of education
I received frommyparents is priceless. I
workedhard for andwas grateful to have
earned several scholarships and a teacher’s
assistant position that fundedmost of
my education.However, therewere still
expenses, andmyparents supportedme so
that I could focus on school and immerse
myself in the experiences. Itwas a priority
for them, and theymade sacrifices forme.
I’ll always be grateful to them for somany
opportunities and lessons—but especially
formy education.

GILLETTE VAIRA | YOU GET OUT OF IT WHAT YOU PUT INTO IT

Who is your greatestmentor/inspi-
ration?Mydad.He ismy voice of reason
and that voice in the back ofmyhead.He’s
always expectedme to reachmypotential
and pushedme to do so.Hewasn’t one to
coddleme or dole out sympathywhen I
failed orwas rejected, but hewas the one
to remindme ofmymottos (see below)
and pushme to keep going.

Doyou have amotto that you live
by? I have two: “You’ve got to learn how
to take a punch,” and, “Courage is being
scared to death, but saddling up any-
way.”

What advicewould you give to
anyonewanting to start a newbusi-
ness or excel in a business or field?
Keep pushing. There will always be
people who stand in your way as you
work to achieve your goal. But if it mat-
ters to you and you’re passionate about
it, keepworking. Study hard, take extra

classes, talk tomentors, and surround
yourself with people who understand
your vision. Remember that themore
successful you become, the fewer people
will be there to cheer you on so learn how
to cheer yourself on and celebrate your
accomplishments— big and small.

Howdo you view failure and suc-
cess? People are intrinsically afraid
of failure, but if you’re not failing then
you’re not trying. Successes are great but
it’s the failures you remember -when you
lose, don’t lose the lesson.

What do you do for fun/relax/hob-
by? I love traveling and spending time
withmy family near and far. I am also
an avid runner, quilter, andmember of
the Yellowstone Region of the Sports Car
Club of America.

What’s the greatest gift you ever
received?Why?My stethoscope. It is
the same stethoscope as another great
mentor onmy pre-physician assistant
track and it marked the pivotal point
between striving to become a PA and be-
ing a PA.

Staebler
From page 26
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staff, etc. It’s like apuzzle some-
timesfiguring it all out and I
thoroughlyenjoy it!

Whatwasthe lastshow
youbinge-watched?Probably
“Friends.” It is a showIcanput
onas Ihave seen it somany times
andknowwhat ishappening,but
itnevergetsold formeeither!

What isyour favoritebook?
I cannot say Ihaveone favorite
book,but a favorite author. I love
all thebooksbyNicholasSparks.

What is themostreward-
ing/importantaspectofyour
occupation?Wow, therearea
fewthings that cometomind. It
isworkingwith the students and
seeing their growth through their
education. I call it the“ahha”or
“lightbulbmoment”when they
areworking throughsomething,
andall of a sudden, it just clicks
for them,and theyget the skill
or task theyare trying tocom-
plete. It is so fun to see it all come
together!

Whoisyourgreatestmen-
tor/inspiration? I havehadso
manygreatpeoplehelpmealong

my journey toget towhere I am
today.All I cansay is thankyou
toall thathavehelpedme! Ihope
tobeable to repay thementorship
forward to someoneelsewho is
aspiring toacareer in simulation.

Doyouhaveamottothat
you liveby?“Always remember
to fall asleepwithadreamand
wakeupwithapurpose.”During
my interviewformyDirector
ofSimulationposition, I said I
felt like this jobwas reaching for
the stars anda truedream jobof
mine. I amnowfortunate enough
tobe living thatdreamandwake
upeachmorningwithapurpose
to serveour students tohelp them
grow in theirdreams.

Whatadvicewouldyou
give toanyonewantingtostart
anewbusinessorexcel ina
businessorfield?While Ihave
never startedanewbusinessbut
for someonewanting toexcel ina
careerfield is tonetwork.Reach
out to thosedoing the jobyou
dreamofnowandtalkwith them.
Knowthatmostpeoplewhoare
already in that roleyouwant to
excel inarehappy to share their
knowledgeandhelpothers suc-
ceed too.

Howdoyouviewfailureand

success?Failure is something
thathappensandgivesusall a
chance to learnandgrow.When
you fail, youcaneither choose to
sulk in it, and it remainsa failure,
oryoucan learn fromit. Suc-
cess iswhat comesafterwehave
failed, learned fromit, retried
againandsucceeded thenext
timearound.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/
relax/hobby?Myfun time is
spentwithmyfamily.Thismay
meangoing towatchourkids in
a sportingeventor aconcert.As
a family,weplaya lotof games
tooaround thekitchen tableor in
ourbackyard. I love tocraft, as I
mentioned, so that is a funway I
relax.

What’s thegreatestgiftyou
everreceived?Why?Thegreat-
est gift I haveever receivedwould
have tobe thegift of family. Iwas
luckyenough tomarrymyhigh
school sweetheart, andwehave
threeamazingkids thatwe love to
spend time together as a fam-
ily.Beingable tohave the family
wedo, and the support fromour
other familymembers is amazing.
The laughterweshareand the
memorieswemakecouldnever
be replacedbyamonetarygift.

Whatadvicewouldyougive
toanyonewantingtostarta
newbusinessorexcel inabusi-
nessorfield?Findwhatyouare
passionateabout,workhardand
knowwhentoaskothers forhelp.
Surroundyourselfwithpeople
whoare just aspassionateasyou
are.

Howdoyouviewfailureand
success?Successes and failures
happeneveryday, somebigand
somesmall. It is apartof life and it
is important tonotget toocaught
up ineither.Learn fromyour fail-

ures andcelebrateyour successes.
Whatdoyoudofor fun/re-

lax/hobby? I enjoy traveling the
worldwithmyhusband, spend-
ing timewith family and friends.
I alsoenjoyexercising,hiking,
snowboardingandof course read-
ingagoodbookorwatchingan
enthralling televisionseries.

What’s thegreatestgift
youeverreceived?Why? I am
trulyblessed tohavemyfamily.
Myparents taughtmybrother
and I thevalueof educationand
astrongworthethic.Theymade
hugesacrifices so thatmybrother
and I couldhaveeveryopportu-
nity.Havinga supportive family is
thegreatest gift.

Anglin
From page 4

Basmadjian
From page 4

Oneof thecoolest things tome is
watchingbreak throughmoments
forpeople.

Whoisyourgreatestmen-
tor/inspiration?Mymother.
Ourpersonalities arevery similar
andweareable tonavigatedif-
ficult situationsandcomeouton
theother side standing tall. I get

myresiliency fromher.
Doyouhaveamottothat

you liveby? I have several, but
mygo to isFigure ItOut!

Whatadvicewouldyou
give toanyonewantingtostart
anewbusinessorexcel ina
businessorfield?Besomeone
that specializes ingenerating
solutions. It’s easy to identify
aproblem,butverydifficult to

Bazemore
From page 5
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constantly changing.While that can be
difficult to stay ahead of, it also allows
me to flexmy creativity and think strate-
gically often.

Whatwas the last showyou binge-
watched? “Love is Blind” and “The
Crown.”

What is your favorite book? I’ve
always been a fan of the classics. “Tess of
the d’Urbervilles” by ThomasHardy is at
the top ofmy list.

What is themost rewarding/im-
portant aspect of your occupation?
Defining the social andmedia voice of a
well-known brandwith 60 years of his-
tory is a pretty amazing opportunity. I
get to be creative every day and personify
KOA formillions of dedicated fans from

around theworld. However, what really
inspiresme aboutmywork is that I’m
not just representing a big brand; I’m
supporting hundreds of small businesses
across the U.S. and Canada. Sure, having
a viral video or securing an interview
on the Today Show is rewarding, but
there’s something special about using
my expertise to impact an entrepreneur
directly. Seeing those ‘aha’ moments
from ameetingwith a franchiseemeans
a lot tome.

Who is your greatestmentor/
inspiration?One of the reasons I feel
so connected to the work I do at KOA is
that I come from a family of small busi-
ness owners. I see a bit of my parents in
every interaction I havewith a franchi-
see. As the owners of Caramel Cookie
Waffles, they haveworked tirelessly
over nearly 40 years of earlymornings
and long days, creating one of Billings’

most well-known businesses. They not
only instilled inme the importance of
hardwork, but also providedmewith
many opportunities that have led tomy
success. Not a day goes by that I am not
thankful for what they have created and
sharedwith our family and our city.

Doyou have amotto that you live
by? Be kind. To others. To yourself.
Treat everyone as well as you can, your-
self included. As a woman, it can be easy
to forget the kindness to yourself part.

What advicewould you give to
anyonewanting to start a newbusi-
ness or excel in a business or field?
Support your passionwith a strategic
plan. Be confident in what you know and
humble in asking questions when you
don’t know. Excelling isn’t a race.

Howdo you view failure and
success? Failure is often a necessary
roadblock on your way to success. In

instances big and small, it’s rare to do
something right the first time. There’s
almost always room to improve and do
better.Without failure, success wouldn’t
happen or feel as important.

What do you do for fun/relax/
hobby? I enjoy spending timewithmy
pets watching documentaries in front of
the fireplace. I also enjoyword puzzles
and reading, but I have to admit thatmy
love of TikTok has been getting in the
way lately.

What’s the greatest gift you ever
received?Why?My greatest gift is the
opportunities I’ve had thatmy parents
worked so hard for.My upbringingwas
modest, butmy parents’ sacrifices (with
help frommy grades and athleticism)
allowedme to graduate from college
debt-free. I knowwhat an absolute privi-
lege that is, and I am so thankful for all
they’ve done forme.

create or find a solution. You also have to
learn to simultaneously think inside the
box and outside the box. Inside the box
means you are creative with the resourc-
es you currently have at your disposal.

Outside the box allows you to take a step
back and evaluate your perspective and
decisions and see if you potentially over-
looked/misinterpreted something.

Howdo you view failure and suc-
cess?They are equally essential and
a part of the process to develop. One vali-
dates your hardwork, the other inspires
you to keep going to reach that intended

destination point.
What do you do for fun/relax/hob-

by?My job doesn’t have “traditional”
business hours so when I do have time
away I enjoy hanging out with family and
friends. I try to stay as active as possible
andworkout frequently, my favorite
place to run/bike is the trail on The
Rims. Outside of that I enjoywatching

sports and amultitude of series/movies
across the various streaming services.

What’s the greatest gift you ever
received?Why?The gift of today.
Tomorrow truly isn’t promised, I am
grateful for every day I get to wake up
and continue to figure this thingwe call
life out.

Oneofmyco-workers said it best.
Oftentimes theway forward throughdif-
ferences isnotonesideadmittingguilt or
seceding.Valued relationshipsaremore
important thanbeing rightor feeling justi-
fiedand that anyonecanagree todisagree.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
Leavingworkatwork. It is veryeasy forme
tobecome infatuatedover everyaspectof a
client’sfinancial picture, goal andplan.Our
industrymoveseverydayat avery fastpace
andnoteveryday is a ‘green’day.Dealing
withpeople’s livelihood isn’t something
that I leaveat thedooronmyexit.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“Yellowstone.” Ifinally jumped
on thewagon.

What isyour favoritebook?Anyand
allColleenHooverbooks

What is themostrewarding/im-
portantaspectofyouroccupation?My
clients and the relationshipswehavebuilt
with together.Noteveryoccupationallows
you to ‘grow’oldwithpeople. I havebeen
able to ride in thebackseat asmyclients
getmarried,havechildren,buy theirfirst
home, retire, becomegrandparents and
so forth.Thisoccupationgoesbeyond
thenumbersand that, by far, is themost
rewardingaspectofmy job.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration?Ohgosh. I feelveryblessed in the
senseof Ihavehadmanygreatmentorsover
my life. Ihavehadgreat teachers, coaches,
businessmentorsandparents.At theendof
theday,myparentshavebeenmygreat-
estmentors todate.They instilledsomany
invaluable traitswithinmybrotherandIas

theyraisedus.Theirworkethic, ability to
alwaysdropwhat theyaredoingtohelpout,
and lifeadvice is something Iadmireand
seekalmosteveryday.Nomatterwhat, they
arealways thereandthat is something Ican
onlyhopetoreplicate formydaughter.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby?
Luck is the residueofplanning.

Whatadvicewouldyougive toany-
onewantingtostartanewbusinessor
excel inabusinessorfield?Beyourself
anddon’t loseyourauthenticity in the
process. It is veryeasy to talkyourself intoa
spiral of the ‘whynots’findyour ‘why’ and
go for it. If youdo thework,day inandday
out, thebenefitswill be reaped.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-
cess?Failure andsuccess are twoareas
thatgoverymuch inoppositedirec-
tions. I amnot thebest about taking the
time tocelebrate the successbut amvery

goodatdwellingon,over-thinkingand
self-criticizing the failures.Mycollege
basketball coachused to tell us after every
gamewhetherwewonor lost thatwehad
24hours to thinkabout it and thenwehad
tomoveon. It is something I try tomirror
incurrent life as aprofessional, spouseor
mombut is easier said thandone.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/
hobby?Montana is the lastbestplace!We
love tobeoutside, gocamping,head to the
lakewith friendsand family.Agoodhot
yogaclass is alsoaplaceof relaxation that I
indulge inaswell.

What’s thegreatestgiftyouever
received?Why?Myhusband,Travis, and
mydaughterRoz.Becomingamomhas
been thehardest, butmost rewarding title
Ihaveeverobtained.Althoughmostdays I
feel likeweareherdingcats, she is thebest
presentof chaoswehaveever received.

He is incredibly successful as the
owner of Arctic Home Living out of
Alaska and I am grateful to have him
as a business partner and to learn from
him. Jeremy Lane is another one of my
great business partners and has been an
amazing support system when it comes
to teaching me how to run a service

department. He always takes my calls,
gives advice when needed, and shares
his knowledge he has learned in all
his years in this industry. Lastly is my
father Kevin Bogle. When I was 9, he
sat me down and told me he had an op-
portunity to be part owner in a busi-
ness, but that it would take a lot of work
and there was a chance it may not work
out, and wanted to know if I thought he
should do it. I told him yes and to this
day even though he has since sold out

his stake he still works for that compa-
ny. When I came to him five years ago
and told him that I wanted to take the
leap with Big Sky Spas he was there to
support and encourage me every step of
the way. Having his example to look up
to, helped me make the decision to take
the chance.

Doyou have amotto that you live
by?No is not a bad answer, it’s just an
answer, but if you don’t ask the question
because youmight get told no, then you

didn’t give yourself the opportunity to be
told yes.

What advicewould you give to
anyonewanting to start a newbusi-
ness or excel in a business or field?
Starting a business and owning a busi-
ness is both challenging and rewarding.
Be sure you have a goodmentor you can
look up to, and go to. Themost successful
people havementors of their own.
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amorediverseand inclusiveplace for all
people togrowand thrive,whichwill ulti-
matelymove the industry forward.

Howdoyoumeasureyourownsuc-
cess?Myownpersonal success isdefined
largelyby the successofmyteam.Whether
I amthe teamleaderormember, it is
vitally important towork together to solve
problemsandcompleteproject goals.Col-
laborationandcommunicationare integral
componentsof success as themoreyour
teamisable tobe involved in thedecision-
makingprocess, themoreempowered they
become.Thisultimately leads tobetter the

overall outcome for everyone.
What failurehaveyou learnedthe

most from?Early inmycareer, I accepted
the role asproject engineeron largemine
expansionproject.Theproject itselfwasa
great success.However, aswe transitioned
intooperation,mostofmyco-workers
originally assigned to theprojectmovedon,
while Imade thedecision to stayonwith
the teamoverseeing the transition.After
failing tomeetourproduction targets for
theyear I, as the site technical lead,was
held largelyaccountable for theunderper-
formance.This experience reinforced tome
that allmatters, even thosehavingpoten-
tiallynegative impacts, shouldbeopenly
communicated. It also servedasa reminder
of the importanceof acohesive team,asno

onepersonhasall of theanswers.
What is thehardestpartofyour job?

Definitely the longhoursandcommute.
Miningactivities typically takeplace in
remoteareaswithcontrolledaccess in
order tominimize the impact footprint.
However, it is soworth it toknowyouare
working towardsproducing something that
is critical topeople’s everyday life, in a safe
and responsiblemanner.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?DoctorWho. I am in theprocess
of catchingupon the latest incarnationof
theDoctor afterwatchingall seasons since
the2005 reboot.Asa longtime fanof the
show, I really enjoy the longevityof this
series andhowitnever ceases tochange
andstay fresh.

What isyour favoritebook?Picking
justone isdifficult as Ihavealways loved to
readandmychoice inbooksvariesgreatly!
Mymost readwouldhave tobe the“Com-
pleteWorksofWilliamShakespeare,”of
which I alsoownseveral copies. I also really
enjoymysteries, especially anythingwith
AgathaChristie’sPoirot.Also, as ahuge fan
of the sciencefictionand fantasygenres,
I havewornoutcopiesof the“Lordof the
Rings”and“TheHobbit”alongwithan
extensivecomicbookcollection.

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?The
most rewardingaspectofmy job isbuilding
relationshipswith theamazingpeoplewho

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuccess?
Theonlyway failurehappens is if you let it.
Youcanalways learn fromcertainmistakes.
If you learn fromit andmakesomeadjust-
mentsyouwill have success eventually.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/hobby?
Rodeohasalwaysbeenapassion forme. I
grewuprodeoingandrodeo iswhatpaid
formycollegeeducation. I still teamrope

in the summer. I alsoenjoyhunting. Ihave
beenonsomeprettycoolhunting trips—
sheephunting in theYukon, staghunting
inArgentinaandgoathunting inAlaska.Of
coursenothingbeats elkhunting in theMis-
souri breaks!

What’s thegreatestgiftyoueverre-
ceived?Why? I’vegot somepretty special
nieces andnephews inmy life.Therearea
coupleof themgetting to theagewhere they
areplaying sports. I love seeing themgetting
competitive-I’macompetitiveperson) and
having funwithwhat theyaredoing!

Howdo you view failure and
success? Failure and success go hand
in hand. You aren’t going to succeed
at everything, and failure teaches you
to be successful. If you haven’t failed
at something, then how do you know
when you really succeeded at some-
thing either?

What do you do for fun/relax/

hobby? I own a hot tub store, so I
do enjoy sitting in my own hot tub
after a long day. I also enjoy my time
with kids, the outdoors, riding my
motorcycle, or relaxing with a good
book.

What’s the greatest gift you
ever received?Why?The experi-
ences both good and bad that I have
had in life.Without those experienc-
es I wouldn’t be where I am at in life
or who I am today and I can honestly
say I am happywithmy life.

Please see Chancellor, Page 32

Thesixof them(orasmyhusbandcalls
themthehexagonof anxiety)havebeen
suchahugepart inmypersonal growthand
mygrowthasamom/wife.Family is very
important tousand theyhave showedme
that theworkweput in,whether inbusi-
nessor family life,will alwaysprovidea
benefit in the long run. It is important tome
tohavesomanydiverse familyperspectives
for adviceprofessionallyorwithourkids.
Theyalways sharepast experiences that

havehelped themthrough the toughsitua-
tionsand that, tome, is invaluable.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou live
by? Just recentlymyhusband’sgrandfa-
therpassedawayandhe told several of the
grandkids“Dowell, soyoucandogood.” It
is very important tomeandour family that
weshareourgood fortuneandhardwork
withour local community.

Whatadvicewouldyougive toany-
onewantingtostartanewbusinessor
excel inabusinessorfield?Makesure to
comeupwithabusinessplan.Everyyear at
theendof theyear I sit downand lookatmy
goals andwhat Ineed todo toachieve those

goals.Thereare severalnewtools available
eachyear anddecidingwhichof those tools
aregoing towork forme is important.Busi-
nessplanshelpyoudecipher the tasksor
toolsyouneed toutilize tobe successful.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-
cess?Youhave to fail to succeed. Inorder
to reachyouroverall goals therewill be
several “failures”or learningexperiences
throughoutyour life.One thing in real
estate is everyday isverydifferent.Weare
constantly learningandadapting to the
market andourclients’needs. If a certain
tacticdidn’tworkwerework it andhope for
successon thenextone.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/
hobby?Welike to spend time inRed
Lodgefishingorhiking.Wearehoping to
beable to skimore in thecomingyears as
well. I like to relaxor just sit outsideon the
backpatio in the summerwith family and
friends. I also like togolfwhenever Ihave
theopportunity.

What’s thegreatestgiftyouever
received?Why?Definitelyourboys.Our
twosonskeepusonour toes, but Ineed that
sometimes. It is so fun towatch themgrow
and learn somethingneweveryday.While
raisingkids is themostdifficult job, it is the
most rewardingaswell.

brother and I tohavea strongwork-ethic,
confidence inourselves, andhumility that
runsdeep inourcoreas individuals.Their
actions, and their endless supportpowers
metocontinue to strive tobe thebest I can
beeachday in thework that Ido.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby?
“Hardshipsoftenprepareordinarypeople
for anextraordinarydestiny,”C.S.Lewis.

Whatadvicewouldyougive toany-
onewantingtostartanewbusinessor
excel inabusinessorfield?Schedule an
appointmentwithyour localSmallBusi-
nessDevelopmentCenter (SBDC)or if you

areaveteran, transitioning servicemem-
ber, ormilitary spouse, reachout toyour
localVeteransBusinessOutreachCenter
(VBOC).BigSkyEconomicDevelopment is
whereyoucanfind theBillingsSBDCthat
services a9county regionand theMT/
WY/UTVBOC.Visit bigskyeconomicde-
velopment.org!

Howdoyouview failure and suc-
cess? I thinkwe all have had an experi-
ence in our life that has shook us a little
more than others. It prompts an “aha!
moment”where you see two roads.One
is the road you don’twant to go down, the
person you don’twant to be and the other
road, is the direction you dowant yourself
to take, you see the things youwant to
accomplish.

We, as individuals,mightholdon to
unfortunatemomentsbecauseweare
embarrassedor regretful ofwhatwedid.
But thesemomentscanbecomesomeofour
greatest lessons thatmoldedus intowhowe
are today,becauseatour lowestpoint,we
tooka lookanddecided to take thepath that
ultimately ledus tobecomingstronger and
more resilient.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/
hobby?Travel.Myhusbandand I enjoy
travelingdomestically, butwe love travel-
ing internationally.We loveexperiencing
different cultures, cuisines, and learning
about each location’shistory.Whenwe
aren’tmappingoutanupcoming trip, I
enjoyplanning fun things forus todowith
family and friends.

I also love cookingwithmy husband,
wemake a great team in the kitchen. I
cherishmymornings at the gym. I find
it so important to set time aside that is
strictly devoted to self improvement,
doing something that we like to do and
makes us feel good. The gym is that for
me. I feel more relaxed and ready for the
day after I go.

What’s thegreatestgiftyouever
received?Why?Again,myparents and
my littlebrother.Myparents instilled inus
how important it is to support and loveone
another, becauseat theendof theday,we
alwayshaveour family to fall backon. I’m
enormouslygrateful formyparents end-
lessly supporting theactivitiesmybrother
and Iwere involved in.
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work in themining industry!Though it
ishardwork, it is avery tightknit com-
munityofpeople that alwayshaveeach
other’sback. Inmycurrent rolewith the
environmental teamatSibanye-Stillwater,
I enjoy interacting theamazingpeople in
our localMontanacommunities, especially
students.

Who is your greatestmentor/
inspiration?One ofmy greatest in-
spirations was and continues to bemy
grandfather Dexter who planted the
seeds forme to pursue a career in sci-
ence and engineering. From growing up
in Birmingham, Alabama in the 1930s,
he worked his way through college to
graduate with degrees inmathematics

and businessmanagement. After which,
he worked for NASA on the Saturn V and
early Apollo programs. Through shar-
ing his stories and experiences, he truly
mademe feel like reaching for the stars
was a reality!

Doyouhave amotto that you live
by?Over the last few years, I have come
to really appreciate the insightfulness of
the famous quote byRuth BaderGinsberg:
“Fight for the things that you care about,
but do it in away thatwill lead others to
join you.” It remindsme of, as a leader, the
vital importance of patience and under-
standingwhile driving change.

What advicewould you give to
anyonewanting to start a newbusi-
ness or excel in a business or field?
Don’t allow others to define your success
or decide what your career path should
look like. Trust yourself and stay true to

what is important to you. At the same
time, not every opportunity is going to
be open exactly when youmaywant it to,
so it is important to have patience. No
matter what point you are in your career
or what you do, be a sponge! Take every
opportunity to learn from those who are
willing to teach.

Howdo you view failure and suc-
cess? It is so important to not be dis-
couraged by failure. Sometimes they
are hard lessons, but if you can embrace
failure and take the time to find the root
cause, they can be very valuable. Suc-
cess should be celebrated, but not taken
for granted. Similar to finding the source
of your failure, you should always take
the time to determine how to replicate
your successes. The book “Sometimes
YouWin-Sometimes You Learn” by John
Maxwell was instrumental in helpingme

put into perspective the learning oppor-
tunities that failure can afford.

Whatdoyoudo for fun/relax/hob-
by?Bothmyhusband and I love to travel
both across theU.S. and abroad. I love
getting visit newplaces and learn about
their food, history and cultures. Also, as a
self-described science fiction and fantasy
nerd, I especially enjoy any opportunity
for the occasional ComicCon excursion as
part of our travels!

What’s the greatest gift you ever
received?Why?A 1960s-era slide rule
given tome bymy grandfather before he
passed away, the same year I graduated
high school. He toldme that his genera-
tion put aman on themoon using slide
rules and human calculators, so imag-
ine all of the things thatmy and future
generations could dowith the amazing
technology at our fingertips!

Howdo youmeasure your own
success? A success for me is when I
am able to turn a current renter into a
homeowner. I am trying to achieve a
business model of having rental homes
that the current renter is able to pur-
chase when they get lender approval.
It is far from easy, and not quickly
done. However, the few that have gone
through the process are able to move
forward with their American dream of
home ownership. It is extremely grati-
fying.

What failure have you learned
themost from? I have had quite a few
failures, and I know I will have more.
There is no way to knowwhat the future
will hold, and history can be the best
way to gain knowledge. You have to keep
trying, you have to keep pushing for-
ward. Lean on your friends and family
for support when times get tough. It is
important to realize that problems never
go away, you seriously just get better
at handling them andmaking those
failures into current or future success
stories.

What is the hardest part of your
job? I read once that negativity has a
louder voice than positivity. You will
have the naysayers that love to point out
things that go awry, but voices are much
quieter when you have accomplished
something few others can. It is impor-
tant to remember that you are doing
good, quality work even if you don’t
always hear the cheers from the crowd.

Whatwas the last show you binge-
watched? “Inside Man” on Netflix. It

was interesting how the show pushed
the characters into impossible decisions
and how they couldn’t seem to find
their way out of trouble.

What is your favorite book? I don’t
read as many books as I do articles and
blogs. However, I recently read “Rich
Dad Poor Dad” by Robert Kiyosaki and
found some correlations between what
I want to do in life and what he was able
to accomplish.

What is themost rewarding/im-
portant aspect of your occupation?
In my current occupation I find satisfac-
tion in training others to be able to know
what I know and perform at a level that
I perform at. I live by a philosophy that
when you leave for a vacation the opera-
tion should not miss a beat. Some people
think small-minded that they are teach-
ing someone how to take their job, but I
believe that as a manager, and more so a
teacher, it is my responsibility to make
the people I work with better. As you see
your coworkers growwithin their re-
spective positions, or former coworkers
move on to careers they truly enjoy, you
find immense happiness knowing you
helped them be a better person.

Who is your greatest mentor/in-
spiration? The person that I lean on the
most for advice is Trent Parks. He has
helped me learn a multitude of things
within the real estate and rental game.
Trent has more experience than I do in
the world of real estate, and he has been
willing to share that knowledge with
me from the very beginning. I am able
to reach out to him any time and ask
him off the wall questions, or even spit
ball ideas. I might have even helped him
learn some things along the way as well.

Do you have amotto that you live

by? “Will your future self be happy
with the decisions you are making
right now?” I heard it in a diet article
but it can be adapted to everyday life.
Will your future self be proud that you
binge watched that tv show instead of
updating your business’s website?Will
you feel better tomorrow by going out
tonight, or getting rest and relaxation?
There are two sides to the coin and you
get to see which waymakes you the best
version of you broken down into day-
by-day chunks.

What advice would you give to
anyonewanting to start a new busi-
ness or excel in a business or field?
Most of the answers you will find out
there will be tied to the just start men-
tality. I think that is very important, but
the first thing you should do is find re-
sources that will help you achieve what
you are looking to accomplish. This can
be earned by gaining a mentor or peers
that are trying to do the same thing as
you, are attempting the same thing you
are, or studying the field that you are
working in. Once you do research, you
have to start. Don’t kill yourself by do-
ing too much research and waiting on
the sidelines. When you knowwhat you
need to do, it is time to jump in and take

the risk.
Howdo you view failure and suc-

cess? Failure and success are fleeting.
Failures will come and go, as well as
successes. You should remember each
one and do your best to learn from each
one. It will not be your last success, and
unfortunately it will not be your last
failure. But as I have said across this ar-
ticle, the most important thing to do is
to keep trying. You will get better, you
will get stronger, you will get smarter.
Life is a journey and it is up to you to
decide how big of a speed bump your
current situation is.

What do you do for fun/relax/
hobby? I really enjoy going to Montana
State University football games. Go
Cats. When the Bobcats aren’t playing
I really enjoy playing racquetball and
volleyball with my friends. Something
that I like to do that is relaxing now for
me is going for a long run. I exert a lot of
energy during the run, but afterwards
I feel a sense of calm and relaxation
that is hard to match. It feels like I have
achieved something that day.

What’s the greatest gift you ever
received?Why? Aidy Cichosz. Out of
all the questions that I was asked for
this article, this is the easiest one to
answer. My daughter has brought me all
the joy that I could have ever asked for.
Her smile is truly beaming from ear to
ear and her laughter will put anyone in
a better mood. You can ask her daycare,
her therapists, or her doctors. Aidy is
a blessing and she has made me real-
ize what is important in life. She was
born into this world with some serious
struggles in front of her, but I will not
stop fighting for her and helping her in
any way I possibly can.
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doing good, quality
work even if you don’t
always hear the cheers
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couldn’t do the work, but simply that
I was being lazy. Since that day I have
understood youmust put your best effort
forward on any task at hand, that nobody
else will do the work for you, and that
you are smart enough to do anything if
you put yourmind to it.

What is the hardest part of your
job? As rewarding as my job is, the
knowledge that the need for food
stability, rent, utilities, and clothing
is so high in our community is a tough
reality to come to terms with. Family
Service provides support for 19 com-
munities in southeast Montana. Seeing
300 vehicles lineup for food distribu-
tion in neighboring towns is extremely
difficult. However, it is a great feeling
to know that we can meet these needs
for our neighbors.

Whatwas the last showyou binge-
watched? “The Big Brunch” onHBO.
I am a sucker for any show based on a
cooking competition. Add in Dan Levy
as the host and you have television gold. I
watched the entire series in one sitting.

What is your favorite book? “Until
They Bring the Streetcars Back,” by

Stanley GordonWest. I am sad to say
that this is the only book that I have read
multiple times. I remember this book
having such a profound impact onmy life
in sophomore-year English literature.
That same year, the author (who lived in
Bozeman at the time) came toWest High
to give a lecture and take Q&A. Since
then, I have re-read the book several
times. It has had a similar effect onme
with each read.

What is themost rewarding/im-
portant aspect of your occupation?As
a Development Director, I am taskedwith
raising funds to directly drive themis-
sion of an organization. The knowledge
that I may have played a role in someone
receiving a healthymeal, helped to keep
a home heated throughout the winter, or
provided a child with school supplies is
incredibly rewarding.

Who is your greatestmentor/
inspiration? Personally, my greatest
inspirations aremy parents. Raising
three childrenwhile working full-time
is no easy task for any parent. Raising
three Cremer boysmust have been nearly
impossible.My parents have been the
model for what I have basedmy life on. I
amwho I am because of their guidance,
discipline, love, and understanding. Pro-
fessionally, my greatest mentor is Robyn

Peterson. Robynwasmy director at the
Yellowstone ArtMuseum for several
years and taughtme a great deal not only
about non-profit development, but life as
a whole.

Doyou have amotto that you live
by? “It’s good to be together.”My grand-
father was aman of fewwords.When
he spoke, we all listened. One thing that
he would always saywas, “It’s good to
be together.” I didn’t really take that to
meanmuch inmy earlier years. Now that
he has passed, it means somuchmore
tome. Enjoy your timewith loved ones,
whether you see them daily, or only once
every few years. Don’t dwell on the past
or fixate on the future.Make sure that
the times you spend together are simply,
good.

What advice would you give to
anyone wanting to start a new busi-
ness or excel in a business or field?
Bet on yourself. You will have plenty of
chances to work for different compa-
nies your entire life. More often than
not, those companies will value the
bottom line above all else and miss the
value in you. They say everyone has one
great idea inside of themselves. If you
think you have what it takes to start a
new business, bet on yourself.

Howdo you view failure and suc-

cess? Failure is notmeasured by the
falling down, but by the staying down.
Success is notmeasured by the amount
of something you inherit, but by the lives
you affect.

What do you do for fun/relax/hob-
by?As Imentioned previously, cooking
and travel have become the cornerstones
of what I am passionate about. I don’t
suppose I can call travel a hobby though.
Cooking a big Italian dinner while sip-
pingwine on a Sunday afternoon is
definitely relaxing forme. I love to come
home after work andmake dinner. It is a
way to destress, and to show love for the
people around you.

What’s the greatest gift you ever
received?Why?Upon graduation from
the University ofMontana, I spent a
short time teaching English in Thailand.
On the last day of class, many of the fam-
ilies inmy program presentedmewith
gifts ranging from hand-drawn cards,
handmade bags, and homecooked treats.
The students inmy class came from
underprivileged families. Knowing that
these families took the little time and
money that they had, tomake something
special forme had a profound impact on
my life. It has drivenme to always put
others first and to be grateful for what
you have.

Cremer
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to their success. I used to think leading
meantdealingwitheverydayoperations.
As it turnsout that’smanagement.Being
a leadermeansknowingwhatyour team’s
aspirationsareandguiding themtoachieve
their ownsuccess.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration?Mymother.Shewasa singleparent
whoworkedmultiple jobs to takecareofus.
She showedmewhat it takes toworkhard
forwhatyouwantand thatnothing is ever
given toyou.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby?
“What liesbehindusandwhat liesbefore
usare smallmatters compared towhat lies
withinus.”-RalphWaldoEmerson

Whatadvicewouldyougive to
anyonewantingtostartanewbusiness
orexcel inabusinessorfield?Don’tbe
afraid to fail ormakemistakes.Theyare
opportunities togrowandperfectyour
craft, so thatyoucanbesuccessful.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-
cess?Failure is like steppingstones to suc-
cess. If youhavenever failedat something,
howwouldyouknowwhat true success

felt like? It takes failure to trulyknowhow
success feels.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/
hobby? I amanavidoutdoorsman. I love
camping,hunting,fishing, etc.Football,
baseball, andgolf are someofmyfavorites
aswell.

What’s thegreatestgiftyouever
received?Why?Mychildren.Theywill be
my legacyafter I amgone.

What is thehardestpartofyour job?
I always saybeingabanker isoneof the
toughest sales jobs.Wemeet somanygreat
people,withgreat ideasand lotsof ambi-
tionand formmeaningful relationships
with them.Weask for loanbusinessover
andover, andsometimeswhenwefinally
get theopportunity forbusinesswemay
have to saynobasedon the riskpresented in
order toprotectourdepositors andshare-
holders.Working through that communi-
cation in themost respectful and insightful
manner isdifficult, but also rewarding
whendone the rightwayandyou’re able to
sayyes to that sameclient in the future.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?Probably“Ozarks”or“Peaky
Blinders.”

What isyour favoritebook? I’ve
enjoyed thePatrickLencionibooks, “The
FiveDysfunctionsof aTeam,”“TheFour
Obsessionsof anExtraordinaryExecutive,”

etc.
What is themostrewarding/impor-

tantaspectofyouroccupation?The
people andconnectionsmadebothwith
teammates, clients, andother community
members.Banksare suchan important
foundation for acommunity, andwhen
workingperfectly, everyone involved
lifts thecommunityup.Depositorshave
safe/fungible storage for theirmoneyand
makemoneyon theirdeposits, borrowers
obtaincapital to expand theirbusiness,
bankemployeesget compensated that in
turn is investedback into thecommunity,
and thebankdonatesmoneyback to the
community that supports it.Wehave
suchhighcharacterpeoplehere inBillings
and inMontana.Tobe in themiddleof
thedynamicoutlinedaboveand towatch
ourcommunitiesgrowandhelpgrowour
clients’wealth is extremely rewarding. It’s
alsobeenespecially rewarding to seepeople
onmyteamgrow in their careers andwith
their families.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration?Myparents are for sure.Mydad is

anextremely smartman,hardworker, and
familyguy.His ambitionand thewayhe
treatedpeople are lasting lessons that I still
amremindedof frequently.Mymother’s
outgoingnatureand thewayshecares and
connectswithpeoplehas inspiredme,
especially as I’vematuredandbeenable to
fully recognize the sacrifices shemadeand
hardwork it is inbeingaparent.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou live
by?Make themostoutof today, get every
secondoutof it. Formrelationshipsand
memories; that’swhat counts in life.

Whatadvicewouldyougive to
anyonewantingtostartanewbusiness
orexcel inabusinessorfield? I’d saygo
all inon it. I’mcontinually impressedwith
theentrepreneuranddreamer spirit I see.
Payattention to thedetails, askquestions,
surroundyourselfwithagoodbanker, ac-
countant, andattorney.Savemoney, it’ll
takemorepersonal liquidity thanyou think
tohelp fund thecapital needed for anynew
business and toachieve sustainedsuccess.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-
cess? I don’t thinkyouget to the successes

until youhave several failures.And ina
weirdway, that’s the funpart.The failures
ormistakeshelpbuildyourcharacter and
yourknowledgebase.Neverbeafraidof
failing. I believeMichael Jordansaid, “I can
accept failure, everyone fails at something.
But I can’t acceptnot trying.”That’s always
stuckwithme.Also, successes arealways
best sharedwith family and friends.They
meanmorewith lovedones.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/hob-
by? I enjoy travelingwithmywife across
theU.S. andabroad, alongwith family and
friends.Playing sports andenjoying the
outdoorshasalwaysbeenapassion inmy
life.Golfing isprobablymynumberone
hobbybut Ihave really enjoyedgettingout
huntingandfishing sincemovingback to
Montana in2011.

What’s thegreatestgiftyoueverre-
ceived?Why?At thispoint,mydaughter,
andaspecial thankyou tomywife for that
gift. She’s amazingandsuchablessing.
Kidsput everything intoperspectiveand
makeyouabetterperson.

Cox
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played a role in creating a remarkable
instructionmanual forme. I try not to
dwell onwhat went wrong yesterday...
The goal is to discover what I can do bet-
ter today.

What is the hardest part of your
job? Setting boundaries. As Brene Brown
says, “Daring to set boundaries is about
having the courage to love ourselves even
whenwe risk disappointing others.” The
banks, title companies, inspections and
much of the business happen between
8 a.m. and 5 p.m., butmany client-facing
appointments come after 5 p.m. late into
the evening and every weekend.When
you have a heart to serve and you loving
doing so, it’s hard to keep boundar-
ies around time. Balancing convenient
availability to clients whilemaintaining
deeply connected relationships withmy
family and kids is a continual work in
progress and a huge part of why I created
an amazing team!

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?Context: I livewitha toddler! I
can’t recall if it asMickeyMouseClubhouse

orMickeyMouseFunhouse—maybePaw
Patrol.

What isyour favoritebook?“The
Giftsof Imperfection”byBreneBrown

What is themost rewarding/
important aspect of your occupa-
tion? Robert Lee once said, “Themost
important work youwill ever dowill be
within the walls of your own home.”
How blessed am I to get to play a part in
this?! Real Estate has been somuchmore
than selling homes. I’ve had opportuni-
ties to be a part of complete life changing
trajectories for people, seen incredible
transformations, witnessed lives being
wiped clean and starting over with blank
slates, deep, unfathomable loss, over-
whelming joy, and just about everything
in between. The connection, relation-
ships and experiences I’ve been able to
witness inmy career will forever be one
of the greatest rewards ofmy life.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration? Itmaysoundcliché,butwhen I
really answer thisquestion truthfully,my
greatestmentor and inspiration ismyhus-
band.Quinn is themostbrilliantbusiness-
man Ihaveeverknownandhehasguided,
helpedme, andsupportedmethroughout
mycareer andallmyendeavors relentlessly.

Hehas showcased tomethat theultimate
success isnotwhatyouachieve,butulti-
mately thepersonyoubecome.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou live
by?Yes. “Towhommuch isgiven,much is
required.”—JohnF.Kennedy

Whatadvicewouldyougive to
anyonewantingtostartanewbusi-
nessorexcel inabusinessorfield?Be
consistent.Keepshowingupwhenmost
peoplequit.Believe inyourself. Focuson
thenext step in frontofyou,not thewhole
staircase. If there isnostruggle, there isno
progress sodon’t let the strugglegetyou
down.Motivationwill comeandgo, so
youmust learn tobedisciplined.Setgoals:
write themdownand track them.Becomea
master—mediocrity isunacceptable.Work
hard, learn, study, sacrifice, andmostof all
— lovewhatyoudo.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-
cess?Failure is a really interestingword
forme.Atdifferentpoints inmy life, I felt
it consumedeverybit ofmebutonce I got
on theother sideof that, I realized thatmy
failureshavebecomesomeof thebiggest
blessings.Theknowledge, theperspective,
thepriorities that come fromit shapeyou.
Failure isn’t theoppositeof success, rather,
it’spartof it.Mydefinitionof successhas

changedmultiple times throughoutmyca-
reer and life, and Ihope itdoes for everyone
reading this.Definesuccessonyourown
terms.Achieve it byyourownrules and
builda lifeyou’reproud to live.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/hob-
by? I love to travel andexplorenewplaces/
cultures/cuisine. I loveplaying/watch-
ing sports, playinggolf, hiking/camping,
readingagreatbook, listening tomusic,
campfires, andeveningson thepatio, and
deepconversations.

What’s thegreatestgiftyoueverre-
ceived?Why?Growingupasa ranchkid.
I grewup ina small ranchingcommunity
inSoutheasternMontanawherevaluesand
moralswere instilled inme fromayoung
age. I’mafirmbeliever in the importance
ofnever forgettingwhereyoucomefrom
and Icreditmuchofmysuccess to theway
Iwas raised in ruralMontana.Myparents,
DaveandDonna,didn’t just teachushard
work, rather they lived it!Weunderstood
thevalueofgiving someoneyourwordand
meaning it, the importanceof lendinga
helpinghand, and the impactof a founda-
tionof faith.Withnodoubt inmymind,
the farm/ranch rootsofmychildhoodhave
shapedme intowho Iamtodayand I’m
forevergrateful for that.

Donovan
From page 12
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tonever stopproviding formyfamily.My
momis thekindest andmostgenuineper-
son Iknow,and Iwouldnotbe theperson
I amtodaywithouther.Wordscannot
expresshowgrateful I amfor everything
theyhavedone.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby?
“Peopledon’t carehowmuchyouknow

until theyknowhowmuchyoucare”-
TheodoreRoosevelt

Whatadvicewouldyougive to
anyonewantingtostartanewbusiness
orexcel inabusinessorfield?Become
comfortablebeinguncomfortable.Take
risks, trynewthingsandchallengeyour-
self.Youwill learnmoreaboutyourself and
yourabilities thaneverbefore.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-
cess?Failure is anessential partofwhowe
areand it all comesdowntohowweview

andhandle it. Failure cannotbeviewedas
anegative, instead it is simplya learning
opportunity thatwemust learnandgrow
from.Success is just like failure, it is all
abouthowyouviewandhandle it.As long
asyoustay loyal, honest andhumble in
whatyoudo,youwill be successful.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/
hobby? I loveanything todowith sports.
Whether it iswatchingorplaying softball,
if it has todowith sports, I ama fan. I also
love tohunt,fishandspend timehanging

outwithmyfamily.
What’s thegreatestgiftyouever

received?Why?Thefirst ismywife.She
hasbeenmybiggest advocate since thefirst
daywemetyears agoatScheels. She is the
strongest andmost supportivewife that
I could’veever asked for. I amsograteful
for everything shehasdone formeover
theyears.Thesecond ismytwobeautiful
daughters.Theyhavechangedmyoutlook
on life for thebetter andbecominga father
is oneofmygreatest accomplishments.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?Myhusbandand Ihavebeen
rewatching“GameofThrones.”

What isyour favoritebook?“The
TippingPoint”or“Talking toStrangers,”
bothbyMalcomGladwell.

Whatisthemostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?Myfavor-
itepartofmyjobhasbeengettingtoexperi-
enceBillingsthroughavisitor’seyes. Ihost
journalists, influencers,tourplanners,etc.
throughouttheyear.WhenItakethemtothe
Rims,myfavoriterestaurants,ZooMontana
oranyoftheotheramazingplaces,andIsee
themlightupwithexcitementforthisnew
experience, itgivesmesuchadeepapprecia-

tionforwhereIcallhome.It’ssoeasytotake
whatyouhavedailyforgranted,but inthis
role, Iamremindedregularlywhyit’ssoawe-
sometobeinBillings!

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration? I’ll approach this as twoquestions.
Mygreatest inspiration ismysister. She
wasbornwithacongenital heartdefect and
has foughtharder forher life thanmost, but
it hasneverbrokenher spirit. She inspires
me to livemy life to the fullest,withkind-
ness, tenacity, and love.

Mygreatestmentor ismyExecutiveDi-
rector,AlexTyson. I came intomyrolewith
little knowledgeof the tourism industry.
Shebelieved inmyability tobuildmyskill-
set andhasgivenmeevery tool to succeed.
Shehelpsmegrowpersonally andprofes-
sionally every singleday . Ihavenevermet
someonewhocaresmoredeeply forher

staffand their growth.
Doyouhaveamottothatyouliveby?

MybossoncegavemeasignwithaDanEr-
icksonquote that reads,“Idon’t fear failure,
I fear succeedingat somethingthatdoesn’t
matter.” Ithassatonmydeskeversince.

Whatadvicewouldyougive toany-
onewantingtostartanewbusinessor
excel inabusinessorfield?Never stop
learning. Inmyopinion, if youhave reached
apoint inyourcareerwhenyou thinkyou
knoweverythingabout it, youhave started
movingbackwards.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-
cess? I trulybelieve that failures, or lessons
as I call them,arean importantpartof life.
In thosemoments, it can feel hard to fail,
but if younever fail, youstop learning.
Themost important thingyoucando for
yourself is to surroundyourselfwithpeople

whoallowyou to fail andgrowfromit. Suc-
cess is sobroad tomeand I think it ebbsand
flows indifferent aspectsofyour life. Some
days I ammore successful inmywork than
inmypersonal life andviceversa.When I
havebalance inboth, I amatmybest.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/hob-
by? I amcertainly aMontanakid through
and through. I enjoyanythingoutdoors
withmyhusbandandour twoLabs, andof
course,Bobcat football is an importantpart
of the fall season!

What’s thegreatestgiftyouever
received?Why?Myparents instilleda
strongworkethic inme.Fromsports to4H
to life ingeneral, theyalways taughtmy
siblingsandmethatnothing in lifewould
behanded tous. Ifwewantedsomething,
wehad towork for it. I amforever thankful
to themfor that lessonandsomuchmore.

Eggart
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The physicians in Alaska were a huge
part ofmy success in healthcare. they
took the time to really explain things and
teachme every integral aspect of wom-
en’s healthcare and how to be an effective
leader. The physician leaders at Billings

OBGYNhave done the same.
Doyou have amotto that you live

by?Attitude is everything.
What advicewould you give to

anyonewanting to start a newbusi-
ness or excel in a business or field?
Work hard and choose the right people to
help build your business. Don’t be afraid
to invest in your team.When your team
is successful and there for the same rea-

sons, theywill embrace challenges and
overcome themwith you. Celebrate those
successes.

Howdo you view failure and suc-
cess? “Success is not final, failure is not
fatal: it is the courage to continue that
counts.” -Winston Churchill

What do you do for fun/relax/
hobby? I love to travel!Meeting people
from all over gives you great perspective

to other cultures, religions, and beliefs.
I love to try new things and seek new
adventures.

What’s the greatest gift you ever
received?Why?The greatest gift I have
ever receivedwould bemy family and
friends. They have been a huge support
tomy growth, success, and ongoing
development.

Fessenden
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Whatadvicewouldyougive toanyone
wantingtostartanewbusinessorexcel in
abusinessorfield?Gofor it!Learnevery-
thingyoucanabout that industry, intern if
youhave to.Makesure that the lifeyou’re
seekingactually suits your lifestyle and future
goals, not just soundsgoodonpaper.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuccess?
Therearenofailures in life.Thereare,how-
ever, lessonsonhowNOTtodo itnext time.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/hobby?
Myhusband,Thomas, and I lovegoingout to
eat, travelingor justhangingoutathomehot
tubbingwhilewatchingNetflix.

What’s thegreatestgiftyouever
received?Why?Mykids=)Theyare the
brightest light inmy life.

painted the 6th StreetWest under-
pass, my goal was tomake a difference
in just one person’s day, but I never
dreamedmyworks of public art could
touch somany hearts. The number
of letters, messages, and kindwords I
have received explaining the impact
mywork hasmade on individuals’ lives
is overwhelming and knowing I have
made a difference inmy community is
incredibly rewarding.

Who is your greatestmentor/in-
spiration?Myparents aremy biggest
inspiration, as they both possess quali-
ties that I strive to emulate.My dad,
Dean, has remarkable work ethic and
determination, andmymom, Chris-

tina, is incredibly compassionate and
patient. It is inspiring to watch them
overcome challenges, work hard for all
they have, and take care ofmy special
needs brother, Evan, all while selflessly
supportingme andmy endeavors.

Doyou have amotto that you live
by? “Do it with passion, or not at all.”

What advicewould you give to
anyonewanting to start a newbusi-
ness or excel in a business or field?
Take risks and give it your all. If you
don’t chase your dreams and give your
best effort, youwill never knowwhat
might have been.

Howdo you view failure and
success?There’s really no such thing
as a failure, as it is just an opportunity
to learn and grow. I view success as a
reward for hardwork and grit.

What do you do for fun/relax/

hobby? I enjoy spending time outside
appreciating the vast landscapes of Big
Sky Country, riding horses, hunting,
fishing, and hiking, as well as relaxing
by the fire atmy family’s cabin in the
Beartoothmountains.

What’s the greatest gift you ever
received?Why? I have been blessed
with some extraordinary gifts inmy
life, includingmy horse, Doc, and a
homelessman’s last four dollars, but
the greatest gift I have ever received
ismy heart.When I was 17 years old, I
was diagnosedwith a potentially fatal
heart condition and underwent surgery,
which resulted in complications. De-
spite the difficult recovery, my view of
the world changed and because of this,
I am inspired to create art.Withoutmy
heart and its complications, I would not
be who or where I am today.

Kirschenmann
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towardsoneanother.Ourcommunity
has facedstressful changes.Kindness can
lighten theburden thatwehavebeen forced
tocarry for twoyears.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?“GameItOut”onYouTubewith
myfamily.

What isyour favoritebook?“She’s
ComeUndone”byWallyLamb

What is themostrewarding/impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?Most
medical decisionsarebasedofftest results.
I takepride inhoningmyskills toproduce
quality results ina timelymanner.Labo-
ratoriansareoftenoverlookedbecausewe
arenot apartof thedirect care team,but
we impact lives.My labwasable topro-
videCovid-19 results topatients inunder

30minutesday inanddayout. Itwasvery
rewarding tohearpatients expressgrati-
tude for their relievedanxiety.Often times
laboratoriansare tuckedaway in labs that
areunseenbypatients, so it is a rareoccur-
rence tobe thanked forour services.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/in-
spiration? I amthankful tohave several
mentors inmy life.Lookingbackmyfirst
mentor in sciencewasmyhighschool
advancedbiology teacher,Mr.Tackes. I
learnedsomuch inhis class that trans-
ferredover tomycollegiate experience. It’s
theclasswhere Idiscoveredan interest in
humanbiologyand thediseaseprocess.My
greatest inspirationcomes fromevery-
daypeople thatprove theyarecapableof
extraordinary things.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby?
Youcandohard things!

Whatadvicewouldyougive toany-
onewantingtostartanewbusinessor

excel inabusinessorfield?Sometimes
wehaveunrealistic aspirationsofpro-
ductivity, but it is important toenjoy the
process.MedicalLaboratoryScientists are
highly skilled in several areasof study.Es-
sentially if a sample is extracted fromyour
body, then the scientistwill either test it
orprepare it tobe studiedbyapathologist.
Thebestway toexcel is tocommit tochal-
lenging jobs inyourdepartment.Under-
standingdifficult aspectsofyour jobequips
youwithauniquepointofviewandadded
value toyour skillset.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-
cess?Failure andsuccess areall apart
of the journey.Failures canbecringybut
without themaccomplishmentsdonothold
value.Success canbe lackluster if it’snot
relevant to somethingyouarepassionately
perusing.The real storybehind failure and
success isheldwithinone’sownperspec-
tive.Thehardestpartof failure is accepting

defeat. Success canalsobehard.Sev-
eralwomen inmyfield strugglementally
with successbecause theyquestionhow
deserving theyareof ahigh-ranking jobor
their level of competencewithina subject
matter.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/hob-
by? I love spending timewithmyfamily
kayaking.During thewintermonths I like
topaintor crochet topass the time.

What’s thegreatestgiftyoueverre-
ceived?Why?Myfamilyhashad themost
positive impactonmy life and timewith
themismymost cherishedgift.Tohave
people inyourcorner supportingyouasyou
navigate through life’supsanddown is a
luxury.Myson,Keldon,haspushedmeto-
wardsabetter life.My love,Roy,has shown
me immeasurablepatience.Mymother-in-
law,Sue,hasbeenmybiggest cheerleader. I
wouldbe lostwithout thesegifts inmy life!

checkingboxeswhen thingsarecomplete,
coming to termswithamorefluidmea-
surementof completionhasbeenachal-
lenge forme.That said, thedynamicworld
wework in is exactlywhatmakes thiswork
exciting formeandevenmore fulfilling
whenweareable tohelp families andorga-
nizationsmeet their goals andcansee that
result over time.

Whatwasthe lastshowyoubinge-
watched?Lessof abinge,butmygirlfriend
and I are currently rewatching“Friends.”
It’s timeless.

What isyour favoritebook?The
HarryPotter series isby farmyfavorite
series.The lessons I learned fromtheseries
growingupandcontinue to learnonmyre-
readsarecountless.Notonlyhave I learned
a lotof important life lessons,but there
is alsomagic and fantastic storytelling!
C’mon,whodoesn’t likemagic?

What is themostrewarding/ impor-
tantaspectofyouroccupation?Helping
people. It is very fulfilling tobeable tohelp
others andperformaservice that canallow
themtoachieve their life goals. I’ve seen
the impactourworkcanhaveonpeopleup
closeandpersonal, and that feelingnever
getsold.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/
inspiration?Mymomanddadcollec-
tively. I grewupadmiringmanyathletes
but realized several years ago that themost
inspirational rolemodels Ihadwere right in
frontofme.Myparents taughtmecount-
less lessonsabouthardwork, sacrifice,
howto treatothers, commitment,what is
most important in this life, andsomuch
more.They’vehave set the standard forme
in somanyareasofmy life.Nowordscan
express thegratitudeowed to them.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou live
by?“It is our choices, that showwhatwe
trulyare, farmore thanourabilities,”Albus
Dumbledore.Weall come fromdifferent
backgrounds/experiences/circumstances,

but theone thingweall have incommon is
weget tochoosehowweact eachmoment
of everyday.

Whatadvicewouldyougive to
anyonewantingtostartanewbusiness
orexcel inabusinessorfield?Figure
out thewhy.Whyareyoudoing this. If you
haveapowerfulwhy thatwill continue to
motivateyouwhen thingsget tough (and
theywill).Theanswer to thewhyquestion
ispersonal, but if youaredoing it for the
right reasonsandwithpassion, I believe
thatyouwill ultimatelyfindsuccess.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-
cess?Again, I believe this is apersonal
thing.Failures are learningopportunities,
andsuccess evolves.Decide thepersonyou
want tobeand take time to reflectdailyon
the stepsyou’vemade towardsbecoming
thatperson.Everyday is a challenge,but if
you’re constantlyprogressing towards the
personyouwant tobecome, I think that’s a
successfulday.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/
hobby?Anyactivity that includes friends

and family. I believe life is bestwhen it’s
shared.Whether I amskiingor justhaving
ameal athome, it’s betterwhen thosewe
lovearearound.Hostingdinners, listening
tomusic, sittingaroundacampfire,playing
boardgames, going forwalks, etc.Someof
the simple things in life aremyfavorite. I
also spenda lotofmy free timeflyfishing,
backpacking, skiing, snowshoeing, run-
ning, and just anything that allowsmeto
spend timeoutdoors in themountains.Fit-
ness andhealtharevery important aspects
ofmy life andmostofmyhobbies allowfor
physical exercisewhile alsoenablingmeto
engage in something incredibly funandbe
outsidemostof the time

What’s thegreatestgiftyouever
received?Why?Life.Life is short andwe
haveno ideawhenour timemight come.
Thescarcityof life allows forus to leada
meaningful life and thus, thechoiceswe
make thatmuchmore important.Thegift
of lifedaily is abeautiful thing.

Lovell
From page 18

O’Donnell
From page 20

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/in-
spiration?Mygrandfather. I grewup
ona family farmbetweenColumbusand
ParkCityandmygrandfather is oneof the
hardestworking individuals that Ihave
evermet.He taughtmethat it isnot always
about thedollarbutmakingan impactwith
thepeople aroundyou.Beingpresenton the
family farmstill, I seeall aroundmewhat
hishardworkhasprovided forhis family
which inspiresme tocontinue toworkhard
andbepresentwithmyfamily.He isold

school and I love thatwayof life.Hestill
cherishes themeaningof ahandshake, the
enjoymentof acoldbeer after a longday
on the farmand themeaningof family. I
will forever cherish the lessons thathehas
taughtme.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby?
“Don’t let life’s curveballs knockyouoffof
your feet.”

What advicewould you give to
anyonewanting to start a newbusi-
ness or excel in a business or field? I
have never started a new business but to
excel in a field, my advice would be:Make
connections.Work hard. Smile.Making
connections with others around you can

open up somany opportunities thatmay
have not come about if those connections
were not there.Work hard- people notice
when youwork hard and aremotivated.
Smile, use some humor, which canmake
forming those connections somuch
easier.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/hob-
by?Failures area stepping stone toyour
success.Someof those stepping stonesmay
beamosscovered rock inacreekbottom
andsuper slipperybutwill eventually lead
toyour success if youkeepgoing.Suc-
cess ismeasureddifferentlydependingon
who is evaluating them.Theseareboth
inevitable in lifebutdonotdefineyour true

self-worth.
What do you do for fun/relax/hob-

by?Our family is very active so anything
outdoors. One of our favorite things
to do as a family is to drive around the
farm and see all the baby calves running
around. Hearing a child’s laugh as they
watch baby calves run around is one of
life’s greatest gifts.

What’s thegreatestgiftyouever
received?Why?Myparentsworkedvery
hard togivemybrothers and I the life that
wehave. Iwouldnotbewhere I amtoday
without themand for that, I thank them.
Theyhavebeenmybiggest supporters
throughall aspectsof life.

Popp
From page 20
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Doyouhaveamottothatyou liveby? I
think I amnotalonewhen I say“changecanbe
hard.”But I liveby themotto“theonly thing
constant in life is change,” to remember tonot
fight it or feelweigheddownby it.

Whatadvicewouldyougive toanyone
wantingtostartanewbusinessorexcel ina
businessorfield?Try it. Itmightwork.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuccess?
Failurescanbemorevaluableonyourroadto
successthanthewinsbecausethere’smuchmore
learningandgrowingthatcomeswithafailure
thanthereiswheneverythinggoesasplanned.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/hobby?
I relaxby taking reformerPilates classes at
Bethany JoyPilates studio.For fun I canbe
foundhangingwith friendsorat thezooora
parkwithmyhusbandanddaughter.Wealso
havea sweetdogwe love to take forwalkson
themanyBillings trails.

What’s thegreatestgiftyoueverre-
ceived?Why? I didn’t know it at the time
but thechance to liveall over thecountry.My
husband’s formercareermovedusall over in
a shortperiodof timeandat the time Iwas
burdenedby themovement.But,nowI really
appreciate theplaceswegot to liveand the self-
relianceandresilience it taughtme. It alsoal-
lowedmeseemorebeyond the“world I knew”
andopenedmymind tomore.

Richardson
From page 22

I amtodaywithouthis constant support
andencouragement.Hepushesmeand
uspersonally todobetter andbebetter
everyday.

Doyouhaveamotto thatyou
liveby?Not really butmaybe I should.
Lately,meandmyhusbandhavebeen
jokingly saying“someday, thiswill all
payoff”whenweare in the trenches.
Sometimes it helps.

Whatadvicewouldyougive to
anyonewantingtostartanewbusi-
nessorexcel inabusinessorfield?
Just go for it. I think toomanypeople
overthink thingsandnever act.Yes, you
musthavea solidplan inplaceandknow
yourbusinessbutbeingable toadapt and
theability to takeactiongoesa longway.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-
cess?Youcannever fail if youneverquit.
We learn themost inour failures.And I
reallybelieve success looksdifferent for
everyoneand therearea lotofways to
achieveyourdefinitionof success.Some

peopleprioritizemoney, sometime, some
freedom,etc. Justdefinewhat it looks like
foryou,writedownyourgoals andwork
towardsyourowndefinitionof success.

Whatdoyoudoforfun/relax/hob-
by?Wespendthesummerweekendsat
CanyonFerryboatingandcamping.Wake
surfing.Traveling.Hiking.Spendingtime
withfriendsandfamily.Reading.

What’s thegreatestgiftyouever
received?Why?Ofcourse,mydaughter
Dylan.Shehasbeen thebiggestblessing
andchangedmyperspectiveon life for
thebetter.

Shanks
From page 24

office theyhave something to look for-
ward too.

Whoisyourgreatestmentor/inspi-
ration? Ihave thepleasureonnothaving
justonepersonbutseveral.Myfather is
mymajorsupport system.Heprovides
comfortandcalmnesswhenIneed it.
He ismyvoiceof reason.MyMother is
thestrongestwomenIknow.Shehas
shownmehowtobeastrongand inde-
pendent leader.Myhusband ismybiggest
cheerleader.Hestandsbesidemewhile I
continuepushforward inall ofmy ideas
andgoals.Heprovidesmetheconfidence

that Ineed inorder topushthroughthe
self-doubt.Lastly,mythreekiddoshave
shownmewhatunconditional love is.

Doyouhaveamottothatyou live
by? It soundscliché,but treatothers the
wayyouwouldwant tobe treated. I am
afirmbeliever in this. Iwill giveyou the
samerespect that isbeinggiven tome.

Whatadvicewouldyougive to
anyonewantingtostartanewbusi-
nessorexcel inabusinessorfield?
Askasmanyquestionsasyoucan.Findas
manyresourcesyoucanpull information
fromandthenkeep theminyourpocket
sowhennewthingscomeupyoucan
bounce thingsoffof them.Knowthat just
because it’shardor scary todosomething
newthat ispartof theprocess for success.

Howdoyouviewfailureandsuc-
cess?Success is knowing thatyouhave
failed several different timesbutdidn’t
giveup togetwhatyouwantedandwhere
youare today.

Whatdoyoudofor fun/relax/hob-
by?Torelax I enjoy ridingmyPeloton.
Myhobbies are chasingmykidsaround
toall of their activities. I really enjoygo-
ing to rodeosandwatching friendsand
family compete.Myhusbandand I enjoy
traveling tonewplacesandsight-seeing.

What’s thegreatestgiftyouever
received?Why?Myfamily, kids, and
friends. I have themost amazingpeople
surroundingmeandgivingmethe sup-
port toaccomplishallmygoals.

Sherman
From page 25
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remain humble in difficult situations and
find comfort knowing that I am ‘good
enough’ to overcome and succeed.

What is the hardest part of your job?
I encounter a large variety of personalities.
With over 600 exhibitors and their fami-
lies present, one can imagine the number of
differing personalities over the course of the
10-day stock show. This does not include the
personalities throughout the remainder of
the year! Unfortunately, there will always be
upset exhibitors for one reason or another. In
the end, it is my job tomake sure that we can
come to a compromise to aid or fix the situa-
tion for all parties involved.

Whatwas the last showyou binge-
watched? “The Amazing Race.”

What is your favorite book?Honestly,
I am notmuch of a reader as it seemswe
always have toomuch going on. I findmyself
listening tomore podcasts, however growing
up I was a fan of the “Harry Potter” series.

What is themost rewarding/impor-
tant aspect of your occupation?All the
youth events bring some sort of nostalgic
reward. However, themost rewarding part
ofmy job is the NILEMerit Heifer Program.
As a past NILEMerit Heifer Recipientmyself
to now coordinating this program, it holds
a place very near and dear ofmy heart. Each

year watching the youth and their do-
nated heifers grow together through their
10-month long journey, working hand in
handwith ag professionals to setup infor-
mativemonthlymeetings for the youth,
to listening to thementorship the donors
provide their youth – it is all so important
to themission of the NILE – to preserve and
embrace the western lifestyle!

Who is your greatestmentor/inspi-
ration?Mymom. She has instilled inme
a strongwork ethic, dedication and com-
mitment to your profession and provides
amazing support both professionally and
in all aspects of life. I have been able to
“shadow” her from a very young age and at-
tributemuch ofmy success to learning from
her over the years. She continues to inspire
not onlyme, butmany others in her role as
an Agriculture Education teacher and FFA
Advisor – teaching and coaching today’s
youth about the importance of the agricul-
ture industry.

Doyou have amotto that you live by?
“Excellence is never an accident; it is a result
of high intention, sincere effort, intelligent
direction, skillful execution and the vision
to see obstacles as opportunities.” –Anony-
mous

What advicewould you give to anyone
wanting to start a newbusiness or excel
in a business or field?Dowhat research is
needed, when setting up the endeavor do not
cut corners – do it right the first time, sur-

round yourself with those that will support
you and don’t give up.

Howdo you view failure and success?
“Success is not final; failure is not fatal; it
is the courage to continue that counts.” –
Winston Churchill.Win, lose or draw, you
need to have the courage to complete the
task whether it is amajor flop or super suc-
cess. No hiding in a corner or placing blame
on others, have the courage to stand up and
own themistake. Celebrate all successes, big
or small, and learn from failures.

What do you do for fun/relax/hobby?
If I’m not ridingmy horse, spending time
out with the cows, playingwith our dogs, or
enjoying timewithmy husband and fam-
ily, you can probably findme chasing and
capturing amazing sunsets. Other favorite
activities include: fishing, mowing the lawn
and traveling the world!

What’s the greatest gift you ever re-
ceived?Why? I feel very blessed because I
have received two of the greatest gifts. The
first would bemy husband and high school
sweetheart, Ike, who providesmewith un-
limited support and in stressful times always
seems to find away to lighten themood. The
second gift would bemy littlest best friend
in the entire world, RoccaMae, an eight-
year-old Boston Terrier. This little dogwas
gifted tome bymy husband in a timewhen
I needed her themost. She has brought so
much love and joy intomy life over the years
– I am truly grateful for them both!

timewithmy family, help
support their needs, and
pursue other passions in
life.

What do you do for
fun/relax/hobby? If
I can rock climb one or
two times per week that
will get me throughmost
weeks. I also love listening
to audio books. I’ve done a
lot of running the last few
years which I enjoy, but I
really think I’ve done it just
so I can listen to another
chapter of a good book.

What’s the greatest
gift you ever received?
Why? Last yearmy
champion of a wife dealt
with debilitating back
problems andwas still able
to support all the burdens
of pregnancy and birth,
to give us our daughter.
Our now almost one year
old named Kit, is often the
only sane one in the house
and ismy favorite thing to
be around every day.

Ross
From page 23

Shaw
From page 25

most rewarding/important aspect ofmy
occupation is that I get to lead an amaz-
ing team andwork alongside and under
some fantastic leaders in this industry
to whom I have learned and continue to
learn somuch from.

Who is your greatestmentor/
inspiration?My family is absolutely
my greatest inspiration.My husband,
Emanuel, constantly supportsmy en-
deavors and encouragesme to do better/
be better than I was the day before. He
never letsme believe thatmy dreams are
too big.My daughter, Kambria, inspires
me to always have a “big heart” day in
and day out. It is from her that I have

learned you are truly never too young, or
too old, tomake a difference.My daugh-
ter, Avianne, has taughtme that waking
up in themorningwith “sassy pants”
on is not necessarily a bad thing, it is all
in how you channel the sass! She also
remindsme that I am capable of doing
“hard things”.

Mymom and dad have supportedme
for as long as I can remember, and in all
the educational and professional endeav-
ors I have chosen to pursue.Mymomhas
always inspiredme to seek outmy full
potential and to never stop until I reach
it, to never let anything holdme back and
to dowhatmakesme happy.My dad has
been a true inspiration of what it means
to fight against the odds and never give
up. He is one of the strongest people I
have evermet!My brother, Danny, is one

of themost driven people I know. He has
always inspiredme towork hard for what
I want and to never settle. My nephews,
Riley and Kobe, andmy niece, Kenna,
have all inspiredme in different ways.
They have always encouragedme, sup-
portedme, and have always shown up for
me. This amazing family ofmine is and
has always beenmy inspiration. They are
the reasonwhy I strive to be the best ver-
sion ofmyself every single day.

Doyou have amotto that you live
by? Just when you think you know all the
answers, someone changes the question.
My dad has been saying this tome since I
was little and is why I can never seem to
find contentment in the knowledge I have
in themoment. I pushmyself to never
stop learning.

What advicewould you give to

anyonewanting to start a newbusi-
ness or excel in a business or field?
Be persistent. Be flexible and resilient.
Expect change. Don’t be afraid to fail.
Turn failures into opportunities. Never
stop learning.

Howdo you view failure and suc-
cess? Failure can be a great teacher and
is often a precursor to success.

What do you do for fun/relax/hob-
by? I love to spend timewithmy family
whether we are having amovie night,
cooking together, or planning our next
adventure!

What’s the greatest gift you ever
received?Why?The gift of family and
friends. They aremy people andmy
reasons for all that I do. I cherish every
single one of them and could not imagine
life without them.

Thompson
From page 27

Howdo you view failure and suc-
cess? Failuremeans lessons learned

so analyze it as you can’t learn from a
mistake without figuring out what went
wrong. Then apply those lessons learned
andmove forward. You can’t reach suc-
cess without failure. Success is the ulti-
mate reward that helpsmotivate you.

What do you do for fun/relax/
hobby? I love the outdoors. Mountains
are my happy place. Nomatter the
season I enjoy hiking fishing hunting
skiing basically any activity that gets
me outdoors.

What’s the greatest gift you ever
received?Why?A crocheted blanket
from a patient. The detail was incredible
so the fact that she put thatmuch time
into something formewas very heart-
warming.

Tangedahl
From page 26
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